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February 9, 2023  
 
 
 
Recommendation for Award of IFB 9000 JRH1056, Forensics and Law Enforcement Supplies   
 
 
Purchasing staff has completed their evaluation and has recommended award to Sirchie 
Acquisition Company, LLC. 
 
 
 
John Hilbun  
Contract Mgmt Specialist IV  
(512) 974-1054 
john.hilbun@austintexas.gov  
City of Austin 
Purchasing Office  
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SOLICITATION #
PROCUREMENT 
SPECIALIST

Vendor

Local Presence 
(Y/N)
MBE/WBE

ITEM NO.

ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL UNITS 

(INDIVIDUAL 
UNIT 

QUANTITY)

UNIT PRICE 
(PRICE PER 

INDIVIDUAL 
UNIT)

*Unit price should be no 
more than 4 decimal 

places 

EXTENDED 
PRICE 

(ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL UNITS 
X UNIT PRICE)

UNIT PRICE 
(PRICE PER 

INDIVIDUAL 
UNIT)

*Unit price should be no 
more than 4 decimal 

places 

EXTENDED 
PRICE 

(ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL UNITS 
X UNIT PRICE)

1.1 600 1.5000 $900.00 1.6600 $996.00

1.2 200 14.0300 $2,806.00 14.0000 $2,800.00

1.3 225 28.7500 $6,468.75 28.0000 $6,300.00

1.4 300 2.2500 $675.00 2.9500 $885.00

CATEGORY 1 - FORENSICS/CHEMISTRY FINGERPRINT SUPPLIES - EQUIVALENTS ALLOWED

Bid Tabulation
City of Austin

FORENSICS AND LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLIES

IFB 9000 JRH1056

John Hilbun

Special Instructions:  Offerors must use this Pricing Submittal Sheet to submit pricing. 
Be advised that altering the Pricing Submittal Sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer. 

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are 
provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the 
City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid. Prices being submitted 
shall include ALL discounts, cost, handling and shipping charges (FOB Destination). 

Prices offered on the Pricing Submittal Sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and 
shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and 
equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination 
deemed most advantageous to the City.   The Annual Estimated Units column is the number of individual units the City estimates it will order per year.   * The Current Packaging and Current/Preferred 
Packaging column is for informational purposes only, showing how the City prefers each line item to be packaged.  For example, on line item 1.1, the City expects to order 600 individual units, in 
packages of 12 units.  For line item 1.3, the City expects to order 225 individual units, packaged per each.  Offeror shall bid on quantities in the Estimated Annual Units column. The City recommends 
package sizes that are similar to current/preferred package sizes.

N N

Sirchie Acquisition Company, 
LLC

Latent Patrol Kits. (Brush, powder, and lifting tape). - (individual unit is 1 kit)
Part No.: Sirchie MFC100 or Buyer approved equal. 

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Syringe Transport Tube. Transparent Plastic. Inside dimensions: 
approximately 8 inches. Label for identification, shatter and puncture 
resistant. Positive seal. Biohazard symbol. - (individual unit is 1 tube)
Part No.: Sirchie ECT2 or Buyer approved equal.

Barrier Tape: "POLICE LINE DO NOT CROSS". Black letters on Yellow 
background. 3 inches X 1000 feet roll. - (individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No.: Sirchie BT200, or approved equal.

Evident, Inc.

Buccal Swab collection kit  - (individual unit is 1 kit)
Part No: Sirchie BSK100 or Buyer approved equal.
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1.5 200 2.9900 $598.00 4.0000 $800.00

1.6 12 23.0000 $276.00 12.0000 $144.00

1.7 2 68.9500 $137.90 200.0000 $400.00

1.8 2 12.8500 $25.70 40.0000 $80.00

1.9 100 2.9500 $295.00 no bid no bid 

1.10 100 3.1000 $310.00 5.0000 $500.00

1.11 500 4.2500 $2,125.00 6.0000 $3,000.00

1.12 400 7.8500 $3,140.00 8.5000 $3,400.00

1.13 50 14.0000 $700.00 no bid no bid 

1.14 50 6.0000 $300.00 8.0000 $400.00

1.15 50 6.8500 $342.50 10.0000 $500.00

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Transparent, 1" width, in individual container. - 
(individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No.: Sirchie 144.5L or Buyer approved equal.

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Transparent, 1 1/2" width, in individual container. - 
(individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No.: Sirchie 144L or Buyer approved equal.

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Transparent, 2" width, in individual container. - 
(individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No.: Sirchie 144L2 or Buyer approved equal.

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Transparent, 3" width, in individual container. - 
(individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No.: Sirchie 144.L3 or Buyer approved equal.

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Gel-style, Transparent, 1.5” width, in individual 
container. - (individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No: Sirchie 144LRJ or Buyer approved equal.

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Polyethylene, 1.5” width, in individual container. - 
(individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No: Sirchie 169PPA or Buyer approved equal.

Fingerprint Brush, Fiberglass, 6" length - (individual unit is 1 brush) 
Part No.: Sirchie 122L or Buyer approved equal.

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Polyethylene, 2” width, in individual container. - 
(individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No: Sirchie 269PPB or Buyer approved equal.

Fingerprint Brush, Magnetic Powder Applicator, Wand. - (individual unit is 1 
applicator)
Part No.: Sirchie 125MD or Buyer approved equal.

Latent Fingerprint Powder, Black, conventional, 128 ounce jar. - (individual 
unit is 1 jar)
Sirchie Part No.: SKU: BPP09128  or Buyer approved equal.

Magnetic Fingerprint Powder, 16 ounce container. - (individual unit is 1 
container)
Part No.: Sirchie BPM114L or Buyer approved equal.
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1.16 144 0.3500 $50.40 0.6700 $96.48

1.17 1

1.18 200 9.9500 $1,990.00 12.5000 $2,500.00

1.19 50 10.1500 $507.50 14.2500 $712.50

1.20 1,000 0.0900 $90.00 0.3000 $300.00

1.21 1,000 0.2500 $250.00 0.3900 $390.00

1.22 2 23.0000 $46.00 29.0000 $58.00

1.23 200 4.2500 $850.00 9.0000 $1,800.00

1.24 50 0.3400 $17.00 0.8250 $41.25

1.25 40 0.8000 $32.00 1.2000 $48.00

1.26 40 6.0000 $240.00 no bid no bid 

Hinge Lifter, Transparent with White Background, 4" x 4" - (individual unit is 1 
lifter)
Part No.: Sirchie SKU: 131LW4 or Buyer approved equal.

Cyanoacrylate liquid glue for latent print development, 16 ounce container, 
with applicator bottles. - (individual unit is 1 container)
Part No.: Sirchie CNA103 or Buyer approved equal.

Tweezers, Sterile, Disposable, 4 inch. - (individual unit is 1 tweezers) 
Part No.: Sirchie KCP139 or Buyer approved equal.

Scalpels, Sterile, Disposable, Rounded blade, 6 inch, Individually wrapped. - 
(individual unit is 1 scalpel)
Part No.: Sirchie KCP13810 or Buyer approved equal.

Antimicrobial Hand Wipes (PAWS). 100 per box. - (individual unit is 1 box)
Part No.: Sirchie AMW100 or Buyer approved equal.

Glassine Envelope, transparent, breathable. 3" x 4 1/2". - (individual unit is 1 
envelope)
Part No.: Sirchie GEE34 or Buyer approved equal.

The City has elected to not award this line.

Evidence Tape, frangible, Red, 1.5" X 108' roll, with "EVIDENCE" printing - 
(individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No.: Sirchie SM10002 or Buyer approved equal.

Evidence Box Tape, white, 3" X 165' roll, with "EVIDENCE" printing - 
(individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No.: Sirchie 704E or Buyer approved equal.

Glassine Envelope, transparent, breathable. 5 1/2" x 5 1/2". - (individual unit 
is 1 envelope)
Part No.: Sirchie GEE55 or Buyer approved equal.

Mikrosil Casting Material, 7 ounce tube, white - (individual unit is 1 tube)
Part No.: Sirchie MCM100W or Buyer approved equal.

Gunshot Residue Kit, 2 Stub, for SEM analysis. - (individual unit is 1 kit)
Part No.: Sirchie #GRA300 or Buyer approved equal.
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1.27 50 4.8500 $242.50 9.2500 $462.50

1.28 20 2.9500 $59.00 11.7500 $235.00

1.29 30 3.0000 $90.00 4.0000 $120.00

1.30 100 1.0000 $100.00 0.9250 $92.50

1.31 100 0.4000 $40.00 0.9250 $92.50

1.32 100 0.8000 $80.00 0.9250 $92.50

1.33 1,000 0.8000 $800.00 no bid no bid 

1.34 1,000 0.8000 $800.00 no bid no bid 

1.35 1,000 0.8000 $800.00 no bid no bid 

1.36 500 0.3000 $150.00 0.1150 $57.50

1.37 500 0.1000 $50.00 0.1150 $57.50

Forensic ruler, vinyl, ABFO style, inch format, NIST Traceable. - (individual unit 
is 1 ruler)
Part No: Sirchie PPS801. or Buyer approved equal.

Photograph evidence scale, 2” card stock, black background with white 
lettering, NIST verified, individually cut - (individual unit is 1 scale)
Part No: Sirchie EPS20B or Buyer approved equal.

Photograph evidence scale, 2” card stock, white background with black 
lettering, NIST verified, individually cut - (individual unit is 1 scale)
Part No: Sirchie EPS20W or Buyer approved equal

Photograph evidence scale, 2” card stock, gray background with black 
lettering, NIST verified, individually cut - (individual unit is 1 scale)
Part No: SirchieEPS20G or Buyer approved equal.

Photograph evidence scale, 2" adhesive, black background with white 
lettering, roll or individually cut, NIST verified. - (individual unit is 1 scale)
Part No: Sirchie PPS500 or Buyer approved equal.

Photograph Evidence Scale, 2" adhesive, white background with black 
lettering, roll or individually cut, NIST verified. - (individual unit is 1 scale)
Part No: Sirchie PPS502 or Buyer approved equal.

Photograph evidence scale, 6" vinyl, black with white lettering, NIST 
traceable. - (individual unit is 1 scale) 
Part No.: Sirchie PPS403 or Buyer approved equal.

Photograph evidence scale, 6" vinyl, white with black lettering, NIST 
traceable. - (individual unit is 1 scale) 
Part No: Sirchie PPS400. or Buyer approved equal.

Photograph evidence scale, 6" vinyl, gray with black lettering, NIST traceable. - 
(individual unit is 1 scale)
Part No: Sirchie PPS401 or Buyer approved equal.

Hazard labels, writable, 1" X 4", red-orange tape, 250 labels per roll. - 
(individual unit is 1 roll)
Part No.: Sirchie EIL09R or Buyer approved equal.

Forensic ruler, FBI Bureau Scale style, 300 x 150 mm, black/white reversible. 
NIST Traceable. - (individual unit is 1 ruler)
Part No: Sirchie PPS600. or Buyer approved equal.
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1.38 500 0.0800 $40.00 0.1150 $57.50

1.39 20 9.7500 $195.00 14.5000 $290.00

1.40 20 7.0000 $140.00 8.5000 $170.00

1.41 20 7.0000 $140.00 8.5000 $170.00

1.42 6 25.0000 $150.00 36.0000 $216.00

1.43 1 20.0000 $20.00 no bid no bid 

1.44 1 20.0000 $20.00 no bid no bid 

1.45 2 18.9500 $37.90 35.0000 $70.00

1.46 2 18.9500 $37.90 35.0000 $70.00

1.47 10 7.0000 $70.00 11.5000 $115.00

1.48 10 5.0000 $50.00 no bid no bid 

Dental Stone impression kit, buff color, with water, individually packaged - 
(individual unit is 1 kit)
Part No: Sirchie SNC42D8 or Buyer approved equal.

Gelatin Lifter, 7'' x 14'', black, for footwear - (individual unit is 1 lifter)
Part No: Sirchie GLT401B or Buyer approved equal.

Small Particle Reagent (SPR) for latent fingerprint development, black, 
premixed kit - (individual unit is 1 kit)
Part No: Sirchie SPR100 or Buyer approved equal.

Small Particle Reagent (SPR) for latent fingerprint development, white, 
premixed kit - (individual unit is 1 kit) 
Part No: SirchieSPR200 or Buyer approved equal.

Adhesive (sticky side) latent print development reagent, black (dark), 
premixed, 7 ounce. - (individual unit is 1 bottle)
Part No: Sirchie ASD7D or Buyer approved equal.

Leuco Crystal Violet (LCV) for blood enhancement, premixed kit - (individual 
unit is 1 kit)
Part No: Sirchie LV509 or Buyer approved equal.

Photograph Evidence Scale, 2" adhesive, gray background with black 
lettering, roll or individually cut, NIST verified. - (individual unit is 1 scale)
Part No.: Sirchie PPS501 or Buyer approved equal.

Adhesive (sticky side) latent print development reagent, white (light), 
premixed. 7 ounce. - (individual unit is 1 bottle)
Part No: Sirchie ASD7L or Buyer approved equal.

Arson evidence collection can, polymer lining, 1 gallon capacity. - (individual 
unit is 1 can)
Part No: Sirchie AECGALL or Buyer approved equal.

Arson evidence collection can, polymer lining, 1 pint capacity - (individual unit 
is 1 can)
Part No: Sirchie AECPTL or Buyer approved equal.

Gelatin Lifter, 7'' x 14'', white, for footwear - (individual unit is 1 lifter)
Part No: Sirchie GLT401W or Buyer approved equal.
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1.49 10 5.9500 $59.50 6.8000 $68.00

1.50 2 25.0000 $50.00 34.0000 $68.00

1.51 2 25.0000 $50.00 34.0000 $68.00

1.52 2 25.0000 $50.00 34.0000 $68.00

1.53 40 1.0000 $40.00 0.8000 $32.00

1.54 40 1.0000 $40.00 1.1000 $44.00

1.55 30 3.1800 $95.40 no bid no bid

1.56 500 1.0000 $500.00 no bid no bid 

1.57 500 1.1500 $575.00 no bid no bid 

1.58 24 12.5000 $300.00 13.7500 $330.00

1.59 1,000 0.1100 $110.00 0.0950 $95.00
Plastic zipper bag, with white writing block, 4" x 6" - (individual unit is 1 bag)
Part No.: Sirchie ZWB01 or Buyer approved equal.

Arson evidence collection can, polymer lining, 1 quart capacity - (individual 
unit is 1 can)
Part No: Sirchie AECQTL or Buyer approved equal.

Polyvinylsiloxane (Accutrans) forensic casting material, white cartridge. 75ml 
cartridge. - (individual unit is 1 cartridge)
Part No: Sirchie PVSS200WH or Buyer approved equal.

Polyvinylsiloxane (Accutrans) forensic casting material, clear/transparent 
cartridge.  75ml cartridge. - (individual unit is 1 cartridge)
Part No: Sirchie PVSS200TR or Buyer approved equal.

Polyvinylsiloxane (Accutrans) forensic casting material, brown cartridge.   
75ml cartridge. - (individual unit is 1 cartridge)
Part No: Sirchie PVSS200BN or Buyer approved equal.

Polyvinylsiloxane (Accutrans) forensic casting material, mixing nozzle for 
cartridges - (individual unit is 1 nozzle)
Part No: Sirchie PVS200N or Buyer approved equal.

Polyvinylsiloxane (Accutrans) forensic casting material, spreading tip - 
(individual unit is 1 tip)
Part No: Sirchie PVS200NT or Buyer approved equal.

Fingernail evidence collection kit (Scrapings, Swabbing, & Clippings). - 
(individual unit is 1 kit)
Part No: Sirchie FSSC100 or Buyer approved equal.

Kraft Evidence Bag, 2 ply, 70#, gusseted, 11”w x 7”d x 48”h, hemmed - 
(individual unit is 1 bag)
Part No: Sirchie EB006 or Buyer approved equal.

Kraft Evidence Bag, 2 ply, 70#, gusseted, 16" w x 12"d x 35"h - (individual unit 
is 1 bag)
Part No: Sirchie EB004 or Buyer approved equal.

BLUESTAR Forensic, blood search chemiluminescent reagent, tablets. - 
(individual unit is 1 application, which is 1 pair of tablets)
Part No.: Sirchie FRA00004 or Buyer approved equal.
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1.60 1,000 0.2000 $200.00 0.2175 $217.50

1.61 1,000 0.4500 $450.00 0.3825 $382.50

$29,804.95 $29,892.73 

ITEM NO.

ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL UNITS 

(INDIVIDUAL 
UNIT 

QUANTITY)

UNIT PRICE 
(PRICE PER 

INDIVIDUAL 
UNIT)

*Unit price should be no 
more than 4 decimal 

places 

EXTENDED 
PRICE 

(ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL UNITS 
X UNIT PRICE)

UNIT PRICE 
(PRICE PER 

INDIVIDUAL 
UNIT)

*Unit price should be no 
more than 4 decimal 

places 

EXTENDED 
PRICE 

(ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL UNITS 
X UNIT PRICE)

2.1 2 29.0000 $58.00 29.0000 $58.00

ITEM NO
MINIMUM 

DISCOUNT FROM 
PRICE LIST

3.1 10% Discount

Award Method By one total

Notates Award 

Prepared By Julia Ramirez

Approved By John Hilbun

DELIVERY METHOD :             X  COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS)               VENDOR DELIVERY             1 - 2 weeks ARO

Sirchie - Products Guide, Volume 1

Plastic zipper bag, with white writing block, 9" x 12" - (individual unit is 1 bag)
Part No.: Sirchie ZWB02 or Buyer approved equal.

CATEGORY 2 - FORENSICS/CHEMISTRY FINGERPRINT SUPPLIES - NO EQUIVALENTS ALLOWED

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Plastic zipper bag, with white writing block, 12" x 15" - (individual unit is 1 
bag)
Part No.: Sirchie ZWB03 or Buyer approved equal.

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST

Mikrosil Casting Material, 7 ounce tube, brown - (individual unit is 1 tube)
Part No.: Sirchie MCM100B

LATEST EFFECTIVE DATE OF 
PRICE LIST

2023

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = 

CATEGORY 3 - DISCOUNT OFF TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS (For Informational Purposes Only)

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract. In order to be paid for those additional products, provide manufacturers name and catalog numbers for the 
additional products you can provide the City. Indicate the minimum percentage discount you can provide the City for these products. The percentage discount(s) listed shall be fixed throughout the 
term of the Contract including any subsequent renewal periods. 

This information will not be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and there is no guarantee of purchase. Please include additional pages as necessary.
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City of Austin Purchasing Office – Log of Offers Received 

Solicitation Number: 

   Vendor Name Date Received   Type of Response   No Bid 
(eResponse / Physical) 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

6. 

7. 

8. 

X

Revised 07/2020 

IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on 
the following bid sheets are for information only 
and does not constitute actual award/execution 
of a contract. 

RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall 
remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of 
offers is for information purposes only and does not 
constitute actual award/execution of a contract. 

For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by: 
Phone – 512-974-2500 
Email – PurchInfo@austintexas.gov 
Physical Address – 124 W. 8th St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701 
Hours of Operation – Monday-Friday 7:45 a.m. to 4:45 p.m. 

This certifies the response was received prior to the solicitation closing. 

X

mailto:PurchInfo@austintexas.gov
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SOLICITATION #

PROCUREMENT 

SPECIALIST

ITEM NO.

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

UNITS 

(INDIVIDUAL 

UNIT 

QUANTITY)

UNIT PRICE (PRICE PER 

INDIVIDUAL UNIT)
*Unit price should be no more than 

4 decimal places 

EXTENDED PRICE 

(ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

UNITS X UNIT PRICE)

CURRENT/ 

PREFERRED 

PACKAGING

PROPOSED 

PACKAGING*

*see note in special 

instructions above

1.1 600 1.6600 $996.00 package of 12

1.2 200 14.0000 $2,800.00 each roll

1.3 225 28.0000 $6,300.00 each kit

1.4 300 2.9500 $885.00 each kit

1.5 200 4.0000 $800.00 each brush

1.6 12 12.0000 $144.00 each applicator

Solicitation

PRICING SHEET
FORENSICS AND LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLIES

John Hilbun

IFB 8700 JRH1056

Latent Patrol Kits. (Brush, powder, and lifting tape). - (individual unit is 1 kit)

Part No.: Sirchie MFC100 or Buyer approved equal. 

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Special Instructions:  Offerors must use this Pricing Submittal Sheet to submit pricing. 

Be advised that altering the Pricing Submittal Sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer. 

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide 

based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror 

does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid. Prices being submitted shall include ALL discounts, cost, handling and 

shipping charges (FOB Destination). 

Prices offered on the Pricing Submittal Sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or 

transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services 

required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most 

advantageous to the City.   The Annual Estimated Units column is the number of individual units the City estimates it will order per year.                                                                                                                                                                

* The Current Packaging and Current/Preferred Packaging column is for informational purposes only, showing how the City prefers each line item to be packaged.  For example, on line item 1.1, the City expects to order 600 

individual units, in packages of 12 units.  For line item 1.3, the City expects to order 225 individual units, packaged per each.  Offeror shall bid on quantities in the Estimated Annual Units column. The City recommends package 

sizes that are similar to current/preferred package sizes.

{{{Equivalents are allowed in Category 1.  If bidding an equivalent, Bidder shall provide the manufacturer name, model name, detail (if needed), and packaging for each item (if packaging is different from information in the 

Current/Preferred Packaging column).  The City will make the final determination that bid items are equivalents. *The Proposed Packaging column should be used ONLY if your company does not provide the item in exact 

packaging indicated in the Current/Preferred Packaging column.}}}

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Syringe Transport Tube. Transparent Plastic. Inside dimensions: 

approximately 8 inches. Label for identification, shatter and puncture 

resistant. Positive seal. Biohazard symbol. - (individual unit is 1 tube)

Part No.: Sirchie ECT2 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Barrier Tape: "POLICE LINE DO NOT CROSS". Black letters on Yellow 

background. 3 inches X 1000 feet roll. - (individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No.: Sirchie BT200, or approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

CATEGORY 1 - FORENSICS/CHEMISTRY FINGERPRINT SUPPLIES - EQUIVALENTS ALLOWED
These columns are for informational 

purposes only.

Buccal Swab collection kit  - (individual unit is 1 kit)

Part No: Sirchie BSK100 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Fingerprint Brush, Fiberglass, 6" length - (individual unit is 1 brush) 

Part No.: Sirchie 122L or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Fingerprint Brush, Magnetic Powder Applicator, Wand. - (individual unit is 1 

applicator)

Part No.: Sirchie 125MD or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   
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1.7 2 200.0000 $400.00 each jar

1.8 2 40.0000 $80.00 each container

1.9 100
each 1-inch wide 

roll

1.10 100 5.0000 $500.00
each 1.5-inch 

wide roll

1.11 500 6.0000 $3,000.00
each 2-inch wide 

roll

1.12 400 8.5000 $3,400.00
each 3-inch wide 

roll

1.13 50
each 1.5-inch 

wide roll

1.14 50 8.0000 $400.00
each 1.5-inch 

wide roll

1.15 50 10.0000 $500.00
each 2-inch wide 

roll

1.16 144 0.6700 $96.48 package of 12

1.17 1 50.2500 $50.25 each container

1.18 200 12.5000 $2,500.00 each roll

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Polyethylene, 2” width, in individual container. - 

(individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No: Sirchie 269PPB or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Hinge Lifter, Transparent with White Background, 4" x 4" - (individual unit is 

1 lifter)

Part No.: Sirchie SKU: 131LW4 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Cyanoacrylate liquid glue for latent print development, 16 ounce container, 

with applicator bottles. - (individual unit is 1 container)

Part No.: Sirchie CNA103 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Transparent, 3" width, in individual container. - 

(individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No.: Sirchie 144.L3 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Gel-style, Transparent, 1.5” width, in individual 

container. - (individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No: Sirchie 144LRJ or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Polyethylene, 1.5” width, in individual container. - 

(individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No: Sirchie 169PPA or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Evidence Tape, frangible, Red, 1.5" X 108' roll, with "EVIDENCE" printing - 

(individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No.: Sirchie SM10002 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Latent Fingerprint Powder, Black, conventional, 128 ounce jar. - (individual 

unit is 1 jar)

Sirchie Part No.: SKU: BPP09128  or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   
Magnetic Fingerprint Powder, 16 ounce container. - (individual unit is 1 

container)

Part No.: Sirchie BPM114L or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Transparent, 1" width, in individual container. - 

(individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No.: Sirchie 144.5L or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Transparent, 1 1/2" width, in individual container. - 

(individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No.: Sirchie 144L or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Latent Print Lifting Tape, Transparent, 2" width, in individual container. - 

(individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No.: Sirchie 144L2 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   
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1.19 50 14.2500 $712.50 each roll

1.20 1,000 0.3000 $300.00 packs of 100

1.21 1,000 0.3900 $390.00 packs of 100

1.22 2 29.0000 $58.00 each 7oz tube

1.23 200 9.0000 $1,800.00 each kit

1.24 50 0.8250 $41.25 package of 12 PACKAGE OF 10

1.25 40 1.2000 $48.00 10 count box

1.26 40 100 count box

1.27 50 9.2500 $462.50 each roll

1.28 20 11.7500 $235.00 each ruler

1.29 30 4.0000 $120.00 each ruler

1.30 100 0.9250 $92.50 pack of 10

Glassine Envelope, transparent, breathable. 5 1/2" x 5 1/2". - (individual unit 

is 1 envelope)

Part No.: Sirchie GEE55 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Mikrosil Casting Material, 7 ounce tube, white - (individual unit is 1 tube)

Part No.: Sirchie MCM100W or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Gunshot Residue Kit, 2 Stub, for SEM analysis. - (individual unit is 1 kit)

Part No.: Sirchie #GRA300 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Forensic ruler, vinyl, ABFO style, inch format, NIST Traceable. - (individual 

unit is 1 ruler)

Part No: Sirchie PPS801. or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Glassine Envelope, transparent, breathable. 3" x 4 1/2". - (individual unit is 1 

envelope)

Part No.: Sirchie GEE34 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Evidence Box Tape, white, 3" X 165' roll, with "EVIDENCE" printing - 

(individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No.: Sirchie 704E or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Photograph evidence scale, 6" vinyl, black with white lettering, NIST 

traceable. - (individual unit is 1 scale) 

Part No.: Sirchie PPS403 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Tweezers, Sterile, Disposable, 4 inch. - (individual unit is 1 tweezers) 

Part No.: Sirchie KCP139 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Scalpels, Sterile, Disposable, Rounded blade, 6 inch, Individually wrapped. - 

(individual unit is 1 scalpel)

Part No.: Sirchie KCP13810 or Buyer approved equal. 

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Antimicrobial Hand Wipes (PAWS). 100 per box. - (individual unit is 1 box)

Part No.: Sirchie AMW100 or Buyer approved equal. 

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Hazard labels, writable, 1" X 4", red-orange tape, 250 labels per roll. - 

(individual unit is 1 roll)

Part No.: Sirchie EIL09R or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Forensic ruler, FBI Bureau Scale style, 300 x 150 mm, black/white reversible. 

NIST Traceable. - (individual unit is 1 ruler)

Part No: Sirchie PPS600. or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   
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1.31 100 0.9250 $92.50 pack of 10

1.32 100 0.9250 $92.50 pack of 10

1.33 1,000 pack of 100

1.34 1,000 pack of 100

1.35 1,000 pack of 100

1.36 500 0.1150 $57.50
package or roll of 

50

1.37 500 0.1150 $57.50
package or roll of 

50

1.38 500 0.1150 $57.50
package or roll of 

50

1.39 20 14.5000 $290.00 each kit

1.40 20 8.5000 $170.00 package of 2

1.41 20 8.5000 $170.00 package of 2

1.42 6 36.0000 $216.00 each kit

Photograph evidence scale, 2” card stock, black background with white 

lettering, NIST verified, individually cut - (individual unit is 1 scale)

Part No: Sirchie EPS20B or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Photograph evidence scale, 2” card stock, white background with black 

lettering, NIST verified, individually cut - (individual unit is 1 scale)

Part No: Sirchie EPS20W or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Photograph evidence scale, 2” card stock, gray background with black 

lettering, NIST verified, individually cut - (individual unit is 1 scale)

Part No: SirchieEPS20G or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Photograph evidence scale, 2" adhesive, black background with white 

lettering, roll or individually cut, NIST verified. - (individual unit is 1 scale)

Part No: Sirchie PPS500 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Photograph Evidence Scale, 2" adhesive, white background with black 

lettering, roll or individually cut, NIST verified. - (individual unit is 1 scale)

Part No: Sirchie PPS502 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Photograph Evidence Scale, 2" adhesive, gray background with black 

lettering, roll or individually cut, NIST verified. - (individual unit is 1 scale)

Part No.: Sirchie PPS501 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Dental Stone impression kit, buff color, with water, individually packaged - 

(individual unit is 1 kit)

Part No: Sirchie SNC42D8 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Gelatin Lifter, 7'' x 14'', black, for footwear - (individual unit is 1 lifter)

Part No: Sirchie GLT401B or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Photograph evidence scale, 6" vinyl, white with black lettering, NIST 

traceable. - (individual unit is 1 scale) 

Part No: Sirchie PPS400. or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Photograph evidence scale, 6" vinyl, gray with black lettering, NIST traceable. - 

(individual unit is 1 scale)

Part No: Sirchie PPS401 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Gelatin Lifter, 7'' x 14'', white, for footwear - (individual unit is 1 lifter)

Part No: Sirchie GLT401W or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Leuco Crystal Violet (LCV) for blood enhancement, premixed kit - (individual 

unit is 1 kit)

Part No: Sirchie LV509 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   
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1.43 1 each kit

1.44 1 each kit

1.45 2 35.0000 $70.00 each bottle

1.46 2 35.0000 $70.00 each bottle

1.47 10 11.5000 $115.00 10 count case PACKAGE OF 2 CANS

1.48 10 10 count case

1.49 10 6.8000 $68.00 10 count case

1.50 2 34.0000 $68.00 each cartridge

1.51 2 34.0000 $68.00 each cartridge

1.52 2 34.0000 $68.00 each cartridge

1.53 40 0.8000 $32.00 pack of 40

1.54 40 1.1000 $44.00 pack of 40

Small Particle Reagent (SPR) for latent fingerprint development, black, 

premixed kit - (individual unit is 1 kit)

Part No: Sirchie SPR100 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Small Particle Reagent (SPR) for latent fingerprint development, white, 

premixed kit - (individual unit is 1 kit) 

Part No: SirchieSPR200 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Adhesive (sticky side) latent print development reagent, black (dark), 

premixed, 7 ounce. - (individual unit is 1 bottle)

Part No: Sirchie ASD7D or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Adhesive (sticky side) latent print development reagent, white (light), 

premixed. 7 ounce. - (individual unit is 1 bottle)

Part No: Sirchie ASD7L or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Arson evidence collection can, polymer lining, 1 gallon capacity. - (individual 

unit is 1 can)

Part No: Sirchie AECGALL or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Arson evidence collection can, polymer lining, 1 pint capacity - (individual 

unit is 1 can)

Part No: Sirchie AECPTL or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Arson evidence collection can, polymer lining, 1 quart capacity - (individual 

unit is 1 can)

Part No: Sirchie AECQTL or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Polyvinylsiloxane (Accutrans) forensic casting material, white cartridge. 75ml 

cartridge. - (individual unit is 1 cartridge)

Part No: Sirchie PVSS200WH or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Polyvinylsiloxane (Accutrans) forensic casting material, clear/transparent 

cartridge.  75ml cartridge. - (individual unit is 1 cartridge)

Part No: Sirchie PVSS200TR or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Polyvinylsiloxane (Accutrans) forensic casting material, brown cartridge.   

75ml cartridge. - (individual unit is 1 cartridge)

Part No: Sirchie PVSS200BN or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Polyvinylsiloxane (Accutrans) forensic casting material, mixing nozzle for 

cartridges - (individual unit is 1 nozzle)

Part No: Sirchie PVS200N or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Polyvinylsiloxane (Accutrans) forensic casting material, spreading tip - 

(individual unit is 1 tip)

Part No: Sirchie PVS200NT or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   
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1.55 30 each kit

1.56 500 bundle of 50 bags

1.57 500 bundle of 50 bags

1.58 24 13.7500 $330.00

package of 8 

applications (16 

tablets)

1.59 1,000 0.0950 $95.00 package of 100

1.60 1,000 0.2175 $217.50 package of 100

1.61 1,000 0.3825 $382.50 package of 100

$29,942.98 

ITEM NO.

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

UNITS 

(INDIVIDUAL 

UNIT 

QUANTITY)

UNIT PRICE (PRICE PER 

INDIVIDUAL UNIT)
*Unit price should be no more than 

4 decimal places 

EXTENDED PRICE 

(ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

UNITS X UNIT PRICE)

CURRENT/ 

PREFERRED 

PACKAGING

PROPOSED 

PACKAGING*

*see note in special 

instructions above

2.1 2 29.0000 $58.00 each 7oz tube

ITEM NO
LATEST EFFECTIVE 

DATE OF PRICE LIST

3.1 1/24/2023

Mikrosil Casting Material, 7 ounce tube, brown - (individual unit is 1 tube)

Part No.: Sirchie MCM100B or Buyer approved equal.

These columns are for informational 

purposes only.

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = 

Fingernail evidence collection kit (Scrapings, Swabbing, & Clippings). - 

(individual unit is 1 kit)

Part No: Sirchie FSSC100 or Buyer approved equal

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Kraft Evidence Bag, 2 ply, 70#, gusseted, 11”w x 7”d x 48”h, hemmed - 

(individual unit is 1 bag)

Part No: Sirchie EB006 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Kraft Evidence Bag, 2 ply, 70#, gusseted, 16" w x 12"d x 35"h - (individual unit 

is 1 bag)

Part No: Sirchie EB004 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

BLUESTAR Forensic, blood search chemiluminescent reagent, tablets. - 

(individual unit is 1 application, which is 1 pair of tablets)

Part No.: Sirchie FRA00004 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

All items not listed on this bid, excluding ForenScope and Air Science products.

Plastic zipper bag, with white writing block, 4" x 6" - (individual unit is 1 bag)

Part No.: Sirchie ZWB01 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

Plastic zipper bag, with white writing block, 9" x 12" - (individual unit is 1 bag)

Part No.: Sirchie ZWB02 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

CATEGORY 2 - FORENSICS/CHEMISTRY FINGERPRINT SUPPLIES - NO EQUIVALENTS ALLOWED

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Plastic zipper bag, with white writing block, 12" x 15" - (individual unit is 1 

bag)

Part No.: Sirchie ZWB03 or Buyer approved equal.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and Model

_______________________   

CATEGORY 3 - DISCOUNT OFF TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS (For Informational Purposes Only)

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract. In order to be paid for those additional products, provide manufacturers name and catalog numbers for the additional products you can 

provide the City. Indicate the minimum percentage discount you can provide the City for these products. The percentage discount(s) listed shall be fixed throughout the term of the Contract including any subsequent renewal 

periods. 

This information will not be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and there is no guarantee of purchase. Please include additional pages as necessary.

MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM PRICE LISTNAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST

2% Discount
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3.2

3.3

3.4

3.5

3.6

3.7

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

COMPANY NAME:

EMAIL ADDRESS:

Evident, Inc.

procure@shopevident.com

DELIVERY METHOD :               COMMON CARRIER (UPS)              

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

_______________% Discount                      

_______________% Discount                      

_______________% Discount                      

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

_______________% Discount                      

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

_______________% Discount                      

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

_______________% Discount                      
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