
City of Austin Purchasing Office – Log of Offers Received 

Solicitation Number: 

   Vendor Name Date Received   Type of Response   No Bid 
(eResponse / Physical) 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

6. 

7. 

8. 

X

Revised 07/2020 

IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on 
the following bid sheets are for information only 
and does not constitute actual award/execution 
of a contract. 

RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall 
remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of 
offers is for information purposes only and does not 
constitute actual award/execution of a contract. 

For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by: 
Phone – 512-974-2500 
Email – PurchInfo@austintexas.gov 
Physical Address – 124 W. 8th St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701 
Hours of Operation – Monday-Friday 7:45 a.m. to 4:45 p.m. 

This certifies the response was received prior to the solicitation closing. 
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SOLICITATION #

PROCUREMENT 

SPECIALIST

ITEM NO.
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

1.1 EA 50 $0.00 $0.00

1.2 EA 6 $0.00 $0.00

1.3 EA 6 $0.00 $0.00

1.4 EA 6 $0.00 $0.00

1.5 EA 6 $0.00 $0.00

1.6 EA 50 $0.00 $0.00

1.7 EA 6 $0.00 $0.00

1.8 EA 6 $0.00 $0.00

1.9 EA 12 $0.00 $0.00

1.10 EA 2 $0.00 $0.00

1.11 EA 2 $0.00 $0.00

1.12 EA 2 $0.00 $0.00

1.13 EA 2 $0.00 $0.00

1.14 EA 2 $246.75 $493.50

1.15 EA 2 $92.00 $184.00

1.16 EA 2 $201.00 $402.00

1.17 EA 2 $216.25 $432.50

1.18 EA 200 $369.25 $73,850.00

1.19 EA 10 $266.40 $2,664.00

$78,026.00 

Revolution® (selamectin) - (Blue) Cats 5.1 to 15 lb. - 6 pk - 10000321

Revolution® (selamectin) - (Taupe) Cats 15.1 to 22 lb. - 3 pk - 10004219

Cerenia® (maropitant citrate) - Tablets: 60 mg - 4 ct - 10001554

Cerenia® (maropitant citrate) - Tablets: 160 mg - 4 ct - 10001555

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = 

Convenia® (cefovecin sodium) - Injectable Solution, 80 mg/mL - 10 mL 10001498

Apoquel® (oclacitinib tablet) - Tablet 3.6mg - 250ct - 10022315

Apoquel® (oclacitinib tablet) - Tablet 5.4mg - 250ct - 10022316

Apoquel® (oclacitinib tablet) - Tablet 16mg - 250ct - 10022317

Cytopoint® - 1 vl - 10mg - 10016043

Cytopoint® - 1 vl - 20mg - 10016044

Cytopoint® - 1 vl - 30mg - 10016045

Cytopoint® - 1 vl - 40mg - 10016046

Diroban® (melarsomine dihydrochloride) - 1 vl - 10012868

Simbadol® (buprenorphine injection) - Injectable, 1.8 mg/mL - 10 mL - 10014402

Revolution® (selamectin) - (Plum) Dogs 85.1 to 130 lb. - 6 pk - 10004930

Revolution® (selamectin) - Mauve Puppies/Kittens up to 5 lb. - 3 pk - 10000320

Solicitation

PRICE SHEET
Zoetis Veterinary Pharmaceuticals

John Hilbun

IFB 9200 JRH1050

Cerenia® (maropitant citrate) - Tablets: 24 mg - 4 ct - 10001553

Special Instructions:  Offerors must use this Pricing Submittal Sheet to submit pricing. 

Be advised that altering the Pricing Submittal Sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer. 

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a 

guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the 

Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the Pricing Submittal Sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or 

transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the 

services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most 

advantageous to the City.

CATEGORY 1 - ZOETIS VETERINARY PHARMACEUTICALS

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Cerenia® (maropitant citrate) - injectable solution 20mL - 10002396

Cerenia® (maropitant citrate) - Tablets: 16 mg - 4 ct - 10001552
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ITEM NO
LATEST EFFECTIVE DATE 

OF PRICE LIST

2.1

2.2

DELIVERY METHOD :       X        COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS)               VENDOR DELIVERY

CATEGORY 2 - DISCOUNT OFF OR MARKUP TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS (For Informational Purposes Only)

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract. In order to be paid for those additional products, provide manufacturers name for the additional products you can provide the 

City. Indicate the minimum percentage discount or maximum markup to costs you can provide the City for these products. The percentage discount(s) or markup(s) listed shall be fixed throughout the term of the 

Contract including any subsequent renewal periods. 

This information will not be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and there is no guarantee of purchase. Please include additional pages as necessary.

MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR MAXIMUM 

MARKUP TO PRICE LIST
NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL DELIVERY THE ITEMS TO THE CITY:

_______________% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

_______________% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Name ____________________________________________________________________

1-2 Business Days
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SOLICITATION #

PROCUREMENT 

SPECIALIST

ITEM NO.
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

1.1 EA 50

1.2 EA 6

1.3 EA 6

1.4 EA 6

1.5 EA 6

1.6 EA 50

1.7 EA 6

1.8 EA 6

1.9 EA 12

1.10 EA 2

1.11 EA 2

1.12 EA 2

1.13 EA 2

1.14 EA 2

1.15 EA 2

1.16 EA 2

1.17 EA 2

1.18 EA 200

1.19 EA 10

Solicitation

PRICE SHEET
Zoetis Veterinary Pharmaceuticals

John Hilbun

IFB 9200 JRH1050

Cerenia® (maropitant citrate) - Tablets: 24 mg - 4 ct - 10001553

Special Instructions:  Offerors must use this Pricing Submittal Sheet to submit pricing. 

Be advised that altering the Pricing Submittal Sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer. 

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a 

guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the 

Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the Pricing Submittal Sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or 

transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the 

services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most 

advantageous to the City.

CATEGORY 1 - ZOETIS VETERINARY PHARMACEUTICALS

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Cerenia® (maropitant citrate) - injectable solution 20mL - 10002396

Cerenia® (maropitant citrate) - Tablets: 16 mg - 4 ct - 10001552

Cerenia® (maropitant citrate) - Tablets: 60 mg - 4 ct - 10001554

Cerenia® (maropitant citrate) - Tablets: 160 mg - 4 ct - 10001555

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = 

Convenia® (cefovecin sodium) - Injectable Solution, 80 mg/mL - 10 mL 10001498

Apoquel® (oclacitinib tablet) - Tablet 3.6mg - 250ct - 10022315

Apoquel® (oclacitinib tablet) - Tablet 5.4mg - 250ct - 10022316

Apoquel® (oclacitinib tablet) - Tablet 16mg - 250ct - 10022317

Cytopoint® - 1 vl - 10mg - 10016043

Cytopoint® - 1 vl - 20mg - 10016044

Cytopoint® - 1 vl - 30mg - 10016045

Cytopoint® - 1 vl - 40mg - 10016046

Diroban® (melarsomine dihydrochloride) - 1 vl - 10012868

Simbadol® (buprenorphine injection) - Injectable, 1.8 mg/mL - 10 mL - 10014402

Revolution® (selamectin) - (Plum) Dogs 85.1 to 130 lb. - 6 pk - 10004930

Revolution® (selamectin) - Mauve Puppies/Kittens up to 5 lb. - 3 pk - 10000320

Revolution® (selamectin) - (Blue) Cats 5.1 to 15 lb. - 6 pk - 10000321

Revolution® (selamectin) - (Taupe) Cats 15.1 to 22 lb. - 3 pk - 10004219
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ITEM NO
LATEST EFFECTIVE DATE 

OF PRICE LIST

2.1

2.2

DELIVERY METHOD :               COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS)               VENDOR DELIVERY

CATEGORY 2 - DISCOUNT OFF OR MARKUP TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS (For Informational Purposes Only)

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract. In order to be paid for those additional products, provide manufacturers name for the additional products you can provide the 

City. Indicate the minimum percentage discount or maximum markup to costs you can provide the City for these products. The percentage discount(s) or markup(s) listed shall be fixed throughout the term of the 

Contract including any subsequent renewal periods. 

This information will not be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and there is no guarantee of purchase. Please include additional pages as necessary.

MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR MAXIMUM 

MARKUP TO PRICE LIST
NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL DELIVERY THE ITEMS TO THE CITY:

____________0___% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

__________0_____% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

Available items and City of Austin pricing can be found through a secure login at mwiah.com

Name ____________________________________________________________________

or contacting your MWI sales representative

1-3 days
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