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ADDENDUM
PURCHASING OFFICE

CITY OF AUSTIN, TEXAS

Solicitation: IFB 8600 CAR1001 Addendum No: 4 Date of Addendum:  September 1, 2022

This addendum is to incorporate the following changes to the above referenced solicitation:

The City hereby has canceled the above-referenced solicitation for scope of work and pricing 
document updates that best meet the department’s needs Please contact Claudia Rodriquez, 
512-974-2959, ClaudiaR.Rodriquez@austintexas.gov.

ALL OTHER TERMS AND CONDITIONS REMAIN THE SAME.

BY THE SIGNATURES affixed below, Addendum No. 4 is hereby incorporated and made a part 
of the above referenced solicitation.

APPROVED BY: _____ _____                    Date: 09/01/2022
Cindy Reyes

                                                    Contract Management Specialist III
Purchasing Office, 512-974-2822

Cindy Reyes
Digitally signed by Cindy 
Reyes
Date: 2022.09.01 
08:00:54 -05'00'



City of Austin Purchasing Office – Log of Offers Received 

Solicitation Number: 

   Vendor Name Date Received   Type of Response   No Bid 
(eResponse / Physical) 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

6. 

7. 

8. 

X

Revised 07/2020 

IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on 
the following bid sheets are for information only 
and does not constitute actual award/execution 
of a contract. 

RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall 
remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of 
offers is for information purposes only and does not 
constitute actual award/execution of a contract. 

For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by: 
Phone – 512-974-2500 
Email – PurchInfo@austintexas.gov 
Physical Address – 124 W. 8th St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701 
Hours of Operation – Monday-Friday 7:45 a.m. to 4:45 p.m. 

This certifies the response was received prior to the solicitation closing. 

X

Gap Arborist Supply, LLC

TOP GUNN EQUIPMENT RENTALS INC 

ASK Tower Supply

8-2-2022 eResponse 

8-16-2022     eResponse

8-16-2022       eResponse 

Pat Alaniz

mailto:PurchInfo@austintexas.gov
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SOLICITATION #

PROCUREMENT 

SPECIALIST

ITEM NO.
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT PRICE*
*Unit price should be no more 

than 4 decimal places 

EXTENDED PRICE

1.1 EACH 1 $284.99

1.2 EACH 8 $16.99 $135.92

1.3 EACH 8 $18.74 $149.92

1.4 EACH 3 $164.24 $492.72

1.5 EACH 2 $140.98 $281.96

1.6 EACH 15 $13.79 $206.85

1.7 EACH 6 $68.24 $409.44

1.8 EACH 2 $259.00 $518.00

1.9 EACH 4 $74.96 $299.84

1.10 EACH 2 $52.49 $104.98

1.11 EACH 2 $191.96 $383.92

1.12 EACH 6 $262.49 $1,574.94

1.13 EACH 2 $183.74 $367.48

1.14 EACH 2 $80.99 $161.98

1.15 EACH 2 $437.99 $875.98

1.16 EACH 2 $374.99 $749.98

1.17 EACH 2 $112.49 $224.98

ARBORIST EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

PRICE SHEET

Cindy Reyes or Claudia Rodriquez

IFB 8600 CAR1001

Special Instructions:  Offerors must use this Pricing Submittal Sheet to submit pricing. 

Be advised that altering the Pricing Submittal Sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer. 

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a 

guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the 

Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the Pricing Submittal Sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or 

transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the 

services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most 

advantageous to the City.

CATEGORY 1 - ABORIST GEAR

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Notch Rope Runner Pro - mechanical ascender or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:__53420_______, Product #ROPERUNNERPRO

Petzl Airline Throw Line - 300m spool - or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:__R02Y 300_______, Product #____R02Y 300_______

DMM Hitch Climber Pulley or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:__PUL100RD_______, Product # PUL100RD

ISC 200 Series Compact Rigging Pulley - RP248 or  buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:___RP248______, Product #RP248

Notch Sentei Telescoping Aluminum Pole Saw - 4 section, 21' - or buyer's approved 

equivalent, Manuf:____4177-39_____, Product #__4177-39_________

Petzl Sequoia SRT Climbing Harness - Size 1, or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:__C069BA01_______, Product #___C069BA01________

Ocean Poly 8mm (5/16”) sewn eye Prusik Cord, 30" length or buyer's approved 

equivalent

Manuf:__OP830_, Product #___________

Rock Exotica RockD auto-lock, up-lock carabiner - aluminum or buyer's approved 

equivalent, Manuf:____C2 A_____, Product #___________

Petzl Vertex Vent Helmet - color: white, or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:__A010CA00_______, Product #A010CA00

Petzl Zillon adjustable lanyard - 4m (13.1') or  buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:____L22A 040_____, Product #________L22A 040___

7/16" TriTech Flipline with sewn eyes and 1 aluminum rope snap - 12' length or or 

buyer's approved equivalent, Manuf:__LANTT12_______, Product #LANTT12

Teufelberger TreeMotion Evo (Treemotion Pro) Climbing harness or buyer's approved 

equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #__7350316 Treemotion PRO_________

Teufelberger Tachyon Ash rope, 11.5mm 150' double braid rope with 1 spliced eye or 

buyer's approved equivalent  Manuf:_____, Product #_____TA150S______

Samson Stable Braid 1/2" rigging rope - 200' length, or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:___806032______, Product #____SB12200_______

Oregon 91VXL Chain - 14" loop, 50 links - or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:___91VXL050G_______, Product #_91VXL050G__________

Silky Zubat Arborist Edition 13" handsaw or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:___270-33______, Product #____270-33_______

Protos Integral Arborist Helmet - black or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:____405002-10-31_____, Product #405002-10-31

Section 0600 - Bid Sheet Page 1 of 2



1.18 EACH 3 $59.99 $179.97

1.19 EACH 60 $3.74 $224.40

1.20 EACH 6 $18.74 $112.44

$7,455.70 

ITEM NO.
MARKUP TO COSTS

(PERCENTAGE)
EXTENDED PRICE

2.1 0.00% $745.57

$8,201.27 

ITEM NO LATEST EFFECTIVE DATE 

3.1

3.2

3.3

3.4

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL DELIVERY THE ITEMS TO THE CITY:

raye@gaparboristsupply.com

Net 30

DELIVERY METHOD :               COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS)               VENDOR DELIVERY

EMAIL ADDRESS:

COMPANY NAME: Gap Arborist Supply, LLC

MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR MAXIMUM NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

__________25_____% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

_______________% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

_______________% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

Name: Gap Arborist Supply

Number ___________________________________________________________________

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

_______________% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS, ADDITIONAL INFORMATION MAY BE ATTACHED INCLUDING 

LINKS TO CATALOGS 

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1

* ADDITIONAL PERCENTAGE

$745.57

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1 +2 = 

CATEGORY 3 - DISCOUNT OFF OR MARKUP TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS (For Informational Purposes Only)

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract. In order to be paid for those additional products, provide manufacturers name and catalog numbers for the additional products 

you can provide the City. Indicate the minimum percentage discount or maximum markup to costs you can provide the City for these products. The percentage discount(s) or markup(s) listed shall be fixed throughout 

the term of the Contract including any subsequent renewal periods. 

This information will not be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and there is no guarantee of purchase. Please include additional pages as necessary.

Atlas Fit Latex Palm Work Glove - Size L -or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Rock Exotica Pirate Auto-Lock Carabiner - aluminum or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_____C1 A____, Product #______C1 A_____

SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = 

CATEGORY 2 - ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS 

The City reserves the right to purchase and add additional items not specified in Category 1 above to the contract. For evaluation and funding purposes only, the City estimates these additional items will account for 

an additional 10% in cost of the contract. The percentage markup to costs listed shall be the maximum amount offered for the category line throughout the term of the contract including any subsequent renewal 

periods, and are not subject to change. The invoice prices for these materials shall be based off a markup to costs paid by the offeror as indicated below. The percentage markup given should take into all costs 

(administrative, overhead, shipping charges, etc.) to deliver the materials to the Austin, TX area. These costs shall be factored into the markup to costs rates and shall not be paid separately.

FAILURE TO PROVIDE A MAXIMUM MARKUP AMOUNT MAY JEOPARDIZE ACCEPTANCE OF YOUR OFFER.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Rock Exotica TransPorter Tool Carrier or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_____C5 M____, Product #______C5 M_____
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SOLICITATION #

PROCUREMENT 

SPECIALIST

ITEM NO.
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT PRICE*
*Unit price should be no more 

than 4 decimal places 

EXTENDED PRICE

1.1 EACH 1 $341.99 $341.99

1.2 EACH 8 $25.20 $201.60

1.3 EACH 8 $22.50 $180.00

1.4 EACH 3 $233.10 $699.30

1.5 EACH 2 $171.00 $342.00

1.6 EACH 15 $20.41 $306.15

1.7 EACH 6 $81.89 $491.34

1.8 EACH 2 $278.10 $556.20

1.9 EACH 4 $94.46 $377.84

1.10 EACH 2 $67.46 $134.92

1.11 EACH 2 $215.96 $431.92

1.12 EACH 6 $314.99 $1,889.94

1.13 EACH 2 $220.46 $440.92

1.14 EACH 2 $69.30 $138.60

1.15 EACH 2 $566.99 $1,133.98

1.16 EACH 2 $449.96 $899.92

1.17 EACH 2 $134.96 $269.92

7/16" TriTech Flipline with sewn eyes and 1 aluminum rope snap - 12' length or or 

buyer's approved equivalent, Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Teufelberger TreeMotion Evo Climbing harness or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Petzl Sequoia SRT Climbing Harness - Size 1, or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Petzl Airline Throw Line - 300m spool - or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Petzl Vertex Vent Helmet - color: white, or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

DMM Hitch Climber Pulley or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

ISC 200 Series Compact Rigging Pulley - RP248 or  buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Notch Sentei Telescoping Aluminum Pole Saw - 4 section, 21' - or buyer's approved 

equivalent, Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Petzl Zillon adjustable lanyard - 4m (13.1') or  buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Teufelberger Tachyon Ash rope, 11.5mm 150' double braid rope with 1 spliced eye or 

buyer's approved equivalent  Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Samson Stable Braid 1/2" rigging rope - 200' length, or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Oregon 91VXL Chain - 14" loop, 50 links - or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Silky Zubat Arborist Edition 13" handsaw or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Protos Integral Arborist Helmet - black or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

CATEGORY 1 - ABORIST GEAR

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Notch Rope Runner Pro - mechanical ascender or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Ocean Poly 8mm (5/16”) sewn eye Prusik Cord, 30" length or buyer's approved 

equivalent

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Rock Exotica RockD auto-lock, up-lock carabiner - aluminum or buyer's approved 

equivalent, Manuf:_________, Product #___________

ARBORIST EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

PRICE SHEET
UPDATED 08/09/22 V1

IFB 8600 CAR1001

Cindy Reyes or Claudia Rodriquez

Special Instructions:  Offerors must use this Pricing Submittal Sheet to submit pricing. 

Be advised that altering the Pricing Submittal Sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer. 

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a 

guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the 

Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the Pricing Submittal Sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or 

transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the 

services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most 

advantageous to the City.
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1.18 EACH 3 $72.00 $216.00

1.19 EACH 60 $2.97 $178.20

1.20 EACH 6 $22.50 $135.00

$9,365.74 

ITEM NO.
MARKUP TO COSTS

(PERCENTAGE)
EXTENDED PRICE

2.1 -10.00% $842.92

$10,208.66 

ITEM NO LATEST EFFECTIVE DATE 

3.1

3.2

3.3

3.4

DELIVERY METHOD :                       VENDOR DELIVERY

COMPANY NAME: Top Gunn Equipment Rentals, Inc.

EMAIL ADDRESS: nat@topgunn.net

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

_______________% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL DELIVERY THE ITEMS TO THE CITY: 7 or Less

Wesspur Tree Equipment

Name ____________________________________________________________________

2022 Products Catalog Effective 1/3/22 -IFB 8600 CAR1001 

Number ___________________________________________________________________

________10_______% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

_______________% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

Name ____________________________________________________________________

Number ___________________________________________________________________

_______________% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS, ADDITIONAL INFORMATION MAY BE ATTACHED INCLUDING 

LINKS TO CATALOGS 
$936.57

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1 +2 = 

CATEGORY 3 - DISCOUNT OFF OR MARKUP TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS (For Informational Purposes Only)

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract. In order to be paid for those additional products, provide manufacturers name and catalog numbers for 

the additional products you can provide the City. Indicate the minimum percentage discount or maximum markup to costs you can provide the City for these products. The percentage 

discount(s) or markup(s) listed shall be fixed throughout the term of the Contract including any subsequent renewal periods. 

This information will not be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and there is no guarantee of purchase. Please include additional pages as necessary.

NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR MAXIMUM 

Atlas Fit Latex Palm Work Glove - Size L -or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

Rock Exotica Pirate Auto-Lock Carabiner - aluminum or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________

SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = 

CATEGORY 2 - ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS 

The City reserves the right to purchase and add additional items not specified in Category 1 above to the contract. For evaluation and funding purposes only, the City estimates these additional 

items will account for an additional 10% in cost of the contract. The percentage markup to costs listed shall be the maximum amount offered for the category line throughout the term of the 

contract including any subsequent renewal periods, and are not subject to change. The invoice prices for these materials shall be based off a markup to costs paid by the offeror as indicated 

below. The percentage markup given should take into all costs (administrative, overhead, shipping charges, etc.) to deliver the materials to the Austin, TX area. These costs shall be factored into 

the markup to costs rates and shall not be paid separately.

FAILURE TO PROVIDE A MAXIMUM MARKUP AMOUNT MAY JEOPARDIZE ACCEPTANCE OF YOUR OFFER.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2

* ADDITIONAL PERCENTAGE

Rock Exotica TransPorter Tool Carrier or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf:_________, Product #___________
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SOLICITATION #

PROCUREMENT 

SPECIALIST

ITEM NO.
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT PRICE*
*Unit price should be no more 

than 4 decimal places 

EXTENDED PRICE

1.1 EACH 1 $240.00 $240.00

1.2 EACH 8 $24.00 $192.00

1.3 EACH 8 $19.00 $152.00

1.4 EACH 3 $169.00 $507.00

1.5 EACH 2 $149.00 $298.00

1.6 EACH 15 $15.60 $234.00

1.7 EACH 6 $79.00 $474.00

1.8 EACH 2 $249.00 $498.00

1.9 EACH 4 $85.00 $340.00

1.10 EACH 2 $79.50 $159.00

1.11 EACH 2 $225.00 $450.00

1.12 EACH 6 $259.00 $1,554.00

1.13 EACH 2 $195.00 $390.00

1.14 EACH 2 $121.00 $242.00

1.15 EACH 2 $650.00 $1,300.00

1.16 EACH 2 $385.00 $770.00

1.17 EACH 2 $119.00 $238.00

ARBORIST EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

PRICE SHEET
UPDATED 08/09/22 V1

Cindy Reyes or Claudia Rodriquez

IFB 8600 CAR1001

Special Instructions:  Offerors must use this Pricing Submittal Sheet to submit pricing. 

Be advised that altering the Pricing Submittal Sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer. 

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a 

guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the 

Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the Pricing Submittal Sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or 

transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the 

services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most 

advantageous to the City.

CATEGORY 1 - ABORIST GEAR

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Notch Rope Runner Pro - mechanical ascender or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Notch, Product #53420

Petzl Airline Throw Line - 300m spool - or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Petzl, Product #R02Y 300

DMM Hitch Climber Pulley or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: DMM Climbing, Product #PUL500GR (quoted green, other colors avail)

ISC 200 Series Compact Rigging Pulley - RP248 or  buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: ISC, Product #RP248

Notch Sentei Telescoping Aluminum Pole Saw - 4 section, 21' - or buyer's approved 

equivalent, Manuf: Notch, Product #4177-39

Petzl Sequoia SRT Climbing Harness - Size 1, or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Petzl, Product #C069BA01

Ocean Poly 8mm (5/16”) sewn eye Prusik Cord, 30" length or buyer's approved 

equivalent

Manuf: Teufelberger, Product #7350808

Rock Exotica RockD auto-lock, up-lock carabiner - aluminum or buyer's approved 

equivalent, Manuf: Rock Exotica, Product #C2 A

Petzl Vertex Vent Helmet - color: white, or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Petzl, Product #A010CA00

Petzl Zillon adjustable lanyard - 4m (13.1') or  buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Petzl, Product #L22A 040

7/16" TriTech Flipline with sewn eyes and 1 aluminum rope snap - 12' length or or 

buyer's approved equivalent, Manuf: Sterling, Product #SCTTFLTA12

Teufelberger TreeMotion Evo Climbing harness or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Teufelberger, Product #7350156

Teufelberger Tachyon Ash rope, 11.5mm 150' double braid rope with 1 spliced eye or 

buyer's approved equivalent  Manuf: Teufelberger, Product #C3248-11-00150

Samson Stable Braid 1/2" rigging rope - 200' length, or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Samson Rope, Product #806 032 X 020 6 0 (quoted coated yellow, other colors 

and non-coated avail)

Oregon 91VXL Chain - 14" loop, 50 links - or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Oregon, Product #91VXL50

Silky Zubat Arborist Edition 13" handsaw or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Silky Saws, Product #722-33

Protos Integral Arborist Helmet - black or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: PROTOS, Product #PROTOS-BK

Section 0600 - Bid Sheet Page 1 of 2



1.18 EACH 3 $61.00 $183.00

1.19 EACH 60 $4.05 $243.00

1.20 EACH 6 $19.00 $114.00

$8,578.00 

ITEM NO.
MARKUP TO COSTS

(PERCENTAGE)
EXTENDED PRICE

2.1 1.00% $866.38

$9,444.38 

ITEM NO LATEST EFFECTIVE DATE 

3.1
latest effective at time 

of ordering

3.2
latest effective at time 

of ordering

3.3
latest effective at time 

of ordering

3.4
latest effective at time 

of ordering

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL DELIVERY THE ITEMS TO THE CITY: 14 business days

kyle@asktowersupply.com

DELIVERY METHOD :               COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS)    X         VENDOR DELIVERY

EMAIL ADDRESS:

COMPANY NAME: ASK Tower Supply

MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR MAXIMUM NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST

Name: Pigeon Mountain Industries, 3M, Kask, BlueWater Ropes, Black Diamond Equipment, DMM, 

CMC, Climbing Technology, Skylotec, CAMP, Edelrid, Elk River, Ergodyne, Notch, RopeLogic, Protos, 

FallTech, US Rigging, Kong, Klein Tools, Lift-All, Maxim Ropes, Rock Exotica, Pelican Rope

___min 15% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

___min 15% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

___min 15% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

Name: Sterling Rope

Number: Latest MSRP catalog from MFR at time of ordering

Name: Petzl

Number: Latest MSRP catalog from MFR at time of ordering

Name: Teufelberger

Number: Latest MSRP catalog from MFR at time of ordering

___min 15% Discount

                            or

________________% Markup

ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS, ADDITIONAL INFORMATION MAY BE ATTACHED INCLUDING 

LINKS TO CATALOGS 

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2

* ADDITIONAL PERCENTAGE

$857.80

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1 +2 = 

CATEGORY 3 - DISCOUNT OFF OR MARKUP TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS (For Informational Purposes Only)

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract. In order to be paid for those additional products, provide manufacturers name and catalog numbers for 

the additional products you can provide the City. Indicate the minimum percentage discount or maximum markup to costs you can provide the City for these products. The percentage 

discount(s) or markup(s) listed shall be fixed throughout the term of the Contract including any subsequent renewal periods. 

This information will not be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and there is no guarantee of purchase. Please include additional pages as necessary.

Atlas Fit Latex Palm Work Glove - Size L -or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Atlas, Product #ASUMB-BL-L

Rock Exotica Pirate Auto-Lock Carabiner - aluminum or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Rock Exotica, Product #C1 A

SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = 

CATEGORY 2 - ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS 

The City reserves the right to purchase and add additional items not specified in Category 1 above to the contract. For evaluation and funding purposes only, the City estimates these additional 

items will account for an additional 10% in cost of the contract. The percentage markup to costs listed shall be the maximum amount offered for the category line throughout the term of the 

contract including any subsequent renewal periods, and are not subject to change. The invoice prices for these materials shall be based off a markup to costs paid by the offeror as indicated 

below. The percentage markup given should take into all costs (administrative, overhead, shipping charges, etc.) to deliver the materials to the Austin, TX area. These costs shall be factored into 

the markup to costs rates and shall not be paid separately.

FAILURE TO PROVIDE A MAXIMUM MARKUP AMOUNT MAY JEOPARDIZE ACCEPTANCE OF YOUR OFFER.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Rock Exotica TransPorter Tool Carrier or buyer's approved equivalent, 

Manuf: Rock Exotica, Product #C5 M
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