
 
 
 

10/25/2022 
 

Recommendation for Award of IFB 6200 AMA1075 Water Fittings and Accessories. 
 
Purchasing staff has completed their evaluation and has recommended award to 
ACT Pipe & Supply Inc. D/B/A ACT Pipe & Supply, City Supply Co., Hydraflo Inc., and Wolseley 
Investments D/B/A Ferguson Enterprises, LLC. 
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���������������� ������ ��!"���#$%&�'�($)�*+��&�","-./!�0��&�12� -34*5�2!,�6�"7�)�+4��89:4�";;4+<:=�/>83?@A ���"@/�B��2�5�CCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCC D#E�)�F���� A"�)�1 /"G� H##��E� (#���I H(#�%����� JKLMNOP�JQRLL�STQ�UV�WRXYQ�ZYXYQ�XT�[V�LN\Y-34*5�2!,�6"7()�+4��89:4�";;4+<:=�/>83?@A ���"@/�B��2�5�CCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCC DF�((������ A"()�1 /"G� H)���#� (#���I H�F�)D���( ]TK̂ _NOP�]N�S_Ỳ �ab[cd�STQ�aefg�̀�gV�]N�̂N̂Y-"!.5�hG@�6���7��%%�2!��89:4�";;4+<:=�/>83?@A ���"@/�B��2�5�CCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCC DF�#���(��% h�����%% /"G� H��D��%� #����I H#%��E���) �i,�-.�A1���/!�j"1�(A.��"!!/1�k$��&�A�-.���1/.��7�$����.�2�-34*5�/G1�-�/�6%#�+4��89:4�";;4+<:=�/>83?@A ���"@/�B��2�5�CCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCC ()�D��)%��� l%# /"G� H�m)�%�(#� #���I H�m(#D�E(���#  "�l/.�@/./!�!���/!����$�&m�,!2-���� "�l/.�$�G12.�����/!./,m��#��-��m��$%&�.��Gl-34*5� !"�,��"j/��)�E)!�+4��89:4�";;4+<:=�/>83?@A ���"@/�B��2�5�CCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCC �%#(#D#���� /����) /"G� H(�)(� )����I H���D���D  "�l/.�@/./!�!���/!��&m�,!2-���� "�l/.�$�G12.�����/!./,m��#��-��m��$%&�.��Gl-34*5� !"�,��"j/��)�E#!�+4��89:4�";;4+<:=�/>83?@A ���"@/�B��2�5�CCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCC �%#(#D#���� /�)��( /"G� H(�)(� )����I H���D���F @/./!�k".!�!�� � "�l/.��#��-����$%&��.��Gl�G12.�����/!.�(&m�,!2-���� "�l/.�$�G12.�����/!./,m��#��-��m��$%&�.��Gl-34*5� !"�,��"j/�����( �+4��89:4�";;4+<:=�/>83?�@A ���"@/�B��2�5�CCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCC %E�)#�#��� �-7/G�!���#��(�� /"G� H)��F� )����I H��#����% �i,�-"!.�#��$)�G12k�@/,"11�2���/".�!�� �@�E@A ���"@/�B��2�5�CCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCCC ()�D�#����( �2���, /"G� H����


�����
n�������������
���o������������
���	�����

����

pqrstu��vwxyzrxs{vw|.}:�G~*9�;4:�:4��*+��3�:��8?*~;?:�3�34=�m�~��=::�:=�*+��:�*}:��+�*�3=<3�*3�:+8���9�*}:�G~*9���:�3=<~�:=�*}3*�:'�:;*~+���*3�:��+4�>83?~�9~����*3*:�:�*���3=:�*+�3�9�;+4*~+��+��*}:��+?~�~*3*~+����39��:+;34=~�:�3��:;*3��:�+��*}:�+��:4�3�=��39�4:�8?*�~��=~�>83?~�~�3*~+��+��*}:�+��:4��,~��+8�*��3�=�;4~�~����8��~**:=�+��+4=:4�4:>8:�*���}3??�~��?8=:�����=~��+8�*�m�}3�=?~���3�=��}~;;~����}34�:�m�A2��,:�*~�3*~+�m��4:=~*��34=�;4+�:��~����::�m�:*���A3~?84:�*+�4:�;+�=�*+�:3�}��:�*~+��+��*}~���~=��}::*��39�4:�8?*�~��=~�>83?~�~�3*~+��+��9+84��~=�,+�8�:�*3*~+��+��*}:�=~��+8�*���}3??��:�3<3~?3�?:�8;+��4:>8:�*���9�*}:�G~*9��+4�<3?~=3*~+��;84;+�:���
���
��������|���qy�zw{v
���������������|�����������������

qrxs{v��|��
t�pusv��{���{��{�sx��
tyxw��{y���tuztxs{v�
zyp{wqw�G+��+=~*9�;34*��?~�*:=��:?+��34:�*}:��+�*��+��+��~*:���*}3*��39��:�+4=:4:=�*}4+8�}+8*�*}:��+�*43�*�*:4���-?:3�:�;4+<~=:�*}:��844:�*�?~�*�;4~�:m�;:4�:�*3�:�=~��+8�*m�3�=�8�~*�;4~�:�+��*}:�~*:���?~�*:=��o������������
���	�����

����


�:�*~+���D���7�-4~�:��}::* -3�:���+��D



����������	��	
����
��	���
	�����		�����
���
����������������	
	������������������
�
������� !"#�$%&'�%#%$'(&�)*++,(��-./�0��)12�'*��0�3$'425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 9:�;�.:<��. 2)= 9� ,> (%?! @:A��9� :<���B @�<� C��.� !"#�$%&'�>())(#"�5D%&#3%)�<-./:�(E'()13*)�.�0�>C.%425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 9:�;�.�;��� )*�F3# (%?! @������.. 5,%)#1�4G�$%?>�2*&�#3�23''3)51�=/)D'1H�F*,'1H�5%1>('H�13+(�:0425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 ;< ::C .��. 34G%$$ (%?! @<��9:� �C���B @9A�;C��.� !*1(H�*&%)5(H�!3-$&(11D&(H�.0�3#�E�<��2''�&((,H��H<���$13���!*1(�4D1'�?*4(�=3'!*D'�23''3)51�3)�<��2'�=**#()�&((,4IJ�7�$KLMNL�!KOOPIPO�?QLRH�'LKSN/FLKOS�)KTN7�$LNSKUQL/$KLKIVNWH�4QSNV�X1;.;-<��H�&NI�X�!$1!-.;�QL�FYZNL�%RRLQ[NS�(\YKV425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 :;�.�.�.��. )*�F3# 2((' @������.9 !*1(H�*&%)5(H�!3-$&(11D&(H�.0�3#�E�:��2'�&((,H��H<���$13���!*1(�4D1'�?*4(�=3'!*D'�23''3)51�3)�:��2'�=**#()�&((,4IJ�7�$KLMNL�!KOOPIPO�?QLRH�'LKSN/FLKOS�)KTN7�$LNSKUQL/$KLKIVNWH�4QSNV�X1;.;-:��H�&NI�X�!$1!-.;�QL�FYZNL�%RRLQ[NS�(\YKV425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 :;�.�.����: )*�F3# 2((' @������.: !*1(H�F,D(H�!3-$&(11D&(H�9/:0�E�<��2'�=**#()�&((,4IJ�7�$KLMNL�!KOOPIPO�?QLRH�'LKSN/FLKOS�)KTN7�$LNSKUQL/$KLKIVNWH�4QSNV�X�1 .�-<���QL�FYZNL�%RRLQ[NS�(\YKV425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 :;� �:����. )*�F3# 2((' @�������. 1'*$�%)5,(�F%,,�]%,](H�?*4$&(113*)�5G�E�4('(&�1=3](,�)D'�.0�̂3)�%??*&#%)?(�=3'!�1$,�==-A��_425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 ;A�A�..��� 2F%:9:::=5), (%?! @�<��9.� 9<���B @.;:������� 1'*$�%)5,(�F%,,�]%,](H�2(4%,(�3$'�W�4('(&�1=3](,�)D'�.0�̂3)�%??*&#%)?(�=3'!�1$,�==-A��_425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 ;A�A�..��.. 2F%.9:::=), (%?! @�9��:C� 9<���B @.: �C.���9 1'*$�%)5,(�F%,,�]%,](H�2(4%,(�3$'�E�4('(&�1=3](,�)D'�9/:0�̂3)�%??*&#%)?(�=3'!�1$,�==-A��_425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 ;A�A�..��.� 2F%.9�9�=), (%?! @C9�A � 9<���B @<:�:;���: ]%,](�F%,,�F&*)+(�./:0�=/�F&%11�1'(4�6�?!&*4(�$,%'(#�F&%11�F%,�̂3)�%??*&#%)?(�=3'!�1$,�==-A��_425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 ;A�A�.�.��. 2)=E:.<F (%?! @�;�;9� <����B @.9�9����< ]%,](�F%,,�F&*)+(�23$�9���$13�,(](&�!%)#,(��0�̂3)�%??*&#%)?(�=3'!�1$,�==-A��_425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 ;A�A�9C.��� 2F..AAA!';A1), (%?! @<A��C.� 9<���B @9A��99���; ]%,](�F%,,�F&*)+(�23$�9���$13�,(](&�!%)#,(�.0�̂3)�%??*&#%)?(�=3'!�1$,�==-A��_425��)%4(�6�)*�7�888888888888888888888888888888888888 ;A�A�9C.��: 2F..:::!'9:), (%?! @.C9��;� 9<���B @..C�  

������
���
����������
��
���̀
�̀ ���
���
����������

1NaUPQO��;���-�$LPaN�1bNNU $KJN���QI�;



����������	��	
����
��	���
	�����		�����
���
����������������	
	������������������
�
��������  !" #�$!%#�&'!((��)�*+##"�%,-#�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4�55678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; <�5�5=555=> 7>=?%5@"8 #!1+ A=?5�B=5 >>�55C A<D�?=���@  !" #�$!%#�3/�8"!0$#3�&2%+�#03(�?)�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4�55678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; @B5<@=�555= !81�>5?882"+* #!1+ A=E>�D�555 >>�55C A<@>�D>���B  !" #�$!%#�3/�8"!0$#3�&2%+�#03(�<)�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4�55678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; @B5<@=�555� !81�>5<882"+* #!1+ A�E5D<�555 >>�55C AB=<��5��D5 *!(+#'�7#%#'�'F&&#'�DG?)�H�=G=<)�%+/1I�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4�55678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; <�5>@B�555= &'D=< #!1+ A5���5 �5�55C A5�����D= !3!-%#'�- 1�?)�1201'#%#�H�?)�1/�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�**4���&678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; @B5>5=�555< 8>55<??'1 #!1+ A>>�=�5 �5�55C A??�=5��D� &2H�7#%#'�+3-#E��=)�H�=?)�'#1%!0$F"!'�!7'G!7/E�(7!""�(/0$"#�&2H�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4=?>!678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; �=5?>=555== 338*D�1=?&23, #!1+ A�D��?�5 <5�55C AB��BB��DD 12 #'�7#%#'�&2H�+3-#�=�)�H�D5)�'#1%!0$F"!'�!7'G!7/E�(/0$"#��)�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4=?>!678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; �=5?>=555=@ (-4=�D58!8=J!8!*"/ #!1+ AD<?�B55 <5�55C A=?>�B<��D? '/0$�9�12 #'�7!0+2"#��?)�3/!�(!0/%!',�(#*#'�&2"%#3�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4=?>!678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; @B5D5D5=55D # �?D@'1(!!F( #!1+ A=EDD?�>D5 <5�55C A>DD�@=��D> #"&2*�- 1�(#*#'�(3'4�<�$!(I#%�H�$!(I#%�?>�3#$��<)�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�**4���&678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; <>B?=@B>55? 7F"5<�D�< #!1+ A=@@�@D5 �5�55C A><�<>��D< 12 #'�7#%#'�'2F03�+3-#�'#%'28/%�!7'G!7/E�(7!""�=�)�(/0$"#�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4=?>!678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; �=5?>=55=55 (-4338*=@!7'!"/3 #!1+ A�B���5 <5�55C AD=�B=��D� -/-#�1/�-'#((F'#�%,%20�3F1%/"#�<)�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�**4��1678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; @B5?B=5555= !8%D>5-F #!1+ A=E?=��>55 <5�55C A><>�55��D@ 12 #'�7#%#'�&2H�+3-#E��=)�H�=?)�'#1%!0$F"!'�!7'G!7/E�(7!""�(/0$"#�"/3�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4=?>!678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; �=5?>=555=� (-4338*D�1!8!*"/3 #!1+ A=@5�=�5 <5�55C A���5���DB 12 #'�7#%#'�&2HE�+3-#��<)�H�=>)�'#1%!0$F"!'�!7'G!7/E�(/0$"#�=4=G��/0�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4=?>!678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; �=5?>=555=< 338*<>1!8=#J!"/3 #!1+ AD�5�BD5 <5�55C A=�@�D���?5 12 #'�7#%#'�&2HE+3-#�=@)�H�=�)�'#1%!0$F"!'�!7'G!7/E�(7!""�32F&"#�"/3�./0�!112'3!01#�*/%+�(-"�**4=?>!678$��0!7#�9�02�:�;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;; �=5?>=555=? (-4338*D@1!8!*"/3 #!1+ A�5<�<D5 <5�55C A@��<>

�
	���
��������������
���
�����������K�L�M�����M��	��N

(OPQRST�5<55�4�-URPO�(VOOQ -WXO�D�SY�<



����������	��	
����
��	���
	�����		�����
���
����������������	
	������������������
�
������� !"##�$"#$%�&'()'("*+',�-*')�*")%(�*.(%"/�0�&'1)(%--+',�23� 4�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�66789:1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8?@?@ @A@@� ;; @@@�2,# %"&. B @A�C9@ DC�@@E B? ��D���� !F-.+,2�!("--� 4�0�DG�4�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�66789:1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8?@DD DC@@D +!(#;!2; %"&. B  �A?@ 8@�@@E B��?A���D &")�!("--� 4�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�66789:1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8?@DD �C@@D +!(#;&")2 %"&. B C�9C@ 8@�@@E B8�D����� &',,%&*'(-�!("--�F7!(",&.�&'1)(%--+',� 4�0�DG�4�0�DG�4�1+)�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�66789:1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8CAD@�@ @@ ;F�9�D2,# %"&. BAA�?A@ DC�@@E B8��98���C %#!'6�!("--�A@�/%2�DG�4�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�66789:1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8?@DD  C@ @ +!(#;A; %"&. B ��9@@ 8@�@@E BC�A����8 ;#",2%�!("--��4�6+*.�2"-H%*-I�!'#*-I�",/�,F*-�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�66789:1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 9A@�AD�C@  "8@8,!1;-%* %"&. B?��8@@ D@�@@E BC@�9����? *%%�!("--��4�0��4�0��4�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�66789:1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8?@DD �@@ D +!(#;*H %"&. B @�� 9@ 8@�@@E B�@�9?���9 *%%�&+�1%&.�3*� �4�0� �4�0��4�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�66789:1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 9A@�A�A@@@? 13*#" �) %"&. B8�?�@@@ �@�@@E BD?8��@���A %#!'6�!("--�A@�/%2�&'1)�23�0�1+)*� 4�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�66789:1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8?@DD  C@@D ;#9���2,# %"&. B8@�C�@ DC�@@E BDA�D���C@ &'F)#+,2�!("--�&'1)�23�0�&'1)�23�DG�4I�-*J#%�&�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�66789:1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8?@DD AC@@ ;&��DD2,# %"&. B�@��C@ DC�@@E B�8��A��C &'F)#+,2� 7 G�4�%#!'6�&'1)(%--+',�2�3��0�&'1)(%--+',�2�3��5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�667�? :1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8CA�� ? @@D ;#��882,# %"&. B� C�8D@ DC�@@E B �@� 8��C� &'F)#+,2� 4�%#!'6�&'1)(%--+',�2�3��0�&'1)(%--+',�2�3��5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�667�? :1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8CA�� ? @@� ;#����2,# %"&. B8?� �@ DC�@@E B�D�8���CD &'F)#+,2��4�%#!'6�&'1)(%--+',�2�3��0�&'1)(%--+',�2�3��5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�667�? :1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8CA�� ? @@ ;#��??2,# %"&. B�D8��8@ DC�@@E B�9D�C?��C� &'F)#+,2�-*#��)+)%�(%)"+(� G�4�-*#�)+)%I�!#"&H�/(%--%(�5+,�"&&'(/",&%�6+*.�-)#�667�? :1;2��,"1%�<�,'�=�>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 8?@C�   @@ ,'�!+/ %"&. B@�@@

��
���
���
����������

����������
���
����������
-KLMNOP�@8@@�7�)QNLK�-RKKM )STK���OU�8



����������	��	
����
��	���
	�����		�����
���
����������������	
	������������������
�
��������  !"#$%&'� %�($)*��+�*����,+�*�--+�(!.� %�/%&�0  !.10& )�2%34�5#$�226�7-89('��&09)�:�&!�;�<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<< =7,��-,>,,� 5#65?--,,,��,,>,,> )0 4 @��>��A, �,�,,B @-7A�=����=  !"#$%&'�53$�.)#0%.�( �-=+�*�-7�A,+�*�>,+�/%&�0  !.10& )�2%34�5#$�226�7-89('��&09)�:�&!�;�<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<< =7,��-��,�- 5��A�,-7-�>,,,, )0 4 @�C>-,�=7, �,�,,B @-CA?A��?���7  !"#$%&'�53$��#%#)�.)#0%.�-6-D?+�53$�#%#)C�E$0 F�1.)55).�/%&�0  !.10& )�2%34�5#$�226�7-89('��&09)�:�&!�;�<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<< =7,��---,,? &!�E%1 )0 4 @,�,,���A  !"#$%&'�53$��#%#)�.)#0%.�>D?+�53$�#%#)C�E$0 F�1.)55).�/%&�0  !.10& )�2%34�5#$�226�7-8�9('��&09)�:�&!�;�<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<< =7,��---,,� &!�E%1 )0 4 @,�,,���G  !"#$%&'C�#%#)�3.0&5%3%!&�.)#0%.C�E!$3)1C�2)$1)1�53))$�1�%�6#� �#C���,+�*�-�+�$!&'C�!�1��.0&')�-)&1;��-�G=6���-?D��)&1��-��,6�-�=AC�59%346E$0%.�H?->6��,=6�-=,67,��IJ�E"K).��0##.!L)1�)M"0$�/%&�0  !.10& )�2%34�5#$�226�7-89('��&09)�:�&!�;�<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<<< =7,��=�-,,� 5#65?-,�,,,,=>G7>� )0 4 @�C>,7�-,, �,�,,B @-CA?��=AN��OPQ���R
�	������ ������	
�� ���	������
����-�,- ,B 95.#D#JSTSUV�1SWTIXUY-�,� >�B 1SWTIXUY�ZJI[�95.#-�,> �,B 1SWTIXUY�ZJI[�95.#-�,? =,B 1SWTIXUY�ZJI[�95.#-�,� <<<<<<<<<<<<B 1SWTIXUY�ZJI[�95.#-�,= <<<<<<<<<<<<B 1SWTIXUY�ZJI[�95.#!Y\]J;��5[SY\6Ê_SJC�(]JUTI
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Vendor 

Local Presence (Y/N)

MBE/WBE

ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION CITY PART # VENDOR PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE
LIST PRICE

DISCOUNT 
PERCENTAGE

PRICE TO CITY ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR PART # LIST PRICE
DISCOUNT 

PERCENTAGE
PRICE TO CITY ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR PART # LIST PRICE

DISCOUNT 
PERCENTAGE

PRICE TO CITY ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR PART # LIST PRICE
DISCOUNT 

PERCENTAGE
PRICE TO CITY

2.01

BUSHING BRASS 5/8" x 3/4 to 1" ADAPTER X 2" LONG
Part: ORD # A-24 or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

65924171002 EACH NO BID

BUSHING BRASS 5/8" x 3/4 to 1" ADAPTER X 2" LONG
Part: ORD # A-24 or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

BUSHING BRASS 5/8" x 3/4 to 1" ADAPTER X 2" LONG
Part: ORD # A-24 or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FA24NL $55.090 35.00% $35.81 

BUSHING BRASS 5/8" x 3/4 to 1" ADAPTER X 2" LONG
Part: ORD # A-24 or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: ___FORD METER BOX A24-NL 
EACH__________________________________

33788 $56.70 40.0% $34.02

2.02

BUSHING BRASS FOR ¾” WATER METER TO 1” SIZE
Part: ORD #A-34 or Buyer Approved Equal

MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

67033110002 EACH NO BID

BUSHING BRASS FOR ¾” WATER METER TO 1” SIZE
Part: ORD #A-34 or Buyer Approved Equal

MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

no bid

BUSHING BRASS FOR ¾” WATER METER TO 1” SIZE
Part: ORD #A-34 or Buyer Approved Equal

MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

FA34NL $42.250 35.00% $27.46 

BUSHING BRASS FOR ¾” WATER METER TO 1” SIZE
Part: ORD #A-34 or Buyer Approved Equal

MFG. NAME & NO.: _FORD METER BOX A34-NL (SOLD BY 

PAIR)___________________________________

33889 $43.25 40.0% $25.95

2.03

COUPLING CI FLEX 2-1/4 FOR 2.75 X 5” CI PIPE
PART: JCM #210-0288 OR Buyer Approved Equal

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67052103008 EACH NO BID

COUPLING CI FLEX 2-1/4 FOR 2.75 X 5” CI PIPE
PART: JCM #210-0288 OR Buyer Approved Equal

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

COUPLING CI FLEX 2-1/4 FOR 2.75 X 5” CI PIPE
PART: JCM #210-0288 OR Buyer Approved Equal

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

J2100288 $116.180 50.00% $58.09 

COUPLING CI FLEX 2-1/4 FOR 2.75 X 5” CI PIPE
PART: JCM #210-0288 OR Buyer Approved Equal

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

22352 $116.00 40.0% $69.60

2.04

HYD PT FLUSHER VAL 3FT BARREL W/ 2" FIPT INLET 2-1/2 NST 
OU
Part: ECLIPSE #85 or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

34060148001 EACH NO BID

HYD PT FLUSHER VAL 3FT BARREL W/ 2" FIPT INLET 2-1/2 NST 
OU
Part: ECLIPSE #85 or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________ no bid

HYD PT FLUSHER VAL 3FT BARREL W/ 2" FIPT INLET 2-1/2 NST 
OU
Part: ECLIPSE #85 or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

K85 $1,428.350 5.00% $1,356.93 

HYD PT FLUSHER VAL 3FT BARREL W/ 2" FIPT INLET 2-1/2 NST 
OU
Part: ECLIPSE #85 or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

27561 $1,954.20 40.0% $1,172.52

2.05

GASKET METER RUBBER 1 1/2", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH 
INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 4194R or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

28535651001 EACH NO BID

GASKET METER RUBBER 1 1/2", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH 
INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 4194R or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

GASKET METER RUBBER 1 1/2", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH 
INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 4194R or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

E20024 $3.430 40.00% $2.06 

GASKET METER RUBBER 1 1/2", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH 
INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 4194R or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID

X NO BID

2.06

GASKET METER RUBBER 2", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH 

INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 4195R or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

28535651002 EACH NO BID

GASKET METER RUBBER 2", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH 

INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 4195R or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

GASKET METER RUBBER 2", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH 

INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 4195R or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

E14003 $3.430 40.00% $2.06 

GASKET METER RUBBER 2", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH 

INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 4195R or Buyer Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID

X NO BID

2.07

METER WATR RING GASKET 150 PSI 1/8". THICK CLOTH 

INSERT 3", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" 
THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 2003G or Buyer Approved Equal 
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

8904515001 EACH NO BID

METER WATR RING GASKET 150 PSI 1/8". THICK CLOTH 

INSERT 3", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" 
THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 2003G or Buyer Approved Equal 
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

METER WATR RING GASKET 150 PSI 1/8". THICK CLOTH 

INSERT 3", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" 
THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 2003G or Buyer Approved Equal 
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

SP-
ECIR121500300

$4.170 40.00% $2.50 

METER WATR RING GASKET 150 PSI 1/8". THICK CLOTH 

INSERT 3", DROP IN GASKET / CLOTH INSERTED, 150 PSI, 1/8" 
THICK
Part: GRAND HAVEN 2003G or Buyer Approved Equal 
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID

X NO BID

2.08
HYD PART 5 1/4 CLOW MEDALLION SEAT RING M19
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

34060521003 EACH NO BID
HYD PART 5 1/4 CLOW MEDALLION SEAT RING M19
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

HYD PART 5 1/4 CLOW MEDALLION SEAT RING M19
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID $0.00 
HYD PART 5 1/4 CLOW MEDALLION SEAT RING M19
MFG. NAME & NO.: ___: F-160-0805 BRONZE SEAT RING 
CLOW MEDALION_________________________________

21223 $776.70 40.0% $466.02

2.09
HYD PART ADAPTER NOZZLE 2-1/2"  NSF TO 2" IPT

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

34060145001 EACH NO BID
HYD PART ADAPTER NOZZLE 2-1/2"  NSF TO 2" IPT

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

HYD PART ADAPTER NOZZLE 2-1/2"  NSF TO 2" IPT

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FNW9309LK $47.230 45.00% $25.98 
HYD PART ADAPTER NOZZLE 2-1/2"  NSF TO 2" IPT

MFG. NAME & NO.: _____ 2-1/2" FEMALE NSF TO 2" MALE 
IPT_______________________________

28118 $39.35 40.0% $23.61

2.10
HYD PART KENNEDY GUARDIAN 5-1/4 EXTENSION 12" K81A
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

34060106002 EACH NO BID
HYD PART KENNEDY GUARDIAN 5-1/4 EXTENSION 12" K81A
MFG. NAME & NO.: ___HYDRAFLO #1484-
12"__________________________________

1484-12'' $241.150 $241.50 

HYD PART KENNEDY GUARDIAN 5-1/4 EXTENSION 12" K81A
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID $0.00 
HYD PART KENNEDY GUARDIAN 5-1/4 EXTENSION 12" K81A
MFG. NAME & NO.: ____ HRP 
11EXT10K________________________________

2420 $813.50 40.0% $488.10

2.11

GLANDS MJ PACK FOR DI FITTINGS W/NUTS, BOLTS, GASKET, 

SIZE 4"
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

65944891001 EACH NO BID

GLANDS MJ PACK FOR DI FITTINGS W/NUTS, BOLTS, GASKET, 

SIZE 4"
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

GLANDS MJ PACK FOR DI FITTINGS W/NUTS, BOLTS, GASKET, 

SIZE 4"
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

IMJAPP $52.340 28.00% $37.68 

GLANDS MJ PACK FOR DI FITTINGS W/NUTS, BOLTS, GASKET, 

SIZE 4"
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

2084 $41.25 40.0% $24.75

2.12

HOSE, ORANGE, HI-PRESSURE, 1" ID X 500FTT REEL, 2,500 PSI.  
HOSE MUST COME WITHOUT FITTINGS IN 500FT WOODEN 

REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model #S616-500, Ref # HPSH-16 or Buyer 
Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

46010101001 FEET NO BID

HOSE, ORANGE, HI-PRESSURE, 1" ID X 500FTT REEL, 2,500 PSI.  
HOSE MUST COME WITHOUT FITTINGS IN 500FT WOODEN 

REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model #S616-500, Ref # HPSH-16 or Buyer 
Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

HOSE, ORANGE, HI-PRESSURE, 1" ID X 500FTT REEL, 2,500 PSI.  
HOSE MUST COME WITHOUT FITTINGS IN 500FT WOODEN 

REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model #S616-500, Ref # HPSH-16 or Buyer 
Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID $0.00 

HOSE, ORANGE, HI-PRESSURE, 1" ID X 500FTT REEL, 2,500 PSI.  
HOSE MUST COME WITHOUT FITTINGS IN 500FT WOODEN 

REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model #S616-500, Ref # HPSH-16 or Buyer 
Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

2.13

HOSE, ORANGE, HI-PRESSURE, 1" ID X 400FT REEL, 2,500 PSI.  

HOSE MUST COME WITHOUT FITTINGS IN 400FT WOODEN 
REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model #S616-400, Ref # HPSH-16 or Buyer 
Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

46010100004 FEET NO BID

HOSE, ORANGE, HI-PRESSURE, 1" ID X 400FT REEL, 2,500 PSI.  

HOSE MUST COME WITHOUT FITTINGS IN 400FT WOODEN 
REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model #S616-400, Ref # HPSH-16 or Buyer 
Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

no bid

HOSE, ORANGE, HI-PRESSURE, 1" ID X 400FT REEL, 2,500 PSI.  

HOSE MUST COME WITHOUT FITTINGS IN 400FT WOODEN 
REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model #S616-400, Ref # HPSH-16 or Buyer 
Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

NO BID $0.00 

HOSE, ORANGE, HI-PRESSURE, 1" ID X 400FT REEL, 2,500 PSI.  

HOSE MUST COME WITHOUT FITTINGS IN 400FT WOODEN 
REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model #S616-400, Ref # HPSH-16 or Buyer 
Approved Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

2.14

HOSE, BLUE, HI-PRESSURE, 3/4" X 500FT WOODEN REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model # S912-500 or Buyer Approved 

Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

46090400001 FEET NO BID

HOSE, BLUE, HI-PRESSURE, 3/4" X 500FT WOODEN REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model # S912-500 or Buyer Approved 

Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

HOSE, BLUE, HI-PRESSURE, 3/4" X 500FT WOODEN REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model # S912-500 or Buyer Approved 

Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID $0.00 

HOSE, BLUE, HI-PRESSURE, 3/4" X 500FT WOODEN REEL
Mfg.: Parker Hannifin Corp, Trade/Brand Name: 
Predator/Paraflex, Model # S912-500 or Buyer Approved 

Equal
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID

X NO BID

2.21

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, COMPRESSION GJ X METER SWIVEL 

NUT 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67070110009 EACH NO BID

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, COMPRESSION GJ X METER 

SWIVEL NUT 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, COMPRESSION GJ X METER 

SWIVEL NUT 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FBA43444WGNL $252.310 35.00% $164.00 

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, COMPRESSION GJ X METER SWIVEL 

NUT 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: ___BA43-444W-G-
NL_________________________________

5654 $256.31 40.0% $153.79

2.22

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, FEMALE IPT x METER SWIVEL NUT 

1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67070110011 EACH NO BID

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, FEMALE IPT x METER SWIVEL NUT 

1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, FEMALE IPT x METER SWIVEL NUT 

1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FBA13444WNL $230.480 35.00% $149.81 

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, FEMALE IPT x METER SWIVEL NUT 

1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _ FORD METER BOX BA13-
444W___________________________________

5200 $234.48 40.0% $140.69

2.23

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, FEMALE IPT X METER SWIVEL NUT 
3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67070110010 EACH NO BID

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, FEMALE IPT X METER SWIVEL NUT 
3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, FEMALE IPT X METER SWIVEL NUT 
3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FBA13232WNL $83.790 35.00% $54.46 

STOP ANGLE BALL VALVE, FEMALE IPT X METER SWIVEL NUT 
3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _FORD METER BOX BA13-
332W___________________________________

5156 $156.97 40.0% $94.18

2.24

VALVE BALL BRONZE 1/4" W/ BRASS STEM & CHROME 
PLATED BRASS BAL (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67070101001 EACH NO BID

VALVE BALL BRONZE 1/4" W/ BRASS STEM & CHROME 
PLATED BRASS BAL (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

VALVE BALL BRONZE 1/4" W/ BRASS STEM & CHROME 
PLATED BRASS BAL (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FNWX415B $26.630 50.00% $13.32 

VALVE BALL BRONZE 1/4" W/ BRASS STEM & CHROME 
PLATED BRASS BAL (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

2.25

VALVE BALL BRONZE FIP 300 PSI LEVER HANDLE 2" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67070381002 EACH NO BID

VALVE BALL BRONZE FIP 300 PSI LEVER HANDLE 2" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

VALVE BALL BRONZE FIP 300 PSI LEVER HANDLE 2" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FB11777HT67SN
L

$572.810 35.00% $372.33 

VALVE BALL BRONZE FIP 300 PSI LEVER HANDLE 2" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _: 2" IMPORT BRASS BALL VALVE, 
NL___________________________________

12202 $128.00 40.0% $76.80

2.26

VALVE BALL BRONZE FIP 300 PSI LEVER HANDLE 1" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

67070381004 EACH NO BID

VALVE BALL BRONZE FIP 300 PSI LEVER HANDLE 1" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

no bid

VALVE BALL BRONZE FIP 300 PSI LEVER HANDLE 1" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

FB11444HT34NL $183.060 35.00% $118.99 

VALVE BALL BRONZE FIP 300 PSI LEVER HANDLE 1" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _1" IMPORT BRASS BALL VALVE, 

NL___________________________________

12139 $32.50 40.0% $19.50

2.27

VALVE GATE BRASS 2" WHEEL TYPE (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67070100015 EACH NO BID

VALVE GATE BRASS 2" WHEEL TYPE (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

VALVE GATE BRASS 2" WHEEL TYPE (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

M514T08LF $140.910 55.00% $63.41 

VALVE GATE BRASS 2" WHEEL TYPE (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

11633 $82.50 40.0% $49.50

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

WATER SYSTEM FITTINGS AND ACCESSORIES (PARTS)  
 Bid Tab

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 2200 AMA1075

BUYER NAME: Ajani Aird

Special Instructions:

The City prefers to make multiple awards, if deemed to be the most advantageous by the City. Be advised that exceptions taken or qualifying statements made to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the offer and may result in disqualification of the offer. Discounts and pricing submitted on order requests shall include ALL discounts, handling and shipping charges, FOB Destination, credit card processing fees, etc. Failure to respond to each section of this bid sheet may result in disqualification of your bid.

Section 1:  Sampling of Commodity Parts for Evaluation Purposes 

Commodity parts listed below are the most common items that may be ordered throughout the contract term. Please provide the current list price, percentage discount, and unit price on the items listed. 

 BALL VALVES AND ACCESSORIES

City Supply Co Hydraflo Inc.
Wolseley Investments D/B/A 

Ferguson Enterprises, LLC ACT Pipe & Supply Inc.

WATER FITTINGS AND ACCESSORIES

HOSES AND ACCESSORIES

N

N

Y

N

N

N

N

N
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BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

WATER SYSTEM FITTINGS AND ACCESSORIES (PARTS)  
 Bid Tab

2.28

VALVE GATE DI FLANGED BOTH ENDS 4" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

89068120001 EACH NO BID

VALVE GATE DI FLANGED BOTH ENDS 4" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

VALVE GATE DI FLANGED BOTH ENDS 4" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

AFC2504FFOLH
W

$1,523.000 55.00% $685.35 

VALVE GATE DI FLANGED BOTH ENDS 4" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

6735 $1,058.57 40.0% $635.14

2.29

VALVE GATE DI FLANGED BOTH ENDS 6" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

89068120002 EACH NO BID

VALVE GATE DI FLANGED BOTH ENDS 6" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________ no bid

VALVE GATE DI FLANGED BOTH ENDS 6" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

AFC2506FFOLH
W

$2,036.000 55.00% $916.20 

VALVE GATE DI FLANGED BOTH ENDS 6" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

6786 $1,502.65 40.0% $901.59

2.30

WASHER METER RUBBER 3/4" X 1/16" THICK (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67058920001 EACH NO BID

WASHER METER RUBBER 3/4" X 1/16" THICK (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

WASHER METER RUBBER 3/4" X 1/16" THICK (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

BR316 $0.270 20.00% $0.22 

WASHER METER RUBBER 3/4" X 1/16" THICK (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-700)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

32268 $0.20 40.0% $0.12

2.31

ADAPTER PVC 4" CONCRETE X 4" CI (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
WW-227B)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

89050170006 EACH NO BID

ADAPTER PVC 4" CONCRETE X 4" CI (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
WW-227B)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

ADAPTER PVC 4" CONCRETE X 4" CI (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
WW-227B)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

F500644RC $55.120 20.00% $44.10 

ADAPTER PVC 4" CONCRETE X 4" CI (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
WW-227B)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

4367 $80.25 40.0% $48.15

2.32

BOX METER HDPE, 21" X 14" RECTANGULAR AMR/AMI, 
SMALL SINGLE BOX (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

21045100011 EACH NO BID

BOX METER HDPE, 21" X 14" RECTANGULAR AMR/AMI, 
SMALL SINGLE BOX (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

BOX METER HDPE, 21" X 14" RECTANGULAR AMR/AMI, 
SMALL SINGLE BOX (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

DDFW37C14BOD

Y
$232.470 60.00% $92.99 

BOX METER HDPE, 21" X 14" RECTANGULAR AMR/AMI, 
SMALL SINGLE BOX (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.:  DFW-37C-14 BOX BODY 
ONLY____________________________________

97030 $142.35 40.0% $85.41

2.33

COVER METER BOX HDPE 17" X 30" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SINGLE 2" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

21045100018 EACH NO BID

COVER METER BOX HDPE 17" X 30" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SINGLE 2" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

COVER METER BOX HDPE 17" X 30" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SINGLE 2" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

SP-

1730FAF1QAFA

WLI

$364.900 60.00% $145.96 

COVER METER BOX HDPE 17" X 30" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SINGLE 2" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: _DFW1730F-AF1QAF AUSTIN LID 
ONLY___________________________________

116382 $220.20 40.0% $132.12

2.34

RING & COVER MANHOLE 24" DIA SANITARY SEWER BOLTED 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

89030301003 EACH NO BID

RING & COVER MANHOLE 24" DIA SANITARY SEWER BOLTED 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________
no bid

RING & COVER MANHOLE 24" DIA SANITARY SEWER BOLTED 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

EV2438RCSAAUS $1,334.530 60.00% $533.81 

RING & COVER MANHOLE 24" DIA SANITARY SEWER BOLTED 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

2.35

ELBOW PVC SEWER SDR-26 GASKET X GASKET 45 DEG. 6" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH WW-227B)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

65941895004 EACH NO BID

ELBOW PVC SEWER SDR-26 GASKET X GASKET 45 DEG. 6" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH WW-227B)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

ELBOW PVC SEWER SDR-26 GASKET X GASKET 45 DEG. 6" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH WW-227B)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

MUL067326 $188.830 70.00% $56.65 

ELBOW PVC SEWER SDR-26 GASKET X GASKET 45 DEG. 6" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH WW-227B)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _ GPK OR PLASTIC 
TRENDS___________________________________

28584 $91.75 40% $55.05

2.36

COVER METER ROUND HDPE RETROFIT AMR/AMI, SMALL 12" 

SINGLE (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

21045100100 EACH NO BID

COVER METER ROUND HDPE RETROFIT AMR/AMI, SMALL 

12" SINGLE (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

COVER METER ROUND HDPE RETROFIT AMR/AMI, SMALL 

12" SINGLE (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

SP-

DDFW18AMRALI
D

$79.770 60.00% $31.91 

COVER METER ROUND HDPE RETROFIT AMR/AMI, SMALL 12" 

SINGLE (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

2.37

PIPE CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 6" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
WW-27C)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

89049100001 EACH NO BID

PIPE CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 6" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
WW-27C)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________ no bid

PIPE CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 6" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
WW-27C)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

AFT350PU $1,412.500 60.00% $565.00 

PIPE CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 6" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH 
WW-27C)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _ McWANE TYTON PUSH ON (SOLD IN 18' 

JOINTS)___________________________________

10457 $48.20 40% $28.92

2.38

COVER METER BOX HDPE, 21" X 14" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SMALL SINGLE LID (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

21045100012 EACH NO BID

COVER METER BOX HDPE, 21" X 14" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SMALL SINGLE LID (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: no bid

COVER METER BOX HDPE, 21" X 14" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SMALL SINGLE LID (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

SP-
DDFW37CAFAW

LID
$180.170 60.00% $72.07 

COVER METER BOX HDPE, 21" X 14" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SMALL SINGLE LID (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _DFW37C-AF1QAF AUSTIN LID 

97032 $110.15 40% $66.09

2.39

COVER METER BOX, HDPE 26" X 15" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SINGLE 1-1/2 IN (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 

21045100016 EACH NO BID

COVER METER BOX, HDPE 26" X 15" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SINGLE 1-1/2 IN (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: no bid

COVER METER BOX, HDPE 26" X 15" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SINGLE 1-1/2 IN (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 

DDFW65CAF1EQ
ALID

$320.930 60.00% $128.37 

COVER METER BOX, HDPE 26" X 15" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SINGLE 1-1/2 IN (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
145A)

MFG. NAME & NO.: __DFW1730F-AFAQAF AUSTIN LID 

NO BID $220.20 40.0% $132.12

2.40

COVER METER BOX,HDPE 18" X 17" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SMALL DOUBLE LID (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

21045100014 EACH NO BID

COVER METER BOX,HDPE 18" X 17" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SMALL DOUBLE LID (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: no bid

COVER METER BOX,HDPE 18" X 17" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SMALL DOUBLE LID (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

SP-
DDFW38CAFAW

LID
$206.630 60.00% $82.65 

COVER METER BOX,HDPE 18" X 17" RECTANGULAR 
AMR/AMI, SMALL DOUBLE LID (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-145A)
MFG. NAME & NO.: __DFW38C-AF1QAF AUSTIN LID 

97034 $116.65 40% $69.99

2.41

BALL VALVE CORPORATION STOP TAPER THREAD X 
COMPRESSION GJ 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67070109002 EACH NO BID

BALL VALVE CORPORATION STOP TAPER THREAD X 
COMPRESSION GJ 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

BALL VALVE CORPORATION STOP TAPER THREAD X 
COMPRESSION GJ 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FF10004GNL $109.580 35.00% $71.23 

BALL VALVE CORPORATION STOP TAPER THREAD X 
COMPRESSION GJ 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: __ FORD FB1000-4-G-
NL_________________________________

23975 $144.96 40.0% $86.98

2.42

BUSHING BRASS 1" X 3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

67033135003 EACH NO BID

BUSHING BRASS 1" X 3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________ no bid

BUSHING BRASS 1" X 3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

IBRLFBGF $11.970 60.00% $4.79 

BUSHING BRASS 1" X 3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: __MERIT OR 

CHARMAN__________________________________

32381 $8.25 40.0% $4.95

2.43
CAP BRASS 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67033145003 EACH NO BID
CAP BRASS 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

CAP BRASS 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

IBRLFCAPG $15.850 60.00% $6.34 
CAP BRASS 1" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: : MERIT OR 
CHARMAN____________________________________

32033 $11.85 40.0% $7.11

2.44

CONNECTORS BRASS U-BRANCH COMPRESSION 1" X 3/4" X 
3/4" MIP (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

65930401001 EACH NO BID

CONNECTORS BRASS U-BRANCH COMPRESSION 1" X 3/4" X 
3/4" MIP (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________ no bid

CONNECTORS BRASS U-BRANCH COMPRESSION 1" X 3/4" X 
3/4" MIP (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

FU4843GNL $99.790 35.00% $64.86 

CONNECTORS BRASS U-BRANCH COMPRESSION 1" X 3/4" X 
3/4" MIP (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: FORD U48-43-G-

NL____________________________________

21106 $102.79 40.0% $61.67

2.45

ELBOW BRASS 90 DEG 3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67033115010 EACH NO BID

ELBOW BRASS 90 DEG 3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

ELBOW BRASS 90 DEG 3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

IBRLF9F $14.800 60.00% $5.92 

ELBOW BRASS 90 DEG 3/4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-
68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _MERIT OR 
CHARMAN___________________________________

31306 $9.40 40.0% $5.64

2.46
FLANGE BRASS 2" WITH GASKETS, BOLTS, AND NUTS (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 

89049345011 EACH NO BID
FLANGE BRASS 2" WITH GASKETS, BOLTS, AND NUTS (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)

MFG. NAME & NO.: no bid

FLANGE BRASS 2" WITH GASKETS, BOLTS, AND NUTS (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 

A606NBMFSET $72.600 30.00% $50.82 
FLANGE BRASS 2" WITH GASKETS, BOLTS, AND NUTS (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 

NO BID X NO BID

2.47
TEE BRASS 2" X 2" X 2" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67033140013 EACH NO BID
TEE BRASS 2" X 2" X 2" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

TEE BRASS 2" X 2" X 2" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

IBRLFTK $102.180 60.00% $40.87 
TEE BRASS 2" X 2" X 2" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: MERIT OR 
CHARMAN____________________________________

30987 $66.00 40.0% $39.60

2.48

TEE CI MECH JT 12" X 12" X 4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

89049290007 EACH NO BID

TEE CI MECH JT 12" X 12" X 4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________ no bid

TEE CI MECH JT 12" X 12" X 4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

MJTLA12P $627.000 40.00% $376.20 

TEE CI MECH JT 12" X 12" X 4" (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.:SIP, STAR, SIGMA, ACCUCAST, 

TYLER____________________________________

25312 $613.08 40.0% $367.85

2.49

ELBOW BRASS 90 DEG COMP GJ X MIPT 1" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67033115003 EACH NO BID

ELBOW BRASS 90 DEG COMP GJ X MIPT 1" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

ELBOW BRASS 90 DEG COMP GJ X MIPT 1" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FL8444GNL $60.520 35.00% $39.34 

ELBOW BRASS 90 DEG COMP GJ X MIPT 1" (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _FORD L84-44-G-
NL___________________________________

33948 $61.52 40.0% $36.91

2.50

COUPLING BRASS COMP GJ X COMP GJ 3/4", STYLE C (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

67033195001 EACH NO BID

COUPLING BRASS COMP GJ X COMP GJ 3/4", STYLE C (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________ no bid

COUPLING BRASS COMP GJ X COMP GJ 3/4", STYLE C (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

FC4433GNL $40.450 35.00% $26.29 

COUPLING BRASS COMP GJ X COMP GJ 3/4", STYLE C (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-68)
MFG. NAME & NO.: __ FORD L44-33-G-

NL__________________________________

33724 $60.90 40.0% $36.54

2.51

COUPLING 1-1/2" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X 
COMPRESSION G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

65942171003 EACH NO BID

COUPLING 1-1/2" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X 
COMPRESSION G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

COUPLING 1-1/2" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X 
COMPRESSION G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FL4466GNL $215.630 35.00% $140.16 

COUPLING 1-1/2" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X 
COMPRESSION G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _ FORD L44-66-G-
NL___________________________________

NO BID $219.63 40.0% $131.78

2.52

COUPLING 1" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X COMPRESSION 

G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

65942171002 EACH NO BID

COUPLING 1" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X COMPRESSION 

G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

no bid

COUPLING 1" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X COMPRESSION 

G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FL4444GNL $67.140 35.00% $43.64 

COUPLING 1" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X COMPRESSION 

G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: FORD L44-44-G-
NL____________________________________

33836 $69.07 40.0% $41.44

2.53

COUPLING 2" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X COMPRESSION 
G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

65942171001 EACH NO BID

COUPLING 2" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X COMPRESSION 
G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

COUPLING 2" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X COMPRESSION 
G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

FL4477GNL $436.260 35.00% $283.57 

COUPLING 2" ELBOW COMPRESSION G.J. X COMPRESSION 
G.J. (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: _ FORD L44-77-G-
NL___________________________________

33885 $448.83 40.0% $269.30

2.54

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 1/2" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67052111001 EACH NO BID

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 1/2" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 1/2" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID $0.00 

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 1/2" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

2.55

COUPLING CI FLEX 2" X 2.50" X 11" FOR CI (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-271)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67052103002 EACH NO BID

COUPLING CI FLEX 2" X 2.50" X 11" FOR CI (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-271)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

COUPLING CI FLEX 2" X 2.50" X 11" FOR CI (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-271)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

SP-
S4110002500300

3

$223.280 20.00% $178.62 

COUPLING CI FLEX 2" X 2.50" X 11" FOR CI (IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SPL WW-271)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

2.56

COUPLING STL REPAIR FC 16" X 17.80" X 30" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67052125021 EACH NO BID

COUPLING STL REPAIR FC 16" X 17.80" X 30" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

COUPLING STL REPAIR FC 16" X 17.80" X 30" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

S2282017153000
0

$2,310.670 20.00% $1,848.54 

COUPLING STL REPAIR FC 16" X 17.80" X 30" (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

2.57

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 1-1/4" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67052111004 EACH NO BID

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 1-1/4" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 1-1/4" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID $0.00 

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 1-1/4" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271)

MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

2.58

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 3/4" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271) 
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

67052111002 EACH NO BID

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 3/4" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271) 
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________ no bid

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 3/4" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER 
(IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271) 
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID $0.00 

COUPLING STL. PIPE REPAIR 3/4" STL PIPE, BLACK DRESSER (IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL WW-271) 
MFG. NAME & NO.: 
____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

2.59

COUPLING, PIPE TRANSITION REPAIR, BOLTED, WELDED 
STEEL D.I.-P.C.P,  20" X 15" LONG, O.D. RANGE 1END: 21.96-
22.14/2 END 21.50-21.68, SMITH-BLAIR #413-2206-2160-705 
or BUYER  APPROVED EQUAL (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

67052651002 EACH NO BID

COUPLING, PIPE TRANSITION REPAIR, BOLTED, WELDED 
STEEL D.I.-P.C.P,  20" X 15" LONG, O.D. RANGE 1END: 21.96-
22.14/2 END 21.50-21.68, SMITH-BLAIR #413-2206-2160-705 
or BUYER  APPROVED EQUAL (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________ no bid

COUPLING, PIPE TRANSITION REPAIR, BOLTED, WELDED 
STEEL D.I.-P.C.P,  20" X 15" LONG, O.D. RANGE 1END: 21.96-
22.14/2 END 21.50-21.68, SMITH-BLAIR #413-2206-2160-705 
or BUYER  APPROVED EQUAL (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

SP-
S4105000063973

2
$2,307.100 20.00% $1,845.68 

COUPLING, PIPE TRANSITION REPAIR, BOLTED, WELDED 
STEEL D.I.-P.C.P,  20" X 15" LONG, O.D. RANGE 1END: 21.96-
22.14/2 END 21.50-21.68, SMITH-BLAIR #413-2206-2160-705 
or BUYER  APPROVED EQUAL (IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 
WW-271)
MFG. NAME & NO.: 

____________________________________

NO BID X NO BID

TOTAL = $10,867.03 $6,083.50 

ITEM NO. PERCENTAGE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE
CATALOG OPTIONS CATALOG OPTIONS CATALOG OPTIONS

1.01
_____    

30%_______%
MSRP/Pricing 

Discount

1.02
______25______

%
Discount from 

MSRP

1.03 ____30____%
Discount from 

MSRP

1.04
_____  

25_______%
Discount from 

MSRP

1.05
_____5$_______

%
Discount from 

MSRP

1.06
_____20%_____

__%
Discount from 

MSRP

____0________% Discount from MSRP

_____no bid_______%

COUPLINGS AND ACCESSORIES

_____35_______% Discount from MSRP

_____20_______% Discount from MSRP

_____no bid_______%

_____no bid_______%

PERCENTAGE

Discount from MSRP

Discount from MSRP

MSRP/Pricing Discount

Discount from MSRP

Discount from MSRP

____________% Discount from MSRP

______60______% Discount from MSRP

CATALOG OPTIONS

Percentage discount off catalog/price list: Indicate the discount (plus or minus) percentage from Manufacturer's Suggested Retail 
Price.

DELIVERY TERMS:  DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

Other:

Other:

Other:

Discount from MSRP

Discount from MSRP

UNIT OF MEASURE PERCENTAGE UNIT OF MEASURE

_____0_______% MSRP/Pricing Discount

____________%

Other:

Other:

PERCENTAGE

_____no bid_______%

WATER AND SEWER PIPE AND ACCESSORIES (PVC, HDPE, ETC.)

BRASS AND ACCESSORIES

Section 2: Discounts to Catalog Items

The Contractor shall provide lists of available manufacturer, vendor, and/or other item catalog parts available to the City. The City understands that Contractors may change qualifying part manufacturers throughout a contract term and catalog lists can be added or removed as needed. The City does not guarantee the purchase of any products from catalog lists included with the offer.

Provide a minimum discount that covers all catalog items offered by the Contractor. A bid of zero ('0') or blank entry will be interpreted by the City that the catalog items will be sold at the Manufacturer's Suggested Retail Price.  A 'no bid' will be interpreted by the City that your Company does not wish to bid this solicitation. 

In addition to the minimum discount above, please provide a list of any additional item catalog or product names your Company can provide the City and the discount of the listed catalog prices if different than the minimum discount percentage previously listed. Attach an additional page(s) to this Price Sheet if additional catalog item lists exceeds the spaces provided.

Discount is a firm fixed throughout the life of the contract. 

MSRP/Pricing Discount

UNIT OF MEASURE

____0________%

____0________% Discount from MSRP

____0________% Discount from MSRP

____0________% Discount from MSRP

____0________% Discount from MSRP

_____no bid_______%

______no bid______%
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BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

WATER SYSTEM FITTINGS AND ACCESSORIES (PARTS)  
 Bid Tab

Award Method

Notates Award by Line 

Prepared by: Julia Ramirez

Approved By: Ajani Aird

Delivery Method: _______________________________________________________________________________________
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