City of Austin Purchasing Office — Log of Offers Received

Solicitation Number:

@ IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on D

the following bid sheets are for information only
and does not constitute actual award/execution
of a contract.

Vendor Name

IFB 2200 JCH1000

RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall
remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of
offers is for information purposes only and does not
constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by:
Phone - 512-974-2500

Email - Purchinfo@austintexas.gov

Physical Address — 124 W. 8th St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701

Date Received

Hours of Operation — Monday-Friday 7:45 a.m. to 4:45 p.m.

Type of Response No Bid

(eResponse / Physical)

-_—

Municipal Valves & Equipment Cao. Inc. 9/27/22

Ol

N

LG Space Engineering Corp

9/29/22

eRespaonse

eResponse

o|1o0({0|0(0]0]|0

< Julia Rami

This certifies the response was received prior to the solicitation closing.

Revised 07/2020
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PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
AIR CUSHION SWING CHECK VALVES & REPAIR SERVICES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 2200 JCH1000

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this price sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the price sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize
acceptance of your Offer.

The quantities listed are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less.
Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be
interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of
the bid.

Prices offered on the price sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, insurance, overhead, per
diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. All deliveries shall be FOB
Destination.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or
combination deemed most advantageous to the City.

CATEGORY 1 - SPECIFIED ITEMS

ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL MUE'ﬂ;S:E QUANITY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

1 f{;‘g’g?& ;bﬁl';(&\gvr %‘:;:r\z\i';fc;v’*eigg:ig?”ed; Mfg. Crispin SWCB1-LW-AC Each 19 $10,187.00 $193,553.00
2 i;:?g?& ;b%f(vfr"gz\; Qixﬁgforcggeé’qggﬁc" Valve; Mig.: | o icpin SWC81-LW-AC Each 8 $16,598.00 $132,784.00
3 lggg?ggzz;?}('?i‘f’"B’“L;Sf;’;t’;fl‘iggzzzl\f alve; Mfg:: | rispin SWC101-LW-AC Each 2 $19,445.00 $38,890.00
4 ggg?ggzbﬁvl\{(;Agr'?é‘j;‘ie?’fspﬂzzk g;&‘;‘f Mfg.: Crispin SWC121-LW-AC Each 16 $22,287.00 $356,592.00
5 X;gg?gjz';ﬁ(/?i;'rc,,‘éﬂ;gpz‘;;‘c’)"\ilr;% %';i‘:},va"’e; Mig-> | Crispin SWC141-LW-AC Each 1 $28,025.00 $28,025.00
6 ;gggfgg\zi'ﬁé\igf,,‘éf;;”i%;‘(’)"\i/r;% CE';?J‘;'T,,V"""G; Mg | crispin SWC161-LW-AC Each 1 $26,933.00 $26,933.00
7 iggg?g:zﬂﬁé\igf,,‘éf;;”ii;‘(’)"\ilr;% %';i‘;'f,,va"’e; Mfg-: | crispin SWC201-LW-AC Each 2 $42,268.00 $84,536.00
8 i‘;gg?ggzzLR?Kfi;'rc,,‘éﬂ;g:‘zi;‘(’J"\i]r;% %';‘z‘;'f,,va"’e; Mig- | crispin SWC241-LW-AC Each 2 $57,442.00 $114,884.00

SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = $976,197.00
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PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
AIR CUSHION SWING CHECK VALVES & REPAIR SERVICES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 2200 JCH1000

CATEGORY 2 - HOURLY LABOR RATE

The rates listed below shall not include a separate charge for administrative, overhead, per diem, and transportation (i.e. travel time, mileage, and fuel) costs. These expenses shall be
included in the rates provided and shall not be paid separately.

ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIM':I;EL?R';NNUAL HOURLY RATE EXTENDED PRICE
9 Repair services during normal business hours, defined as Monday through Friday 7:00 am - 6:00 pm 40 $250.00 $10,000.00
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2 = $10,000.00

CATEGORY 3 - MARKUP TO COSTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED MATERIALS
The City estimates an annual spending need of $10,000 for materials to complete these repair services.

Offeror shall be able to provide materials to complete the repairs. The percentage markup to costs listed shall be the maximum amount offered for the category line throughout the term of
the contract including any subsequent renewal periods, and are not subject to change. The invoice prices for these materials shall be based off a markup to costs paid by the offeror as
indicated below. The percentage markup given should take into all costs (administrative, overhead, shipping charges, etc.) to deliver the parts to the Austin, TX area. These costs shall be
factored into the markup to costs rates and shall not be paid separately. Markup to costs shall be expressed in numerical terms and not exceed 20%. A bid of '0' (zero) or left blank will
be interpreted by the City as a zero percent markup to the City.

The annual spending need amount is an estimate and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City reserves the right to purchase more or less of these quantities as may be required during
the contract Term. Quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

ESTIMATED ANNUAL PERCENTAGE
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MATERIAL SPEND MARKUP EXTENDED PRICE
Markup to Costs for all related Swing Check Valve - Air Cushioned Materials and associated
10 Components off catalogue/price list or related items (not to exceed 20%) $10,000.00 20.00% $12,000.00
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 3 = $12,000.00

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1 THRU 3 =|$998,197.00
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PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
AIR CUSHION SWING CHECK VALVES & REPAIR SERVICES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 2200 JCH1000

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this price sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the price sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize
acceptance of your Offer.

The quantities listed are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less.
Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be
interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of

the bid.

Prices offered on the price sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, insurance, overhead, per

diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. All deliveries shall be FOB

Destination.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or
combination deemed most advantageous to the City.

CATEGORY 1 - SPECIFIED ITEMS

ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL MUE'\{SFS;E QUANITY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
CVS 6, 6000 A
6" 6000A FLG L&W Check Valve, Air-Cushioned; Mfg.: F1,DI,DI,S11-ALB-
1 APCO/DeZURIK: or "Buyer Approved Equal” APCO/DeZURIK NBR.DTR. Each 19 $6,947.00 $131,993.00
L41LD1"LW,SELL22
o 4 Check Val . CVS 8, 6000 A
8" 6000A FLG CVS L&W Air-Cushioned Check Valve; Mfg.: F1,DI,DI,S11-ALB-
2 APCO/DeZURIK: or "Buyer Approved Equal” APCO/DeZURIK NBR.DTR. Each 8 $8,484.00 $67,872.00
L41LD1"LW,SELL22
o 4 Check Val . CVS 10, 6000 A
10" 6000A FLG L&W Air-Cushioned Check Valve; Mfg.: F1,DI,DI,S11-ALB-
3 APCO/DeZURIK: or "Buyer Approved Equal” APCO/DeZURIK NBR.DTR. Each 2 $10,635.00 $21,270.00
L41LD1"LW,SELL22
CVS 12, 6000 A
12" 6000A L&W Air-Cushioned Check Valve; Mfg.: F1,DI,DI,S11-ALB-
4 APCO/DeZURIK: or "Buyer Approved Equal” APCO/DeZURIK NBR.DTR. Each 16 $219,984.00 $3,519,744.00
L41LD1"LW,SELL22
o d heck Val . CVS 14, 6000 A
14" 6000A FLG Air-Cushioned Swing Check Valve; Mfg.: F1,DI,DI,S11-ALB-
5 APCO/DeZURIK: or "Buyer Approved Equal® APCO/DeZURIK NBR.DTR. Each 1 $19,857.00 $19,857.00
L41LD1"LW,SELL22
CVS 16, 6000 A
16" 6000A FLG Air-Cushioned Swing Check Valve; Mfg.: F1,DI,DI,S11-ALB-
6 APCO/DeZURIK: or "Buyer Approved Equal” APCO/DeZURIK NBR.DTR. Each 1 $25,577.00 $25,577.00
L41LD1"LW,SELL22
CVS 20, 6000 A
20" 6000A FLG Air-Cushioned Swing Check Valve; Mfg.: F1,DI,DI,S11-ALB-
7 APCO/DeZURIK: or "Buyer Approved Equal” APCO/DeZURIK NBR.DTR. Each 2 $34,892.00 $69,784.00
L41LD1"LW,SELL22
_ ] ] CVS 24, 6000 A
8 24" 6000A FLG Air-Cushioned Swing Check Valve; Mfg.: APCO/DeZURIK F1,DI,DI,S11-ALB- Each 2 $43,556.00 $87,112.00

APCO/DeZURIK; or "Buyer Approved Equal”

NBR,DTR-
L41LD1"LW SELL22

SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 =

$3,875,337.00
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PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
AIR CUSHION SWING CHECK VALVES & REPAIR SERVICES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 2200 JCH1000

CATEGORY 2 - HOURLY LABOR RATE

The rates listed below shall not include a separate charge for administrative, overhead, per diem, and transportation (i.e. travel time, mileage, and fuel) costs. These expenses shall be
included in the rates provided and shall not be paid separately.

ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIM?_BESR'@NNUAL HOURLY RATE EXTENDED PRICE
9 Repair services during normal business hours, defined as Monday through Friday 7:00 am - 6:00 pm 40 $80.00 $3,200.00
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2 = $3,200.00

CATEGORY 3 - MARKUP TO COSTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED MATERIALS
The City estimates an annual spending need of $10,000 for materials to complete these repair services.

Offeror shall be able to provide materials to complete the repairs. The percentage markup to costs listed shall be the maximum amount offered for the category line throughout the term of
the contract including any subsequent renewal periods, and are not subject to change. The invoice prices for these materials shall be based off a markup to costs paid by the offeror as
indicated below. The percentage markup given should take into all costs (administrative, overhead, shipping charges, etc.) to deliver the parts to the Austin, TX area. These costs shall be
factored into the markup to costs rates and shall not be paid separately. Markup to costs shall be expressed in numerical terms and not exceed 20%. A bid of '0' (zero) or left blank will
be interpreted by the City as a zero percent markup to the City.

The annual spending need amount is an estimate and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City reserves the right to purchase more or less of these quantities as may be required during
the contract Term. Quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

ESTIMATED ANNUAL PERCENTAGE
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MATERIAL SPEND MARKUP EXTENDED PRICE
Markup to Costs for all related Swing Check Valve - Air Cushioned Materials and associated
10 Components off catalogue/price list or related items (not to exceed 20%) $10,000.00 1000.00% $110,000.00
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 3 = $110,000.00

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1 THRU 3 =|$3,988,537.00
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