City of Austin

Purchasing Office
P.O. Box 1088, Austin, TX 78767

12/8/2021

Ice Works, LP

Aric Jordan

CEO

9224 Research Blvd
Austin, Texas, 78758

Subject: Recommendation for Award of IFB 1500 AMA1066, Industrial Grade Ice Coolers and
Ice Bags solicitation

Dear Ice Works, LP:
Thank you for your response to the IFB 1500 AMA1066 Industrial Grade Ice Coolers and
Ice Bags solicitation for the City of Austin. IFB: Purchasing staff has completed their

evaluation and has recommended award to Ice Works, LP.

Thank you for your continued interest in doing business with the City of Austin. A copy of the
final bid tab is attached for your review.

Sincerely,

Ajani Aird

Procurement Specialist Il
City of Austin
Purchasing Office
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City of Austin Purchasing Office — Log of Offers Received

Solicitation Number: |FB 1500 AMA1066

CX IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on D
the following bid sheets are for information only
and does not constitute actual award/execution
of a contract.

Vendor Name

RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall
remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of
offers is for information purposes only and does not
constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by:
Phone - 512-974-2500

Email - Purchinfo@austintexas.gov

Physical Address — 124 W. 8th St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701

Date Received

Hours of Operation — Monday-Friday 7:45 a.m. to 4:45 p.m.

Type of Response No Bid

(eResponse / Physical)

1 Line Drive Logistics LLC

11/30/2021

eResponse =

2. lce Works

11/15/2021

Physical

o|1o0({0|0(0]0]|0

><_Jacqueline Jaimes

This certifies the response was received prior to the solicitation closing.

Revised 07/2020
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CITY OF AUSTIN
PRICE SHEET

INDUSTRIAL-GRADE ICE COOLERS AND ICE BAGS
SOLICITATION NUMBER: IFB 1500 AMA1066

larger or smaller quantities.

the Austin, Texas, area.

Special Instructions: A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of 'no bid' will be interpreted by the City that the responder does not wish to bid on that item.
Be advised that a 'no bid' may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

The quantities noted below are annual estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical usage. Actual purchases may be for

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be inclusive of all fees. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, or shipping and transportation (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver the items to

Vendor Ice Works, LP Line Drive Logistics LLC
Local Presence (Y/N)
MBE/WBE
Estimated A |
Item No. Item Description Unit stimate . nnua Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Quantity
Monthly Rental Fee for Outdoor 60 Cubic feet Industrial-Grade Ice
48 0 X 12,000.00
! Coolers (4 Ice Coolers x 12 months = estimated annual quantity 48) Months 50 $ $250.00 $
Ice Bags
300,000 . 66,000.00 . 79,500.00
2 (Unit Price provided shall be Per pound) Pounds 0.22 $ 50.265 $
Service charge for Additional Ice Bag Delivery Trips
12 0 X 420.00
3 (Outside of the Regular Delivery Schedule) EA 50 $ $35.00 3
Total Extended Price: $66,000.00 $91,920.00
DELIVERY METHOD: O COMMON CARRIER X VENDOR DELIVERY [0 COMMON DELIVERY X VENDOR DELIVERY

COMPANY NAME: _lIce Works, LP

COMPANY EMAIL: __Line Drive Logistics LLC

EMAIL ADDRESS: __aric@austiniceworks.com

EMAIL ADDRESS: __daniel.bessman@gmail.com

Award

Prepared by:

Approved by:

Ice Works, LP

Jacqueline Jaimes

Ajani Aird




CITY OF AUSTIN
PRICE SHEET
INDUSTRIAL-GRADE ICE COOLERS AND ICE BAGS
SOLICITATION NUMBER: IFB 1500 AMA1060 VERSION 1.1

Special Instructions: A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that
item. A bid of 'no bid' will be interpreted by the City that the responder does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised that a 'no bid' may be
considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

The quantities noted below are annual estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the
guantities listed. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical usage. Actual purchases may be for larger or smaller quantities.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be inclusive of all fees. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem,
or shipping and transportation (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver the items to the Austin, Texas, area.

. . Estimated Annual L. .
Item No. Item Description Unit . Unit Price Extended Price
Quantity

Monthly Rental Fee for Outdoor 60 Cubic feet
1 Industrial-Grade Ice Coolers (4 Ice Coolers x 12 Months 48 S 250.00 | $ 12,000.00
months = estimated annual quantity 48)

Ice Bags
2 Pound 300,000 0.265 79,500.00
(Unit Price provided shall be Per pound) ounds S S

Service charge for Additional Ice Bag Delivery Trips

12 . 420.00
3 (Outside of the Regular Delivery Schedule) EA > 35.00 |5

Total Extended Price:| $ 91,920.00

DELIVERY METHOD: [0 COMMON CARRIER 00 VENDOR DELIVERY

COMPANY NAME: Line Drive Logistics

EMAIL ADDRESS: daniel.bessman@gmail.com




*** Note: Unit Price of $250.00 per cooler unit per month includes 1) monthly cooler rental fee; 2) initial cooler delivery fee; and 3) all weekly ice de






livery fees.



CITY OF AUSTIN
PRICE SHEET
INDUSTRIAL-GRADE ICE COOLERS AND ICE BAGS
SOLICITATION NUMBER: IFB 1500 AMA1066

Special Instructions: A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item.
A bid of 'no bid' will be interpreted by the City that the responder does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised that a 'no bid" may be
considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

The quantities noted below are annual estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the
quantities listed. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical usage. Actual purchases may be for larger or smaller quantities.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be inclusive of all fees. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, or
shipping and transportation (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver the items to the Austin, Texas, area.

j A I
Item No. Item Description Unit A YT Unit Price Extended Price
Quantity

Monthly Rental Fee for Outdoor 60 Cubic feet Industrial-
1 Grade Ice Coolers (4 Ice Coolers x 12 months = Months 48 0 0
estimated annual quantity 48)

lce Bags
300,000 . 66000
2 (Unit Price provided shall be Per pound) Foungs 0.22
3 Service charge for Additional Ice Bag Delivery Trips EA 12 0 0
(Outside of the Regular Delivery Schedule)
Total Extended Price: 66000
DELIVERY METHOD: 0 COMMON CARRIER X VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: Ice Works, LP

EMAIL ADDRESS: aric@austiniceworks.com
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