City of Austin

Purchasing Office
P.O. Box 1088, Austin, TX 78767

10/14/2021

Recommendation for Award of IFB 1100 CSZ1002, CAPACITOR BANKS & ASSOCIATED
PARTS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

Purchasing staff has completed their evaluation and has recommended award of lines 2 and 5
to Techline, Inc. and lines 1, 3 and 4 to Wesco Distribution, Inc.

Cedric Zachary

Procurement Specialist |1

(5612) 978-1528
cedric.zachary@austintexas.gov
City of Austin

Purchasing Office
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CITY OF AUSTIN
BID TABULATION

CAPACITOR BANKS & ASSOCIATED PARTS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

No.

IFB 1100 CSZ1003

R¥ No.

RQM 1100 21061500859

Opening Date:

9/15 /2021

Cedsiz Zachary

|§uvu-.
pecial T foms: [If necessary]

|Receipt No.

1 Z

Vendor Name

Techline Inc Wifesco Distribution, Ine.

Local Presence (¥/N)

Y Y

MBE /WBE.

MNone MNone

ITEM NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST Lead Time
oty |"MT s UNIT Lead Tirae UNIT

PRICE ‘TOTAL PRICE (Drays) PRICE ‘TOTAL PRICE

CAPACITOR, DISTRIBUTION, 200 KVAR, 72007,
SINGLE PHASE, 60 HERT'Z, ALLFILM, TWO
BUSHING, 95KV BIL. ON QUALIFIED
PRODUCTS LIST EL-928. AS PER
SPECIFICATION E-1105

160 EA Mo Bid 180 $756.00 $120,960.00

TRANSFORMER, FIXED LOAD, POLE MOUNT, 1
KVA, 7200 VOLT PRIMARY, 130 VOLT
SECONDARY, NEUTRAL BUSHING, SINGLE
PRIMARY BUSHING, SINGLE HANGER
BRACKET, LIGHTNING ARRESTERS
MOUNTED ON SIDE OF TANK, SHALL BE IN
ACCORDANCE WITH E-1806. Transformer shall
have NO-PCBs. THIS ITEM WILL BEUSED AS A
SPARE PART FOR AE ITEM # 19562

W | EA 210 $825.00 $24,750.00 180 $2,075.00 $191,250.00

CAPACITOR BANK PRE-ASSY 1200 KVAR 7200
VOLT, 15KV INSULATION CALSS 95 BIL, 60 HZ
PER AE SPECIFICATION E-1630

15 | EA Mo Bid $12,750.00 $191,250.00

CAPACITOR CONTROLLER WITH TIME,
TEMPERATURE, VOLTAGE, CURRENT, AND
KVAR CONTROL IN ACCORDANCE WITH
SPECIFICATION E-1630. SEESECTION 3.9

00 | Ea Mo Bid 365 $2,900.00 $290,000,00

LINEFOST CURRENT SENSOR, 15 KV,
COMPATIBLE WITH WARCOM 2500 SERIES
CAPACITOR CONTROLLER, NO LINE CUTTING
OR DEAD ENDING IS REQUIRED,
MAINTENANCEFREE, < 15 LBS, 15FT FIGTAIL
CABLE MAX OPERATING VOLTAGE TO
GROUND 9.5 KV 60 HZ DRY FLASHOVER 80 KV
50 HZ WET FLASHOVER 55KV IMPULSE
FLASHOVER (POSITIVE) 105 KV IMFUISE.
FLASHOVER (NEGATIVE) 130 KV IMPUSE
WITHSTAND 95 KV RADIO INFLUENCE TEST
VOLTAGE 10 K¥ DRY ARCING DISTANCE 6.5
IN LEAKAGE DISTANCE 11 IN CANTILEVER
STRENGTH 2000 SENSITIVITY (A / OUTFUT V)
SDA [/ VAC @60 HZ CALIBRATION ACCURACY
AT 120 A 1% LINEARITY ERROR, % CHANGE
IN SENSITIVITY < 1% (3-1200 &) ANGLE
ERROR, 3-600 4, CHANGE IN DEGREES < 5
DEGREES TEMPERATURE ERROR CHANGE IN
SENSITIVITY +/- 02% / DEGREEES CELSIUS
USED WITH ITEM #22945 - CAPACITOR
CONTROL
TIME/TEME /¥ OLT/CURRENT/KVAR

00 Ea T $B60.00 $56,000.00 150 $910.00 $91,000.00

ANTENNA, 3DB, 900 MHZ, N MALE
CONNECTOR, UV STAELE POLYCARBONATE
BASE, RATED FOR OUTDOOR USE, MOLDED
MAKROLON POLYCARBONATE BASE,
RADIATOR IS STAINLESS STEEL ROD WITH
CHROME FINISH, NICKEL PLATED BRASS
BUSHING Used with item # 22945 - CAPACITOR,
CONTROL
‘TIME/TEMP /Y OLT/CURRENT/KVAR

100 EA Mo Bid No Bid

TOTAL BID

$110,750.00 $602,210.00

Hote:
Avrard Method:

Puspared By:
Approved By:

Lie by line

Adrministrative staff
Cedsiz Zachary

C Treownomm awa
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City of Austin Purchasing Office — Log of Offers Received

Solicitation Number: |FB 1100 CSZ1002

K] IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on
the following bid sheets are for information only
and does not constitute actual award/execution
of a contract.

Vendor Name

O

RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall
remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of
offers is for information purposes only and does not
constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by:
Phone - 512-974-2500

Email - Purchinfo@austintexas.gov

Physical Address — 124 W. 8th St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701

Date Received

Hours of Operation — Monday-Friday 7:45 a.m. to 4:45 p.m.

Type of Response No Bid

(eResponse / Physical)

1. Techline Inc.

9/29/2021

eResponse =

, Wesco Distribution, Inc.

10/5/2021

eResponse

o|1o0({0|0(0]0]|0

>< Julia Ramirez

This certifies the response was received prior to the solicitation closing.

Revised 07/2020
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BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE

CAPACITOR BANKS & ASSOCIATED PARTS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 1100 CSZ1002

RX NO.:

OPENING DATE:

RQM 1100 21061500869
9/15/2021

BUYER: Cedric Zachary
BIDDERS SHALL ENTER THE PROPOSED MANUFACTURER AND PART NUMBER IN THE SPACE PROVIDED.
w0 THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES**#x
NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.
ITEM AE EST. LEAD
STOCK ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M TIME UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE
NO. QTY.
NO. (days)

CAPACITOR, DISTRIBUTION, 200 KVAR, 7200V, SINGLE PHASE, 60 HERTZ, ALL FILM, TWO BUSHING,
95KV BIL. ON QUALIFIED PRODUCTS LIST EL-928. AS PER SPECIFICATION E-1105
THIS ITEM REQUIRES STOCKING AND DELIVERY WITHIN (2) CALENDAR DAYS

001 1730 160 EA NO BID -
APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. ABB / 2GUA072200D220
MFG P/N
TRANSFORMER, FIXED LOAD, POLE MOUNT, 1 KVA, 7200 VOLT PRIMARY, 120 VOLT SECONDARY,
NEUTRAL BUSHING, SINGLE PRIMARY BUSHING, SINGLE HANGER BRACKET, LIGHTNING ARRESTERS
MOUNTED ON SIDE OF TANK, SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH E-1806. Transformer shall have NO-PCBs.

002 15523 THIS ITEM WILL BE USED AS A SPARE PART FOR AE ITEM # 19562 30 EA 210 $825.00 $24.750.00

ABB / 1007200AAB-A04

APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. HOWARD INDUS / 1001-493748-000
MFG Howard Industries P/N  [1001-493748-000
CAPACITOR BANK PRE-ASSY 1200 KVAR 7200 VOLT, 15KV INSULATION CALSS 95 BIL, 60 HZ PER AE
SPECIFICATION E-1630
THIS ITEM REQUIRES STOCKING AND DELIVERY WITHIN (2) CALENDAR DAYS

003 19562 15 EA NO BID -
APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. ABB /2GUP124120H3713
MFG P/N
CAPACITOR CONTROLLER WITH TIME, TEMPERATURE, VOLTAGE, CURRENT, AND KVAR CONTROL IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPECIFICATION E-1630. SEE SECTION 3.9
THIS ITEM REQUIRES STOCKING AND DELIVERY WITHIN (2) CALENDAR DAYS

004 22945 100 EA NO BID -
APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. HD ELECTRIC / VCC2616N058
MFG P/N

Section 0600
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BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE

CAPACITOR BANKS & ASSOCIATED PARTS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

005 | 23386

LINE POST CURRENT SENSOR, 15 KV, COMPATIBLE WITH VARCOM 2600 SERIES CAPACITOR
CONTROLLER, NO LINE CUTTING OR DEAD ENDING IS REQUIRED, MAINTENANCE FREE, < 15 LBS, 15FT
PIGTAIL CABLE MAX OPERATING VOLTAGE TO GROUND 9.5 KV 60 HZ DRY FLASHOVER 80 KV 60 HZ
WET FLASHOVER 55KV IMPULSE FLASHOVER (POSITIVE) 105 KV IMPULSE FLASHOVER (NEGATIVE) 130
KV IMPUSE WITHSTAND 95 KV RADIO INFLUENCE TEST VOLTAGE 10 KV DRY ARCING DISTANCE 6.5 IN
LEAKAGE DISTANCE 11 IN CANTILEVER STRENGTH 2000 SENSITIVITY (A / OUTPUT V) 60A / VAC @ 60 HZ
CALIBRATION ACCURACY AT 120 A 1% LINEARITY ERROR, % CHANGE IN SENSITIVITY < 1% (3-1200 A)
ANGLE ERROR, 3-600 A, CHANGE IN DEGREES < .5 DEGREES TEMPERATURE ERROR CHANGE IN
SENSITIVITY +/- .02 % / DEGREEES CELSIUS USED WITH ITEM #22945 - CAPACITOR CONTROL
TIME/TEMP/VOLT/CURRENT/KVAR

APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. HD ELECT/FP / 1301-17A-15

MFG HD ELECT/FP P/N  |1301-17A-15

100

EA 70

$860.00

$86,000.00

006 | 23387

ANTENNA, 3DB, 900 MHZ, N MALE CONNECTOR, UV STABLE POLYCARBONATE BASE, RATED FOR
OUTDOOR USE, MOLDED MAKROLON POLYCARBONATE BASE, RADIATOR IS STAINLESS STEEL ROD
WITH CHROME FINISH, NICKEL PLATED BRASS BUSHING Used with item # 22945 - CAPACITOR, CONTROL
TIME/TEMP/VOLT/CURRENT/KVAR

APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. PCTEL / MN9153

MFG P/N

100

EA

NO BID

TOTAL BID

$110,750.00

Section 0600
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BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
CAPACITOR BANKS & ASSOCIATED PARTS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

AE
ILEM STOCK |[The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above. % MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE
) NO.
The City may purchase additional related items that are available from the Contractor in various quantities. Pricing
010 N for these non-specified items will be calculated based on a percentage markup over Contractors cost as identified 250
ON€ lin the Price Sheet under the Non-Specified Parts Section. Respondents shall provide a percentage markup °
over cost in the field provided.
DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED
DELIVERY METHOD: COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS) X  VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: Techline Inc

Section 0600 Page 3 of 6




BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE

CAPACITOR BANKS & ASSOCIATED PARTS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 1100 CSZ1002

RX NO.:

OPENING DATE:

BUYER:

RQM 1100 21061500869
9/15/2021
Cedric Zachary

BIDDERS SHALL ENTER THE PROPOSED MANUFACTURER AND PART NUMBER IN THE SPACE PROVIDED.

**THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES**+*+*

NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.

ITEM
NO.

AE
STOCK
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST.
QTY.

UM

LEAD
TIME
(days)

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE

001

1730

CAPACITOR, DISTRIBUTION, 200 KVAR, 7200V, SINGLE PHASE, 60 HERTZ, ALL FILM, TWO BUSHING,
95KV BIL. ON QUALIFIED PRODUCTS LIST EL-928. AS PER SPECIFICATION E-1105
THIS ITEM REQUIRES STOCKING AND DELIVERY WITHIN (2) CALENDAR DAYS

APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. ABB / 2GUA072200D220

MFG ABB P/N  [2GUA072200F220

160

EA

180

$756.00

$120,960.00

002

15523

TRANSFORMER, FIXED LOAD, POLE MOUNT, 1 KVA, 7200 VOLT PRIMARY, 120 VOLT SECONDARY,
NEUTRAL BUSHING, SINGLE PRIMARY BUSHING, SINGLE HANGER BRACKET, LIGHTNING ARRESTERS
MOUNTED ON SIDE OF TANK, SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH E-1806. Transformer shall have NO-PCBs.
THIS ITEM WILL BE USED AS A SPARE PART FOR AE ITEM # 19562

ABB / 1007200AAB-A04

APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. HOWARD INDUS / 1001-493748-000

MFG |ABB P/N |M1007200AAB-A12

30

EA

180

$2,075.00

$62,250.00

003

19562

CAPACITOR BANK PRE-ASSY 1200 KVAR 7200 VOLT, 15KV INSULATION CALSS 95 BIL, 60 HZ PER AE
SPECIFICATION E-1630
THIS ITEM REQUIRES STOCKING AND DELIVERY WITHIN (2) CALENDAR DAYS

APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. ABB / 2GUP124120H3713

MFG |ABB P/N |ZGUP124120H3713

15

EA

180

$12,750.00

$191,250.00

004

22945

CAPACITOR CONTROLLER WITH TIME, TEMPERATURE, VOLTAGE, CURRENT, AND KVAR CONTROL IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPECIFICATION E-1630. SEE SECTION 3.9
THIS ITEM REQUIRES STOCKING AND DELIVERY WITHIN (2) CALENDAR DAYS

APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. HD ELECTRIC / VCC2616N058

MFG HD ELECTRIC P/N  [VCC2616N058

100

EA

365

$2,900.00

$290,000.00

Section 0600
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BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE

CAPACITOR BANKS & ASSOCIATED PARTS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

005 | 23386

LINE POST CURRENT SENSOR, 15 KV, COMPATIBLE WITH VARCOM 2600 SERIES CAPACITOR
CONTROLLER, NO LINE CUTTING OR DEAD ENDING IS REQUIRED, MAINTENANCE FREE, < 15 LBS, 15FT
PIGTAIL CABLE MAX OPERATING VOLTAGE TO GROUND 9.5 KV 60 HZ DRY FLASHOVER 80 KV 60 HZ
WET FLASHOVER 55KV IMPULSE FLASHOVER (POSITIVE) 105 KV IMPULSE FLASHOVER (NEGATIVE) 130
KV IMPUSE WITHSTAND 95 KV RADIO INFLUENCE TEST VOLTAGE 10 KV DRY ARCING DISTANCE 6.5 IN
LEAKAGE DISTANCE 11 IN CANTILEVER STRENGTH 2000 SENSITIVITY (A/ OUTPUT V) 60A / VAC @ 60 HZ
CALIBRATION ACCURACY AT 120 A 1% LINEARITY ERROR, % CHANGE IN SENSITIVITY < 1% (3-1200 A)
ANGLE ERROR, 3-600 A, CHANGE IN DEGREES < .5 DEGREES TEMPERATURE ERROR CHANGE IN
SENSITIVITY +/- .02 % / DEGREEES CELSIUS USED WITH ITEM #22945 - CAPACITOR CONTROL
TIME/TEMP/VOLT/CURRENT/KVAR

APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. HD ELECT/FP / 1301-17A-15

MFG FISHER PIERCE / ABB P/N  [1301-17A-15

100

EA

150

$910.00

$91,000.00

006 | 23387

ANTENNA, 3DB, 900 MHZ, N MALE CONNECTOR, UV STABLE POLYCARBONATE BASE, RATED FOR
OUTDOOR USE, MOLDED MAKROLON POLYCARBONATE BASE, RADIATOR IS STAINLESS STEEL ROD
WITH CHROME FINISH, NICKEL PLATED BRASS BUSHING Used with item # 22945 - CAPACITOR, CONTROL
TIME/TEMP/VOLT/CURRENT/KVAR

APPROVED MANUFACTURER / Part No. PCTEL / MN9153

MFG P/N

100

EA

no bid

TOTAL BID

$755,460.00

Section 0600
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BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE

CAPACITOR BANKS & ASSOCIATED PARTS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

AE
ILI(E)M STOCK |The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above. % MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE
) NO.
The City may purchase additional related items that are available from the Contractor in various quantities. Pricing
010 N for these non-specified items will be calculated based on a percentage markup over Contractors cost as identified o
ON€ i the Price Sheet under the Non-Specified Parts Section. Respondents shall provide a percentage markup 0
over cost in the field provided.
DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED
DELIVERY METHOD: X COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS) VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: POWER SUPPLY

Section 0600
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