City of Austin

Purchasing Office
P.O. Box 1088, Austin, TX 78767

November 02, 2021

Recommendation for Award of IFB 2400 BJT1027, Traffic Signal Grounding Plaes

Purchasing staff has completed their evaluation and has recommended award to KBS
Electrical Distributors.

Bartley Tyler

Procurement Specialist Il
512-974-2023
bartley.tyler@austintexas.gov
City of Austin

Purchasing Office
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CITY OF AUSTIN
BID TABULATION
TRAFFIC SIGNAL GROUNDING PLATES

Solicitation No. IFB 2400 BJT1027

RX No. RQS 2400 21072000990
Opening Date:  10/26/2021
Buyer: Bartley Tyler

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the bid sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopatdize acceptance of your Offer.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on
historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not
wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time,
fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost ot multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, ot any ctitetia or combination deemed most advantageous to

the City.

Receipt No. 1 2 3 4
Vendor Name Apfelbaum Industrial, Inc. KBS Electrical Distributors Techline Inc Wesco Distribution
Local Presence (Y/N) N Y Y Y
MBE/WBE
CATEGORY'1
EST | UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Grounding Plates

For Traffic Signal & Pedestrian Hybrid Beacon
Installations

1 Eritech PN UGP738P5 (735 in. x 385.5 in. 200 | EACH $394.51 $78,902.00 $121.45 $24,290.00 $123.50 $24,700.00 $146.35 $29,270.00
Copper Grounding Plate) or buyer approved

equal

TOTAL BID $78,902.00 $24,290.00 $24,700.00 $29,270.00

NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL _
DELIVER THE ITEMS TO THE CITY: 42 Days SR No Bid 60 Days

Award Method: By one total
Prepared By: Administrative staff

Approved By: Bartley Tyler
&Yellow notates award.
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City of Austin Purchasing Office — Log of Offers Received

Solicitation Number: |FB 5000 JOG1022

IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on D RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by:
the following bid sheets are for information only remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of Phone — 512-974-2500

and does not constitute actual award/execution offers is for information purposes only and does not Email - Purchinfo@austintexas.gov

of a contract. constitute actual award/execution of a contract. Physical Address — 124 W. 8th St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701

Hours of Operation — Monday-Friday 7:45 a.m. to 4:45 p.m.

Vendor Name Date Received Type of Response No Bid
(eResponse / Physical)

Techline Inc 10/5/2021 eResponse =

KBS Electrical Distributors Inc  10/5/2021 eResponse

Wesco Distribution, Inc. 10/4/2021 eResponse

Apfelbaum Industrial Inc 10/25/2021 eResponse

o|1o0({0|0(0]0]|0

> ll |Ii a Ra mi rez This certifies the response was received prior to the solicitation closing.

Revised 07/2020
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PRICING SUBMITTAL

CITY OF AUSTIN

TRAFFIC SIGNAL GROUNDING PLATES

BUYER:

SOLICITATION NO.: |IFB 2400 BJT1027
Bartley Tyler

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the bid sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or
anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.
Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges,
mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most advantageous to the City.

CATEGORY 1 - DESCRIPTION

UNIT OF ESTIMATED
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE QUANTITY MANUFACTURER MFG PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
Grounding Plates
For Traffic Signal & Pedestrian Hybrid Beacon Installations X
11 |Eritech PN UGP738P5 (735 in. x 385.5 in. Copper Grounding Plate) or buyer EACH 200 Eritech UGP738P5 $123.50 $24,700.00
approved equal
TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1= $24,700.00
DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED
NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL DELIVERY THE ITEMS TO THE CITY:
DELIVERY METHOD: x COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS) 0O VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: Techline Inc

EMAIL ADDRESS:

jace.braziel@techline-inc.com

Section 0600 - Bid Sheet
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PRICING SUBMITTAL
CITY OF AUSTIN
TRAFFIC SIGNAL GROUNDING PLATES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 2400 BJT1027

BUYER: Bartley Tyler

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the bid sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated
usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.
Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges,
mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most advantageous to the City.

CATEGORY 1 - DESCRIPTION

ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MUE'ﬂ;L?;E E:JL“:I'?I"T'II'EYD MANUFACTURER MFG PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
Grounding Plates
e oo boyer | 5
approved equal
TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = $24,290.00
DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED
NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL DELIVERY THE ITEMS TO THE CITY: 55 DAYS
DELIVERY METHOD: 0O COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS) VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: KBS ELECTRICAL DIST., INC.
EMAIL ADDRESS: MMCGUIRE@KBSELECTRIC.COM

Section 0600 - Bid Sheet Page 1 of 1




PRICING SUBMITTAL
CITY OF AUSTIN
TRAFFIC SIGNAL GROUNDING PLATES

SOLICITATION NO.: |FB 2400 BJT1027
BUYER: Bartley Tyler
licitation may jeopardize accep of your Offe",

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheel to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the bid sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the
The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provid :d as a guide based on historical or

anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.
A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid” or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that t i@ Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.

Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly aliowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transpor ation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges,
i . stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract.
The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or muitiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combinati 1t 08t advar to the City.
CATEGORY 1 - DESCRIPTION
TTEM UNIT OF ESTIMATED
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE TITY MANUFACTURER MFG PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
Grounding Flates
For Traffic Signal & Pedestrian Hybrid Beacon Installations
11 | Eritech PN UGPT38P5 (735 in. x 385.5 in. Copper Grounding Plate) or buyer | =7 200 BTG PROHUEEED $M8.35 $2,270.00
approved equal
TOTAL FOR C/ TEGORY 1= $29,270.00
DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED
NUMBE! AYS AFTER Rl I RDER THE OFF| SHALL DELIVERY MS TO THE CITY: 60
DELIVERY METHOD: COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS) O VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: POWER SUPPLY
EMAIL ADDRESS: mdavis@wesco.com

Page 1 of 1
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PRICING SUBMITTAL
CITY OF AUSTIN
TRAFFIC SIGNAL GROUNDING PLATES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 2400 BJT1027
BUYER: Bartley Tyler

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the bid sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or
anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.
Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges,
mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most advantageous to the City.

CATEGORY 1 - DESCRIPTION

ITEM UNIT OF ESTIMATED
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE QUANTITY MANUFACTURER MFG PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

Grounding Plates

For Traffic Signal & Pedestrian Hybrid Beacon Installations

Eritech PN UGP738P5 (735 in. x 385.5 in. Copper Grounding Plate) or buyer
approved equal

EACH 200 Eritech PN UGP738P5 $394.51 $78,902.00

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = $78,902.00

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL DELIVERY THE ITEMS TO THE CITY: 42 Days

DELIVERY METHOD: COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS) [J VENDOR DELIVERY n

COMPANY NAME: Apfelbaum Industrial, Inc.

EMAIL ADDRESS: octavio.manzano@apfelbaumind.com

Section 0600 - Bid Sheet Page 1 of 1
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