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May 11, 2021  
 
 
 
Recommendation for Award of IFB 7800 BRS1023 Vehicle Painting, Dent Repair, & Refinishing 
Services. 
 
 
Purchasing staff has completed their evaluation and has recommended award to Leif 
Johnson Ford D/B/A Leif Johnson Ford II LTD or Truck City Ford. 
 
 
 
Bridney Stewart  
Procurement Specialist III  
(512) 971-3127 
Bridney.Stewart@austintexas.gov 
City of Austin 
Purchasing Office  
 
 
 

City of Austin 
Purchasing Office 
P.O. Box 1088, Austin, TX 78767 

mailto:Bridney.Stewart@austintexas.gov


ITEM NO.
ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

HOURS
UNIT HOURLY RATE EXTENDED PRICE HOURLY RATE EXTENDED PRICE HOURLY RATE EXTENDED PRICE HOURLY RATE EXTENDED PRICE

1.1A 250 HOUR $33.00 $8,250.00 $48.00 $12,000.00 $42.00 $10,500.00 $46.00 $11,500.00

1.2A 100 HOUR $45.00 $4,500.00 $60.00 $6,000.00 $60.00 $6,000.00 $85.00 $8,500.00

1.3A 100 HOUR $62.00 $6,200.00 $70.00 $7,000.00 $75.00 $7,500.00 $85.00 $8,500.00

1.4A 125 HOUR $33.00 $4,125.00 $48.00 $6,000.00 $42.00 $5,250.00 $46.00 $5,750.00

1.5A 125 HOUR $33.00 $4,125.00 $48.00 $6,000.00 $42.00 $5,250.00 $46.00 $5,750.00

1.6A 200 HOUR $33.00 $6,600.00 $34.00 $6,800.00 $32.00 $6,400.00 $36.00 $7,200.00

ITEM NO.
ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

HOURS
UNIT HOURLY RATE EXTENDED PRICE HOURLY RATE EXTENDED PRICE HOURLY RATE EXTENDED PRICE HOURLY RATE EXTENDED PRICE

1.1B 250 HOUR $35.00 $8,750.00 $54.00 $13,500.00 No Bid No Bid $46.00 $11,500.00

1.2B 100 HOUR $45.00 $4,500.00 $60.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid $85.00 $8,500.00

1.3B 100 HOUR $62.00 $6,200.00 $70.00 $7,000.00 No Bid No Bid $85.00 $8,500.00

1.4B 125 HOUR $33.00 $4,125.00 $54.00 $6,750.00 No Bid No Bid $46.00 $5,750.00

1.5B 125 HOUR $33.00 $4,125.00 $54.00 $6,750.00 No Bid No Bid $46.00 $5,750.00

1.6B 200 HOUR $33.00 $6,600.00 $34.00 $6,800.00 No Bid No Bid $36.00 $7,200.00

ITEM NO.
MARKUP TO COSTS

(PERCENTAGE)
EXTENDED PRICE

MARKUP TO COSTS

(PERCENTAGE)
EXTENDED PRICE

MARKUP TO COSTS

(PERCENTAGE)
EXTENDED PRICE

MARKUP TO COSTS

(PERCENTAGE)
EXTENDED PRICE

2.1 10.00% $13,200.00 25.00% $15,000.00 10.00% $13,200.00 15.00% $13,800.00

2.2 15.00% $13,800.00 20.00% $14,400.00 15.00% $13,800.00 15.00% $13,800.00

ITEM NO.
ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
UNIT UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

3.1 40 EA $15.00 $600.00 $60.00 $2,400.00 No Bid No Bid $46.00 $1,840.00

3.2 10 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid $46.00 $460.00

Lezlee Perkins

Bridney Stewart

Yellow notates award.

Award Method:

Prepared by:

Approved by:

No Bid

$67,900.00

$2,300.00 

$124,300.00 

$47,200.00 

$68,100.00 $90,600.00 $40,900.00 $94,400.00 

FLAT FEE FOR EXPEDITED SERVICES

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 3 = 

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1 THRU 3 = 

$600.00 $2,400.00

$95,700.00 $122,400.00

4

Marley Santizo D/B/A Texas Auto Refinishing LLC

N

$33,800.00 $43,800.00 $40,900.00 $47,200.00 

3

Evelyn B Benites D/B/A Big Boys Collision Center North

N

MWB

2

ACM Body & Frame Inc D/B/A ACM Tractor Sales

N

Receipt No.

Vendor Name

Local Presence (Y/N)

MBE/WBE

1

Leif Johnson Ford D/B/A Leif Johnson Ford II LTD or 

Truck City Ford

Y

Mechanical Labor

Mechanical Labor

Markup to Subcontracting Costs $12,000.00

SUBTOTAL FOR SECTION 1B = 

TOTAL FOR SECTION 1 = 

Body Labor - Steel bodies

Body Labor - Aluminum Bodies

Refinish Labor - Steel Bodies

Refinish Labor - Aluminum Bodies

Paint Materials

CATEGORY 2 - MARKUP TO COSTS FOR MATERIALS

The City estimates an annual spending need of $24,000 for non-specified auto body repair parts.

Offeror shall be able to provide materials to complete the repairs. The percentage markup to costs listed shall be the maximum amount offered for the category line throughout the term of the contract including any subsequent renewal periods, and are not subject to change. The invoice prices for these materials shall be based off a markup to costs paid by the offeror as indicated below. The 

percentage markup given should take into all costs (administrative, overhead, shipping charges, etc.) to deliver the materials to the Austin, TX area. These costs shall be factored into the markup to costs rates and shall not be paid separately. Markup to costs shall be expressed in numerical terms and not exceed 15%. A bid of '0' (zero) or left blank will be interpreted by the City as a zero percent 

markup to the City.

The annual spending need amount is an estimate and not a guarantee of actual volume.  The City reserves the right to purchase more or less of these quantities as may be required during the contract Term.  Quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED ANNUAL MATERIAL SPEND

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2 = $27,000.00 $29,400.00 $27,000.00 $27,600.00

CATEGORY 3 - MISCELLANEOUS SERVICES

DESCRIPTION

FLAT FEE FOR ROUND TRIP PICKUP AND DELIVERY OF CITY VEHICLES

Markup to Costs for all related Materials and associated Components $12,000.00

$34,300.00 $46,800.00 No Bid

DESCRIPTION OF LABOR HOURS - GROUP 2 VEHICLES 

SECTION 1A -- HOURLY LABOR RATE  - GROUP 1 VEHICLES (CARS, LIGHT TRUCKS UP TO 14,000 GVW OR UP TO 24 FEET IN LENGTH)

Any revision to the Labor Rate may only be adjusted using the Economic Price Adjustment - Specified Parts and/or Services provision in the Price Submittal.

DESCRIPTION OF LABOR HOURS - GROUP 1 VEHICLES 

Body Labor - Steel bodies

Body Labor - Aluminum Bodies

Refinish Labor - Steel Bodies

Refinish Labor - Aluminum Bodies

Paint Materials

SECTION 1B -- HOURLY LABOR RATE  - GROUP 2 VEHICLES (MEDIUM & HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES ABOVE 14,000 GVW OR ABOVE 24 FEET IN LENGTH)

Any revision to the Labor Rate may only be adjusted using the Economic Price Adjustment - Specified in the Solicitations Terms and Conditions.

SUBTOTAL FOR SECTION 1A = 

Special Instructions:  Offerors must use this Price Submittal to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the Price Submittal or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer. 

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the Price Submittal shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment 

necessary to perform the services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most advantageous to the City.

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

 VEHICLE PAINTING, DENT REPAIR, & REFINISHING SERVICES

Solicitation: IFB 7800 BRS1023

Buyer: Bridney Stewart

RX NO.:

Opening Date:

21010800280

3/2/2021

(ftj r. . 
• 

,VhtD 0 
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® PRICE SUBMITTAL 
CITY OF AUSTIN 

. 
. 

VEHICLE PAINTING, DENT REPAIR, & REFINISHING SERVICES 

aQl.1,IL~l]QN t:IQ IFB 7800 BRS1023 

B!MB. BridneyStewart 

Spe«.ial lnstructiona: Offerora mull use this Price suomm11 to submtt pricing. Be 1cM1td thal altering the Price Subm1tt11l or taking excrption, to any portion or the so/ic:itation may iec)pardlz:e acceptance of yot,r Otfe, 

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guan1ntn of actual volume. The City does not guanintee the purehase of the quantities listed, actual purchase. may be more or less Quantities are provtded as a guide 
bated on historical or anticipated usage. OnMr quantities wHI be 1$-ltffdtd and spedfied by the City for NCh order 

A bid of-0- (zaro) win ba lnta,p,eted by the City n a no-chlrg1 (free) item and tht City\MII not expect to pay far that ittm Abtd ot·na bkr' °' no response(space "ft b'lnk)will beinterpf9ted by the Citytt,attheOffe<ot doe, 
not Wllh to bid on thll item. Ba tdvised, a .. "° bier CM' no response may bet consldlfed ,s non-r"9C)nsive and may result in d~lificalion of the bid. 

Prices offetecl on the Price Submittal Shell be all indusive of fees not expressly alkM'ltd in th• scope of WWl. The Offaror shall not charge separately for administrative. ovtffiead, per dtem, and shipping or transportation costs 
(travtf Hme, fuel surcharges, milaag•. stop,-ree, etc.) to de!iver services or 11ems to the Austin, Teus area The Otfaror shall pt'OYide all toots. labor. tl'lvef, and equipment necessary to pen'orm the services requrrtd under this 
...... ct. 

The City reserves the rigtll ta award a single contrad based an overall k,w cost or muttlple award• bated an indMduat Of categoueslgroups of specific hna items. cost. or any cntena ot combiraation dHmed most advantlgeaus 
lo Ille Cl1y 

SECTION 1A - HOURLY LABOR RAT! • GROUP 1 VEHICLES (CARS, LIGHT TRUCKS UP TO 14,000 GWI OR UP TO 24 FEET IN LENGTH) 
Any revision ta the Labor Rate may only be adjusted using the Economic Price Adjustment • Specified Parts and/or SeMCeS provision in tht Price Submittal. 

ITEMNO. DESCRIPTION OF LABOR HOURS • GROUP 1 VEHICLES ESTIMATED ANNUAL 
UMT HOURLY RATE HOURS 

,, .. Body LlbOr • Steet bodies 2'50 HOUR ]'J,c,\l 
12A Body Labor• Alumk'lum Bodies 100 HOUR f./~.(JI 
1,3" Mechanical LabOr 100 HOUR '92.an .... Refinith LlbOf • Steel Bodin 12S HOUR :J:J-11(} 
1 SA Refinish Labor • Ah.lminum Bodles 125 HOUR 'J-:J, Ofl 
USA Paint Mattnalt 200 HOUR "'Jj .. (to 

SUBTOTAL FOR SECTION 1A = 

SECTION 1B-HOURL Y LABOR RATE • GROUP 2 VEHICLES (MEDIUM & HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES ABOVE 14,000 GWI OR ABOVE 24 FEET IN LENGTH) 
Any,-vislon to the LeborRete may only be adjusted Ullng the Economic Price Adjustment- Spec:ffled In the Solicitetlont Tetms and Conditions 

ITEIINO. DESCRIPTION OF LABOR HOURS • GROUP 2 VEHIClES ESTIMATED ANNUAL 
UNIT HOURLYRATE HOURS 

11B Body Ullbot - Steel bodies 2'50 HOUR 

12B Body Labor - Aluminum Badia 100 HOUR 

I3B M-Labo< 100 HOUR 

1'9 Refinish Labor . StNf Bodies t25 HOUR 

159 Refinith L..abot • Akttninum Bodies 125 HOUR 

1119 PltifltMltfflatl 200 HOUR 

CATEGORY 2 • MARKUP TO COSTS FOR MATERIALS 

The City estimates an annual spending nNd of 524,000 for non-1pedfied auto body repeir parts 

EXTelDED PRICE 

Yl.IO,ol) 
'IS()).~ 
' 2,d),t# "',.~,div 
tttzr:IIV 
Ct:. f/1) ;-

1~>A'W'-" 

EXTENDED PRICE 

Offeror Iha/I be able to provide materials lo complete the repairs The percentage me~up to costs I sted sha I be the malClmum amount offered for the category line thrauQhout the term of the contract including eny subsequent 
renewal periods, Ind are not tubjed: to dlange. Tha invoice pnces f0t these materials 1h1H be based off• markup to costs patd by the offen:ir as indicated bekM. The pen:entage martwp siiven should take into eN costs 
(administrative. OYefflNd, Shipping ch9f51n, etc.) ta deliwf" the materials to the Austin. TX area These costl lhaH be factored into the markup to costs rates and WM not be pakl separ11!ely Markup to com shal be expressed 
in nunMrical tem,1 and not acNd 15,t.. A btd of 'O' (zaro) or left t>Mnk MIN lntwprtltd by the City II a ze,o percent ma,1,r;up to lh.t City 

The aMual spending need amount is en nUmal• and not a guarantN of ■dual volume The City ,nerves the nght to purchate more or less of these Quantlbn II rnty be r.qu,red during tho contract Term Quantities will be 
as-nlttdtd and specified by Iha City for uch al'IW 

ITEMNO. ITEM DESCRJPTION 

21 Markup to Colla fo, •• relattd Mattril11 and u1oci1tec, CompoMnts 

22 Mart(up to Subeontractlng Costs 

CATEGORY 3 • MISCEU.ANEOUS SERVICES 

ITEMNO. DESCRIPTION 

3.1 Fl.AT FEE FOR ROUND TRIP PICKUP ANO DELIVERY OF CITY VEHICLES 

3 2 FLAT FEE FOR EXPEDITED SERVICES 

EMAIL AQQBESS: 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL MATERIAL SP~D 

S12,000 DO 

S12 000 00 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 
QUANTITY .. 

10 

UNIT 

EA 

EA 

MARKUP TO COSTS 
IPERCENTAGEl 

/0 ,r 
TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2 a 

UNITPRICE 

TOTAL EXTENDEO PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1 THRU 3 = 

EXreNDED PRICE 

/"j~()(J-
/1f!Jo-

~'>"Mt:J_,, 

EXTelDED PRICE 
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��3��4�W]�HGZOJOIW�MI�MNG�nTSIH��TMG�KT]�IWU]�SG�TŶLJMGY�LJOWX�MNG�8QIWIKOQ�PHOQG��ŶLJMKGWM�e�RVGQOFOGY�PTHMJ�TWYiIH�RGHZOQGJ�VHIZOJOIW�OW�MNG�PHOQG�RLSKOMMTU���	����������k�

j�������	�v�3�����5�l����
�	�/IY]�nTSIH�e�RMGGU�SIYOGJ/IY]�nTSIH�e��ULKOWLK�/IYOGJ�GFOWOJN�nTSIH�e�RMGGU�/IYOGJ�GFOWOJN�nTSIH�e��ULKOWLK�/IYOGJPTOWM�xTMGHOTUJ 	�j���

�k���	�������5
�y�	�������5j�vv�����
��

j����
����v�3�����.�l����
�	�2�������m���
l�������l����
�	�
j�l��5�-!!!�3lw����
j�l��.��k�������
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