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December 16, 2020  
 
 
 
Recommendation for Award of IFB 1100 MEA1025, Ropes, Cords & Slings.   
 
 
Thank you for your response to the above referenced solicitation for the City of Austin.  
Purchasing staff has completed their evaluation and has recommended awarding to Stuart 
C Irby Company. 
 
Line Item 6, & 10-14 
 
Thank you for your continued interest in doing business with the City of Austin.  
 
 
Kind regards, 
 
 
 
Maria Andrade  
Procurement Specialist II  
512-972-9424 
Maria.Andrade@austintexas.gov  
City of Austin 
Purchasing Office  
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December 16, 2020  
 
 
 
Recommendation for Award of IFB 1100 MEA1025, Ropes, Cords & Slings.   
 
Thank you for your response to the above referenced solicitation. Purchasing staff has 
completed their evaluation and has recommended awarding to Colonna Group LLC the 
following line items: 
 
Line Items 1-5, 7-9 & 15-16 
 
Thank you for your continued interest in doing business with the City of Austin.  
 
Kind regards, 
 
 
 
Maria Andrade  
Procurement Specialist II  
512-972-9424 
Maria.Andrade@austintexas.gov  
City of Austin 
Purchasing Office  
 
 
 



ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

1 9522 2,600 FT ** ** $0.11 $286.00 * * NO BID NO BID

2 9526 18,400 FT ** ** $0.06 $1,104.00 * * NO BID NO BID

3 9527 800 FT ** ** $0.08 $64.00 * * NO BID NO BID

4 9529 6,400 FT ** ** $0.37 $2,368.00 * * $0.57 $3,648.00 

5 9530 10,000 FT ** ** $0.63 $6,300.00 * * $0.94 $9,400.00 

6 9531 2,000 FT ** ** $1.30 $2,600.00 * * $1.27 $2,540.00 

7 9532 5,600 FT ** ** $1.01 $5,656.00 * * $1.02 $5,712.00 

8 9537 363 EA ** ** $11.69 $4,243.47 * * NO BID NO BID

9 9538 110 EA ** ** $14.59 $1,604.90 * * NO BID NO BID

10 9607 29 EA ** ** $26.03 $754.87 * * $9.70 $281.30 

11 9608 46 EA ** ** $40.34 $1,855.64 * * $15.17 $697.82 

12 9609 46 EA ** ** $54.64 $2,513.44 * * $19.92 $916.32 

13 9610 43 EA ** ** $68.94 $2,964.42 * * $23.84 $1,025.12 

14 9612 33 EA ** ** $107.08 $3,533.64 * * $36.36 $1,199.88 

15 9615 40 EA ** ** $57.52 $2,300.80 * * NO BID NO BID

16 24346 6 REEL ** ** $1,359.00 $8,154.00 * * NO BID NO BID

$0.00 

N N

N N N

N

BID TAB
CITY OF AUSTIN

ROPES,CORDS & SLINGS

IFB 1100 MEA1025

20100700028

11/3/2020

Maria Andrade

Solicitation No.

RX No.

Opening Date:

Buyer:

Sid Tool Company Inc Stuart C Irby Company

1

Techline

3 42

The Colonna Group LLC

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP,(CONTINUOUS LOOP), 3 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON WEB, TYPE 
5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND 
BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY MARKED TO SHOW: MANUFACTURERS 
NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH. ON QPL EL-1604

Note: 

Award Method:

*Deemed Non-Responsive - did not meet the requirements of the solicitation.

Katie Greenwood
Maria Andrade
Yellow notates award.

Prepared By:  
Approved By:  

 

**Offer withdrawn by respondent.
Line by line

 

$46,303.18 $0.00 $25,420.44 

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINOUS LOOP), 6 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON WEB, TYPE 
5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND 
BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS 
NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH.
ON QPL EL-1604

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINUOUS LOOP), 9 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON WEB,TYPE 
5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND 
BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS., EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS 
NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH.
ON QPL EL-1604

TOTAL BID

ROPEMADE WITH DYNEEMA FIBER WITH A SAMTHANE COATING, LIGHTWEIGHT, 12STRAND CLASS II. NAME 
OF ROPE IS “AMSTEEL-BLUE”,  SPECIFICGRAVITY 0.98,  5/16INCH IN DIAMETER, WITH A 6 INCH EYE AT EACH 
END. ROPE SHALL COME ON1000 FOOT REELS. 

SLING, ADJUSTABLE ROPE, 5/8", HIGH TENACITY POLYESTER WITH ORANGE OR RED URETHANE COATING. 
VERTICAL RATING 3,203 LBS., CHOKER RATINGS 2,562 LBS., BASKET RATING 6,406 LBS. ON QPL EL-1209

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINOUS LOOP), 20 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY,2" WIDTH, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., CHOKER LIFT 
5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY MARKED TO SHOW:  
MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH.

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINUOUS LOOP), 12 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON WEB, 
TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., CHOKER LIFT 5000 
LBS. AND A BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMAINTLY MARKED TO SHOW: 
MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH. ON QPL 
EL-1604

CORD, SASH, COTTON, 100 FOOT HANKS, SIZES #8, 1/4 INCH DIAMETER

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE 3/4" INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND POLY- ESTER JACKET STRANDS 
PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE BREAK STRENGTH OF 
14,800 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS ON 
QUALIFIED PRODUCTS LIST EL1262 SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED 
WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED.

MBE/WBE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

ROPE, MANILA, 1/2" DIAMETER, 3-STRAND, UNTARRED AND WATER-PROOFED, MINIMUM AVERAGE 
STRENGTH 2,650 LBS.

ROPE, 3/8 INCH, POLYPROPYLENE, YELLOW, 600 FT/ REEL (REEL SIZE: 17" WIDE X 18" HIGH, MAX.)

ROPE, 1/4 INCH, YELLOW, POLYPROPYLENE, 600 FT/ ROLL.(REEL SIZE: 17" WIDE X 18" HIGH, MAX)

CORD SASH, OLEFIN MULTI-FILAMENT POLYPROPYLENE, 100FT/ROLL HANKS SIZE #8, 1/4 INCH DIAMETER.

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE,3/8 INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLYESTER JACKET STRANDS 
PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE BREAKING STRENGTH 
OF 4,000 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS 
SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS 
DELIVERED.

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE, 1/2 " INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLY- ESTER JACKET STRANDS 
PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE CAPABLE OF AN 1,100 LB. WORKING LOAD AND 
RATED AT AN AVERAGE BREAK STRENGTH OF 6,900 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 
FEET PER REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE 
SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED.

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE, 5/8" INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLY- ESTER JACKET STRANDS 
PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE BREAK STRENGTH OF 
11,600 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS 
SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS 
DELIVERED.

Y

N

Receipt No.

Vendor Name

Local Presence (Y/N)
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City of Austin Purchasing Office – Log of Offers Received 
 

Solicitation Number:  
 
 

 

 

 

 
 

 
 
         Vendor Name     Date Received     Type of Response     No Bid 
                  (eResponse / Physical)     
 
  
1.  
 
 
2. 
 
 
3. 
 
 
4.  
 
 
5. 
 
 
6. 
 
  
7.  
 
 
8.  
    

   
X

  Revised 07/2020 

IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on 
the following bid sheets are for information only 
and does not constitute actual award/execution 
of a contract. 

RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall 
remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of 
offers is for information purposes only and does not 
constitute actual award/execution of a contract. 

For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by: 
Phone – 512-974-2500 
Email – PurchInfo@austintexas.gov 
Physical Address – 124 W. 8th St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701 
Hours of Operation – Monday-Friday 7:45 a.m. to 4:45 p.m. 

This certifies the response was received prior to the solicitation closing. 

mailto:PurchInfo@austintexas.gov
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ITEM 

NO.

AE 

STOCK 

NO.

EST. 

QTY. U/M

LEAD 

TIME

(days)

UNIT 

PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE

MFG P/N 45900560

MFG P/N
45900263 (Sold in multiples of 600 

feet)

MFG P/N
45900305 (Sold in multiples of 600 

feet)

MFG P/N
96491717 (Sold in Multiples of 600 

feet)

SOLICITATION NO.:

RQM No.

OPENING DATE:

BUYER:

IFB 1100 MEA1025

20100700028

11/3/2020

Maria Andrade

FT

Worksmart

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
FRANK WINNE / 16023

SAMSON CONTR/ 1500-00030

Frank Winne

4 9529

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE,3/8 INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLYESTER JACKET 

STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 

BREAKING STRENGTH OF 4,000 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 

REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE 

SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. $3,136.00 6,400 FT

90 Day 

Lead 

Time

$0.49 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-12-00600

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 36038600

$0.07 

FT

PRICE SHEET

CITY OF AUSTIN

PURCHASING OFFICE

ROPES, CORDS & SLINGS 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

$56.00 

1

BIDDERS SHALL ENTER THE PROPOSED MANUFACTURER AND PART NUMBER IN THE SPACE PROVIDED.

*****THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES*****

9522 $468.00 2,600 $0.18 2-3 days

ROPE, MANILA, 1/2" DIAMETER, 3-STRAND, UNTARRED AND WATER-PROOFED, MINIMUM AVERAGE 

STRENGTH 2,650 LBS.

2 $736.00 

3 9527

Worksmart

$0.04 

Worksmart

9526
7-10 

days

ROPE, 3/8 INCH, POLYPROPYLENE, YELLOW, 600 FT/ REEL (REEL SIZE: 17" WIDE X 18" HIGH, MAX.)

ROPE, 1/4 INCH, YELLOW, POLYPROPYLENE, 600 FT/ ROLL.(REEL SIZE: 17" WIDE X 18" HIGH, MAX)

2-3 days800

18,400

FT

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICANROPE / PRO-14-RLT

TUBBS  / 38035

APEX PINNCLE / P900650600Y01

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES / 2000-00050

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

APEX PINNCLE / P902450600Y01

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 2000-00130

TUBBS / 38044

WELLINGTON / 4100R
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ITEM 

NO.

AE 

STOCK 

NO.

EST. 

QTY. U/M

LEAD 

TIME

(days)

UNIT 

PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N
96491980 (Sold in multiples of 600 

feet)

MFG P/N
96492319  (Sold in multiples of 600 

feet)

MFG P/N
96492525  (Sold in multiples of 600 

feet)

MFG P/N 45900685

MFG  P/N 45890449

Frank Winne

7

2-3 days

9 9538

CORD, SASH, COTTON, 100 FOOT HANKS, SIZES #8, 1/4 INCH DIAMETER

$1.65 $3,300.00 6 9531

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE 3/4" INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND POLY- ESTER JACKET 

STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 

BREAK STRENGTH OF 14,800 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 

REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS ON QUALIFIED PRODUCTS LIST EL1262 SHOWING THE BREAKING 

STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. 2,000 FT

2-3 days $1.26 $7,056.00 5,600 FT

90 Day 

Lead 

Time

9532

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE, 5/8" INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLY- ESTER JACKET 

STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 

BREAK STRENGTH OF 11,600 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 

REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE 

SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED.

2-3 days $9.15 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-24-00600

SAMSON ROPE TECH / 36034600

110 EA

NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-20-00600

SAMSON ROPE TECH / 360-040-006030

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

FRANK WINNE / 38092

SAMSON ROPE / 21016001060

WELLINGTON / J5016S0100

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

FRANK WINNE / 45052

SAMSON ROPE / 2016001060

WELLINGTON / A3116H0100H1.0
$1,006.50 

Worksmart

Worksmart

$2,395.80 

Frank Winne

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

$7,500.00 5 9530

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE, 1/2 " INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLY- ESTER JACKET 

STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE CAPABLE OF AN 1,100 LB. 

WORKING LOAD AND RATED AT AN AVERAGE BREAK STRENGTH OF 6,900 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL 

BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE 

BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED.
10,000 FT

90 Day 

Lead 

Time

$0.75 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-16-00600

WELLINGTON /POLY PLEX

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 36012600

Frank Winne

8 9537

CORD SASH, OLEFIN MULTI-FILAMENT POLYPROPYLENE, 100FT/ROLL HANKS SIZE #8, 1/4 INCH 

DIAMETER.

363 EA $6.60 
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ITEM 

NO.

AE 

STOCK 

NO.

EST. 

QTY. U/M

LEAD 

TIME

(days)

UNIT 

PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N EN1802DX3

MFG P/N EN1802DX6

MFG P/N EN1802DX9

MFG P/N EN1802DX12

$10.35 $300.15 

11 9608

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINOUS LOOP), 6 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 

WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 

CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 

MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 

B30.9, AND LENGTH.

ON QPL EL-1604
46 EA

12 9609

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 9FT

D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 9FT

HERCULES  / EN1-902 X 9FT

LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 9FT

2-3 days $15.75 

13 9610

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINUOUS LOOP), 12 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 

WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 

CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND A BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMAINTLY 

MARKED TO SHOW: MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 

B30.9, AND LENGTH. ON QPL EL-1604

43 EA 2-3 days $27.99 $1,203.57 

Lift-All

$724.50 

Lift-All

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 6FT

D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 6FT

HERCULES  / EN1-902 X 6FT

LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 6FT

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINUOUS LOOP), 9 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 

WEB,TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 

CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS., EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 

MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 

B30.9, AND LENGTH.

ON QPL EL-1604
46 EA 5-7 Days $22.77 $1,047.42 

Lift-All

10 9607

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP,(CONTINUOUS LOOP), 3 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 

WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 

CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 

MARKED TO SHOW: MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 

B30.9, AND LENGTH. ON QPL EL-1604 EA 2-3 days

Lift-All

29

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 3FT

HERCULES / EN1-902 X 3FT

LIFT-ALL / EN1-802D X 3FT

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 12FT

D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 12FT

HERCULES  / EN1-902 X12FT

LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 12FT
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ITEM 

NO.

AE 

STOCK 

NO.

EST. 

QTY. U/M

LEAD 

TIME

(days)

UNIT 

PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N EN1802DX20

MFG P/N No Bid

MFG P/N 5/16X1000EYEEYE

ITEM 

NO.

STOCK 

NO.

17 None

X VENDOR DELIVERY

TOTAL BID

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

DELIVERY METHOD: 

COMPANY NAME:

DELIVERY TERMS:  DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

 COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS)

The City may purchase additional related items that are available from the Contractor in various quantities.  

Pricing for these non-specified items will be calculated based on a percentage markup over Contractors cost as 

identified in the Price Sheet under the Non-Specified Parts Section. Reference Solicitation Instructions Section 

4.8 (Pricing Requirements - Non-Specified Items).

25%

% MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE

Sid Tool Copmany dba MSC Industrial Supply Co. Inc.

The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above.

$40,194.04 

14 9612

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINOUS LOOP), 20 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY,2" WIDTH, POLYESTER OR 

NYLON WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 

CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 

MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 

B30.9, AND LENGTH.
33 EA 2-3 days $45.86 $1,513.38 

Lift-All

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING /  EN1-902 X 20FT

D&AWIRE ROPE /  EN1-902 X 20FT

HERCULES /  EN1-902 X 20FT

LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 20FT

15 9615

SLING, ADJUSTABLE ROPE, 5/8", HIGH TENACITY POLYESTER WITH ORANGE OR RED URETHANE 

COATING. VERTICAL RATING 3,203 LBS., CHOKER RATINGS 2,562 LBS., BASKET RATING 6,406 LBS. 

ON QPL EL-1209

40 EA No Bid $0.00 

No Bid

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

D&AWIRE ROPE / AD-625-48

SW OCEAN SRV / AD-625-48

YALE CORD / 9334OUMJ32X048

16 24346

ROPEMADE WITH DYNEEMA FIBER WITH A SAMTHANE COATING, LIGHTWEIGHT, 12STRAND CLASS 

II. NAME OF ROPE IS “AMSTEEL-BLUE”,  SPECIFICGRAVITY 0.98,  5/16INCH IN DIAMETER, WITH A 6 

INCH EYE AT EACH END. ROPE SHALL COME ON1000 FOOT REELS. 
6 REEL

7-14 

Days
$1,625.12 $9,750.72 

Frank Winne

APPROVED MFG / Part No. SAMSON ROPE / AMSTEEL-BLUE 872 (2200-05180)
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

MFG P/N

MFG P/N

MFG P/N

MFG P/N DA-PRO-1300-12-00600

ROPE, 3/8 INCH, POLYPROPYLENE, YELLOW, 600 FT/ REEL (REEL SIZE: 17" WIDE X 18" HIGH, MAX.)

ROPE, 1/4 INCH, YELLOW, POLYPROPYLENE, 600 FT/ ROLL.(REEL SIZE: 17" WIDE X 18" HIGH, MAX)

No 800

18,400

FT

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICANROPE / PRO-14-RLT
TUBBS  / 38035
APEX PINNCLE / P900650600Y01
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES / 2000-00050

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

APEX PINNCLE / P902450600Y01
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 2000-00130
TUBBS / 38044
WELLINGTON / 4100R

Bid

FT

PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN

PURCHASING OFFICE
ROPES, CORDS & SLINGS 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

-

1

BIDDERS SHALL ENTER THE PROPOSED MANUFACTURER AND PART NUMBER IN THE SPACE PROVIDED.

*****THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES*****

9522 -2,600 BidNo 

ROPE, MANILA, 1/2" DIAMETER, 3-STRAND, UNTARRED AND WATER-PROOFED, MINIMUM AVERAGE 
STRENGTH 2,650 LBS.

2 -

3 9527

Bid9526 No 

4 9529

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE,3/8 INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLYESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 
BREAKING STRENGTH OF 4,000 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 
REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE 
SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. $3,648.00 6,400 FT 28 $0.57 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-12-00600
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 36038600

 New England Rope

SOLICITATION NO.:

RQM No.

OPENING DATE:

BUYER:

IFB 1100 MEA1025

20100700028

11/3/2020

Maria Andrade

FTAPPROVED MFG / Part No.
FRANK WINNE / 16023
SAMSON CONTR/ 1500-00030
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N DA-PRO-1300-16-00600

MFG P/N DA-PRO-1300-24-00600

MFG P/N DA-PRO-1300-20-00600

MFG P/N

MFG  P/N 

8 9537

CORD SASH, OLEFIN MULTI-FILAMENT POLYPROPYLENE, 100FT/ROLL HANKS SIZE #8, 1/4 INCH 
DIAMETER.

363 EA Bid

$9,400.00 5 9530

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE, 1/2 " INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLY- ESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE CAPABLE OF AN 1,100 LB. 
WORKING LOAD AND RATED AT AN AVERAGE BREAK STRENGTH OF 6,900 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL 
BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE 
BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. 10,000 FT 28 $0.94 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-16-00600
WELLINGTON /POLY PLEX
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 36012600

New England Rope

NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-20-00600
SAMSON ROPE TECH / 360-040-006030

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
FRANK WINNE / 38092
SAMSON ROPE / 21016001060
WELLINGTON / J5016S0100

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
FRANK WINNE / 45052
SAMSON ROPE / 2016001060
WELLINGTON / A3116H0100H1.0

-

-

New England Rope

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

28 $1.02 $5,712.00 5,600 FT

28

9532

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE, 5/8" INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLY- ESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 
BREAK STRENGTH OF 11,600 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 
REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE 
SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED.

No Bid

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-24-00600
SAMSON ROPE TECH / 36034600

110 EA

New England Rope

7

No 

9 9538

CORD, SASH, COTTON, 100 FOOT HANKS, SIZES #8, 1/4 INCH DIAMETER

$1.27 $2,540.00 6 9531

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE 3/4" INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND POLY- ESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 
BREAK STRENGTH OF 14,800 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 
REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS ON QUALIFIED PRODUCTS LIST EL1262 SHOWING THE BREAKING 
STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. 2,000 FT
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N EN1-802DX3FT

MFG P/N EN1-802DX6FT

MFG P/N EN1-802DX9FT

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 12FT
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 12FT
HERCULES  / EN1-902 X12FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 12FT

10 9607

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP,(CONTINUOUS LOOP), 3 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW: MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 
B30.9, AND LENGTH. ON QPL EL-1604 EA 28

Lift-All

29

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 3FT
HERCULES / EN1-902 X 3FT
LIFT-ALL / EN1-802D X 3FT

$697.82 

Lift-All

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 6FT
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 6FT
HERCULES  / EN1-902 X 6FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 6FT

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINUOUS LOOP), 9 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB,TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS., EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, 
ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH.
ON QPL EL-1604 46 EA 28 $19.92 $916.32 

Lift-All

$9.70 $281.30 

11 9608

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINOUS LOOP), 6 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, 
ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH.
ON QPL EL-1604

46 EA

12 9609

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 9FT
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 9FT
HERCULES  / EN1-902 X 9FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 9FT

28 $15.17 

13 9610

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINUOUS LOOP), 12 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND A BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMAINTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW: MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 
B30.9, AND LENGTH. ON QPL EL-1604

43 EA 28 $23.84 $1,025.12 
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N EN1-802DX12FT

MFG P/N EN1-802DX20FT

MFG P/N

MFG P/N

ITEM 
NO.

STOCK 
NO.

17 None

    x VENDOR DELIVERY

16 24346

ROPEMADE WITH DYNEEMA FIBER WITH A SAMTHANE COATING, LIGHTWEIGHT, 12STRAND CLASS 
II. NAME OF ROPE IS “AMSTEEL-BLUE”,  SPECIFICGRAVITY 0.98,  5/16INCH IN DIAMETER, WITH A 6 
INCH EYE AT EACH END. ROPE SHALL COME ON1000 FOOT REELS. 

6 REEL No Bid -

APPROVED MFG / Part No. SAMSON ROPE / AMSTEEL-BLUE 872 (2200-05180)

$1,199.88 

Lift-All

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING /  EN1-902 X 20FT
D&AWIRE ROPE /  EN1-902 X 20FT
HERCULES /  EN1-902 X 20FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 20FT

15 9615

SLING, ADJUSTABLE ROPE, 5/8", HIGH TENACITY POLYESTER WITH ORANGE OR RED URETHANE 
COATING. VERTICAL RATING 3,203 LBS., CHOKER RATINGS 2,562 LBS., BASKET RATING 6,406 LBS. 
ON QPL EL-1209

40 EA No Bid -
APPROVED MFG / Part No.

D&AWIRE ROPE / AD-625-48
SW OCEAN SRV / AD-625-48
YALE CORD / 9334OUMJ32X048

14 9612

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINOUS LOOP), 20 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY,2" WIDTH, POLYESTER 
OR NYLON WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 
LBS., CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, 
ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH.

33 EA 28 $36.36 

The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above.

$25,420.44 

DELIVERY METHOD: 

COMPANY NAME:

DELIVERY TERMS:  DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

 COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS)

The City may purchase additional related items that are available from the Contractor in various quantities.  
Pricing for these non-specified items will be calculated based on a percentage markup over Contractors cost as 
identified in the Price Sheet under the Non-Specified Parts Section. Reference Solicitation Instructions Section 
4.8 (Pricing Requirements - Non-Specified Items).

20%

% MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE

 Irby

TOTAL BID

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Lift-All
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

MFG P/N 1500-00030

MFG P/N 2000-00050

MFG P/N 2000-00130

MFG P/N 36038600

SOLICITATION NO.:

RQM No.

OPENING DATE:

BUYER:

IFB 1100 MEA1025

20100700028

11/3/2020

Maria Andrade

FT

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
FRANK WINNE / 16023
SAMSON CONTR/ 1500-00030

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES

4 9529

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE,3/8 INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLYESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 
BREAKING STRENGTH OF 4,000 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 
REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE 
SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. $2,624.00 6,400 FT 10 $0.41 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-12-00600
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 36038600

$0.05 

FT

PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN

PURCHASING OFFICE
ROPES, CORDS & SLINGS 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

$40.00 

1

BIDDERS SHALL ENTER THE PROPOSED MANUFACTURER AND PART NUMBER IN THE SPACE PROVIDED.

*****THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES*****

9522 $338.00 2,600 $0.13 5

ROPE, MANILA, 1/2" DIAMETER, 3-STRAND, UNTARRED AND WATER-PROOFED, MINIMUM AVERAGE 
STRENGTH 2,650 LBS.

2 $552.00 

3 9527

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES

$0.03 

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES

9526 5

ROPE, 3/8 INCH, POLYPROPYLENE, YELLOW, 600 FT/ REEL (REEL SIZE: 17" WIDE X 18" HIGH, MAX.)

ROPE, 1/4 INCH, YELLOW, POLYPROPYLENE, 600 FT/ ROLL.(REEL SIZE: 17" WIDE X 18" HIGH, MAX)

5800

18,400

FT

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICANROPE / PRO-14-RLT
TUBBS  / 38035
APEX PINNCLE / P900650600Y01
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES / 2000-00050

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

APEX PINNCLE / P902450600Y01
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 2000-00130
TUBBS / 38044
WELLINGTON / 4100R
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N 36012600

MFG P/N 36034600

MFG P/N 360-040-006030

MFG P/N 21016001060

MFG  P/N 2016001060

SAMSON

7

5

9 9538

CORD, SASH, COTTON, 100 FOOT HANKS, SIZES #8, 1/4 INCH DIAMETER

$1.58 $3,160.00 6 9531

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE 3/4" INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND POLY- ESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 
BREAK STRENGTH OF 14,800 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 
REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS ON QUALIFIED PRODUCTS LIST EL1262 SHOWING THE BREAKING 
STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. 2,000 FT

10 $1.21 $6,776.00 5,600 FT

10

9532

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE, 5/8" INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLY- ESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 
BREAK STRENGTH OF 11,600 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 
REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE 
SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED.

5 $17.95 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-24-00600
SAMSON ROPE TECH / 36034600

110 EA

NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-20-00600
SAMSON ROPE TECH / 360-040-006030

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
FRANK WINNE / 38092
SAMSON ROPE / 21016001060
WELLINGTON / J5016S0100

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
FRANK WINNE / 45052
SAMSON ROPE / 2016001060
WELLINGTON / A3116H0100H1.0

$1,974.50 

SAMSON

SAMSON

$5,209.05 

SAMSON

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

$7,300.00 5 9530

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE, 1/2 " INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLY- ESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE CAPABLE OF AN 1,100 LB. 
WORKING LOAD AND RATED AT AN AVERAGE BREAK STRENGTH OF 6,900 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL 
BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE 
BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. 10,000 FT 10 $0.73 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-16-00600
WELLINGTON /POLY PLEX
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 36012600

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES

8 9537

CORD SASH, OLEFIN MULTI-FILAMENT POLYPROPYLENE, 100FT/ROLL HANKS SIZE #8, 1/4 INCH 
DIAMETER.

363 EA $14.35 
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N EN1-802D X 3FT

MFG P/N EN1-802D X 6FT

MFG P/N EN1-802D X 9FT

$10.55 $305.95 

11 9608

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINOUS LOOP), 6 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 
B30.9, AND LENGTH.
ON QPL EL-1604

46 EA

12 9609

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 9FT
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 9FT
HERCULES  / EN1-902 X 9FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 9FT

10 $16.55 

13 9610

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINUOUS LOOP), 12 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND A BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMAINTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW: MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 
B30.9, AND LENGTH. ON QPL EL-1604

43 EA 10 $28.55 $1,227.65 

$761.30 

LIFT-ALL

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 6FT
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 6FT
HERCULES  / EN1-902 X 6FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 6FT

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINUOUS LOOP), 9 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB,TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS., EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 
B30.9, AND LENGTH.
ON QPL EL-1604 46 EA 10 $22.55 $1,037.30 

LIFT-ALL

10 9607

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP,(CONTINUOUS LOOP), 3 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW: MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 
B30.9, AND LENGTH. ON QPL EL-1604 EA 10

LIFT-ALL

29

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 3FT
HERCULES / EN1-902 X 3FT
LIFT-ALL / EN1-802D X 3FT

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 12FT
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 12FT
HERCULES  / EN1-902 X12FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 12FT

Page 3 of 4



ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N EN1-802D X 12FT

MFG P/N EN1-802D X 20FT

MFG P/N AD-625-48

MFG P/N AMSTEEL-BLUE 872 (2200-05180)

ITEM 
NO.

STOCK 
NO.

17 None

   X VENDOR DELIVERY

TOTAL BID

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

LIFT-ALL

DELIVERY METHOD: 

COMPANY NAME:

DELIVERY TERMS:  DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

 COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS)

The City may purchase additional related items that are available from the Contractor in various quantities.  
Pricing for these non-specified items will be calculated based on a percentage markup over Contractors cost as 
identified in the Price Sheet under the Non-Specified Parts Section. Reference Solicitation Instructions Section 
4.8 (Pricing Requirements - Non-Specified Items).

20%

% MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE

Techline Inc

The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above.

$46,095.90 

14 9612

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINOUS LOOP), 20 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY,2" WIDTH, POLYESTER 
OR NYLON WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 
LBS., CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 
B30.9, AND LENGTH.

33 EA 10 $44.55 $1,470.15 

LIFT-ALL

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING /  EN1-902 X 20FT
D&AWIRE ROPE /  EN1-902 X 20FT
HERCULES /  EN1-902 X 20FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 20FT

15 9615

SLING, ADJUSTABLE ROPE, 5/8", HIGH TENACITY POLYESTER WITH ORANGE OR RED URETHANE 
COATING. VERTICAL RATING 3,203 LBS., CHOKER RATINGS 2,562 LBS., BASKET RATING 6,406 LBS. 
ON QPL EL-1209

40 EA 5 $81.00 $3,240.00 

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
D&AWIRE ROPE / AD-625-48
SW OCEAN SRV / AD-625-48
YALE CORD / 9334OUMJ32X048

16 24346

ROPEMADE WITH DYNEEMA FIBER WITH A SAMTHANE COATING, LIGHTWEIGHT, 12STRAND CLASS 
II. NAME OF ROPE IS “AMSTEEL-BLUE”,  SPECIFICGRAVITY 0.98,  5/16INCH IN DIAMETER, WITH A 6 
INCH EYE AT EACH END. ROPE SHALL COME ON1000 FOOT REELS. 

6 REEL 5 $1,680.00 $10,080.00 

SAMSON

APPROVED MFG / Part No. SAMSON ROPE / AMSTEEL-BLUE 872 (2200-05180)
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

MFG P/N 16020C

MFG P/N 2000-00050

MFG P/N 2000-00130

MFG P/N 36038600

ROPE, 3/8 INCH, POLYPROPYLENE, YELLOW, 600 FT/ REEL (REEL SIZE: 17" WIDE X 18" HIGH, MAX.)

ROPE, 1/4 INCH, YELLOW, POLYPROPYLENE, 600 FT/ ROLL.(REEL SIZE: 17" WIDE X 18" HIGH, MAX)

7-10 
days

800

18,400

FT

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICANROPE / PRO-14-RLT
TUBBS  / 38035
APEX PINNCLE / P900650600Y01
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES / 2000-00050

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

APEX PINNCLE / P902450600Y01
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 2000-00130
TUBBS / 38044
WELLINGTON / 4100R

$0.08 

FT

PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN

PURCHASING OFFICE
ROPES, CORDS & SLINGS 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

$64.00 

1

BIDDERS SHALL ENTER THE PROPOSED MANUFACTURER AND PART NUMBER IN THE SPACE PROVIDED.

*****THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES*****

9522 $286.00 2,600 $0.11 3 days

ROPE, MANILA, 1/2" DIAMETER, 3-STRAND, UNTARRED AND WATER-PROOFED, MINIMUM AVERAGE 
STRENGTH 2,650 LBS.

2 $1,104.00 

3 9527

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV

$0.06 

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SERVICES

9526
7-10 
days

4 9529

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE,3/8 INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLYESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 
BREAKING STRENGTH OF 4,000 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 
REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE 
SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. $2,368.00 6,400 FT

7-10 
days

$0.37 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-12-00600
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 36038600

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV

SOLICITATION NO.:

RQM No.

OPENING DATE:

BUYER:

IFB 1100 MEA1025

20100700028

11/3/2020

Maria Andrade

FT

FRANK WINNE

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
FRANK WINNE / 16023
SAMSON CONTR/ 1500-00030
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N 36012600

MFG P/N 36034600

MFG P/N 360-040-006030

MFG P/N 21016001060

MFG  P/N 2016001060

8 9537

CORD SASH, OLEFIN MULTI-FILAMENT POLYPROPYLENE, 100FT/ROLL HANKS SIZE #8, 1/4 INCH 
DIAMETER.

363 EA $11.69 

$6,300.00 5 9530

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE, 1/2 " INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLY- ESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE CAPABLE OF AN 1,100 LB. 
WORKING LOAD AND RATED AT AN AVERAGE BREAK STRENGTH OF 6,900 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL 
BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE 
BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. 10,000 FT

7-10 
days

$0.63 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-16-00600
WELLINGTON /POLY PLEX
SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV / 36012600

SOUTHWEST OCEAN SRV

NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-20-00600
SAMSON ROPE TECH / 360-040-006030

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
FRANK WINNE / 38092
SAMSON ROPE / 21016001060
WELLINGTON / J5016S0100

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
FRANK WINNE / 45052
SAMSON ROPE / 2016001060
WELLINGTON / A3116H0100H1.0

$1,604.90 

SAMSON ROPE

SAMSON ROPE

$4,243.47 

SAMSON ROPE TECH

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

7-10 
days

$1.01 $5,656.00 5,600 FT

7-10 
days

9532

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE, 5/8" INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND, POLY- ESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 
BREAK STRENGTH OF 11,600 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 
REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS SHOWING THE BREAKING STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE 
SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED.

7-10 
days

$14.59 

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
NEW ENG ROPE / DA-PRO-1300-24-00600
SAMSON ROPE TECH / 36034600

110 EA

SAMSON ROPE TECH

7

7-10 
days

9 9538

CORD, SASH, COTTON, 100 FOOT HANKS, SIZES #8, 1/4 INCH DIAMETER

$1.30 $2,600.00 6 9531

ROPE, HAND/PILOT LINE 3/4" INCH DIAMETER SINGLE BRAID 12-STRAND POLY- ESTER JACKET 
STRANDS PLIED OVER POLYOLEFIN CENTER STRAND. ROPE SHALL BE RATED AT AN AVERAGE 
BREAK STRENGTH OF 14,800 POUNDS. ROPE SHALL BE DELIVERED ON REELS, 600 FEET PER 
REEL. CERTIFIED TEST RESULTS ON QUALIFIED PRODUCTS LIST EL1262 SHOWING THE BREAKING 
STRENGTH OF THE ROPE SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH THE ROPE WHEN IT IS DELIVERED. 2,000 FT
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N EN1-902 X 3FT

MFG P/N EN1-902 X 6FT

MFG P/N EN1-902 X 9FT

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 12FT
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 12FT
HERCULES  / EN1-902 X12FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 12FT

10 9607

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP,(CONTINUOUS LOOP), 3 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW: MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 
B30.9, AND LENGTH. ON QPL EL-1604 EA 4-5 days

HERCULES

29

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 3FT
HERCULES / EN1-902 X 3FT
LIFT-ALL / EN1-802D X 3FT

$1,855.64 

HERCULES

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 6FT
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 6FT
HERCULES  / EN1-902 X 6FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 6FT

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINUOUS LOOP), 9 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB,TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS., EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, 
ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH.
ON QPL EL-1604 46 EA 4-5 days $54.64 $2,513.44 

HERCULES

$26.03 $754.87 

11 9608

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINOUS LOOP), 6 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, 
ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH.
ON QPL EL-1604

46 EA

12 9609

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING / EN1-902 X 9FT
D&AWIRE ROPE / EN1-902 X 9FT
HERCULES  / EN1-902 X 9FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 9FT

4-5 days $40.34 

13 9610

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINUOUS LOOP), 12 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY, POLYESTER OR NYLON 
WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 LBS., 
CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND A BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMAINTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW: MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, ANSI 
B30.9, AND LENGTH. ON QPL EL-1604

43 EA 4-5 days $68.94 $2,964.42 
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ITEM 
NO.

AE 
STOCK 

NO.
EST. 
QTY. U/M

LEAD 
TIME
(days)

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

MFG P/N EN1-902 X12FT

MFG P/N EN1-902 X 20FT

MFG P/N AD-625-48

MFG P/N AMSTEEL-BLUE 872 (2200-05180)

ITEM 
NO.

STOCK 
NO.

17 None

VENDOR DELIVERY

16 24346

ROPEMADE WITH DYNEEMA FIBER WITH A SAMTHANE COATING, LIGHTWEIGHT, 12STRAND CLASS 
II. NAME OF ROPE IS “AMSTEEL-BLUE”,  SPECIFICGRAVITY 0.98,  5/16INCH IN DIAMETER, WITH A 6 
INCH EYE AT EACH END. ROPE SHALL COME ON1000 FOOT REELS. 

6 REEL
7-10 
days

$1,359.00 $8,154.00 

SAMSON ROPE

APPROVED MFG / Part No. SAMSON ROPE / AMSTEEL-BLUE 872 (2200-05180)

$3,533.64 

HERCULES

APPROVED MFG / Part No.

AMERICAN SLING /  EN1-902 X 20FT
D&AWIRE ROPE /  EN1-902 X 20FT
HERCULES /  EN1-902 X 20FT
LIFT-ALL /  EN1-802D X 20FT

15 9615

SLING, ADJUSTABLE ROPE, 5/8", HIGH TENACITY POLYESTER WITH ORANGE OR RED URETHANE 
COATING. VERTICAL RATING 3,203 LBS., CHOKER RATINGS 2,562 LBS., BASKET RATING 6,406 LBS. 
ON QPL EL-1209

40 EA
7-10 
days

$57.52 $2,300.80 

SW OCEAN SRV

APPROVED MFG / Part No.
D&AWIRE ROPE / AD-625-48
SW OCEAN SRV / AD-625-48
YALE CORD / 9334OUMJ32X048

14 9612

SLING, ENDLESS LOOP, (CONTINOUS LOOP), 20 FEET LONG, SINGLE PLY,2" WIDTH, POLYESTER 
OR NYLON WEB, TYPE 5, ANSI B30.9, DESIGNED FOR CAPACITY RATINGS OF VERTICLE LIFT 6400 
LBS., CHOKER LIFT 5000 LBS. AND BASKET LIFT 12800 LBS.,EACH SLING SHALL BE PERMANENTLY 
MARKED TO SHOW:  MANUFACTURERS NAME, MANUFACTURERS PART NUMBER, CAPACTIES, 
ANSI B30.9, AND LENGTH.

33 EA 4-5 days $107.08 

The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above.

$46,303.18 

DELIVERY METHOD: 

COMPANY NAME:

DELIVERY TERMS:  DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

 COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS)

The City may purchase additional related items that are available from the Contractor in various quantities.  
Pricing for these non-specified items will be calculated based on a percentage markup over Contractors cost as 
identified in the Price Sheet under the Non-Specified Parts Section. Reference Solicitation Instructions Section 
4.8 (Pricing Requirements - Non-Specified Items).

2%

% MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE

The Colonna Group LLC

TOTAL BID

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

HERCULES
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